
  BID SUMMARY               

  Kiwanis Skate Park              
               
                

ITEM Bid Security             
NO. ITEM QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT 

                    

  PREFERENCE 1:  BASE BID + Alt. 1                 

1 SPCC PLAN 1 LS 2,500.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 NO BID NO BID 
2 MOBILIZATION 1 LS 10,000.00 10,000.00 16,218.00 16,218.00 NO BID NO BID 
3 REPAIR OR REPLACEMENT 1 FA 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 NO BID NO BID 
4 EASTSIDE SKATEPARK, BASE BID 1 LS 227,500.00 227,500.00 260,416.00 260,416.00 NO BID NO BID 
5 EASTSIDE SKATEPARK, ALTERNATE A1 1 LS 74,000.00 74,000.00 81,251.00 81,251.00 NO BID NO BID 
  SUBTOTAL:       339,000.00   385,385.00     
  SALES TAX (8.2%):       27,798.00   31,601.57     
  BASE BID + Alt. 1 - TOTAL:       $366,798.00   $416,986.57 NO BID NO BID 
                    

                    

  PREFERENCE 2:  BASE BID ONLY                 
1 SPCC PLAN 1 LS 2,500.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 0.00 0.00 
2 MOBILIZATION 1 LS 10,000.00 10,000.00 12,389.00 12,389.00 0.00 0.00 
3 REPAIR OR REPLACEMENT 1 FA 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 
4 EASTSIDE SKATEPARK, BASE BID 1 LS 227,500.00 227,500.00 260,416.00 260,416.00 347,611.71 347,611.71 
  SUBTOTAL:       265,000.00   300,305.00   372,611.71 
  SALES TAX (8.2%):       21,730.00   24,625.01   30,554.16 
  BASE BID ONLY - TOTAL:       $286,730.00   $324,930.01   $403,165.87 
                    
                    
                    

                    
                    
          
          

 

COMPETITIVE BIDS WERE OPENED ON MAY 15, 2008.  
ALL BIDS HAVE BEEN REVIEWED BY THIS OFFICE. 
I RECOMMEND THE BASE BID ONLY CONTRACT  
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