BID SUMMARY
McAllister Field Business Park
Phase 2 Improvements
CITY PROJECT NO. 2249

VALLEY EXCAVATING
P.0. BOX 785
ELLENSBURG, WA
98926

BOND

KEN LEINGANG
EXCAVATING INC.
1117 N 27TH AVE
YAKIMA, WA 98902

GRANITE N.W., INC
dba SUPERIOR ASPHALT
P.O. BOX 50085
WATSON VILLE, CA 95077

COLUMBIA ASPHALT
& GRAVEL
P.0. BOX 9337
YAKIMA, WA 98909

ENGINEERS
ESTIMATE

DURAND’S INC
5260 HWY 24
MOXEE, WA 98936

BOND BOND BOND BOND

Bid Security

ITEM

UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

SPCC PLAN

$500.00 $500.00

$500.00 $500.00

$1,500.00 $1,500.00

$500.00

$500.00

$450.00

$450.00

$250.00

$250.00

MOBILIZATION

$40,607.20|  $40,607.20

$9,500.00 $9,500.00

$16,750.00 $16,750.00

$32,000.00

$32,000.00

$32,400.00

$32,400.00

$17,000.00

$17,000.00

PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL (Min. Bid $1,000)

$1,000.00 $1,000.00,

$1,000.00 $1,000.00

$1,350.00 $1,350.00

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

$8,000.00

$8,000.00,

$2,000.00,

$2,000.00

CLEARING AND GRUBBING

$3,000.00 $3,000.00,

$4,250.00 $4,250.00

$1,250.00 $1,250.00

$2,500.00

$2,500.00

$2,500.00

$2,500.00

$1,000.00,

$1,000.00

REMOVAL OF STRUCTURE AND OBSTRUCTION

$2,500.00 $2,500.00]

$1,200.00 $1,200.00

$550.00 $550.00

$4000.00

$4,000.00

$1,500.00

$1,500.00]

$1,000.00

$1,000.00

SAW CUT, Per Inch Depth

$2.50 $250.00

$2.00 $200.00

$0.52 $52.00

$3.50

$350.00

$0.75

$75.00

$2.00

$200.00

ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL

$10.00]  $12,500.00

$5.00 $6,250.00

$9.60 $12,000.00

$10.00

$12,500.00

$6.70

$8,375.00

$15.20

$19,000.00

CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE

$15.00]  $15,750.00

$16.50[ $17,325.00

$18.00 $18,900.00

$20.00

$21,000.00

$17.00

$17,850.00

$19.00

$19,950.00

ASPHALT TREATED BASE

$100.00{  $70,000.00

$75.00]  $52,500.00

$65.00 $45,500.00

$72.00

$50,400.00

$65.00

$45,500.00

$69.00

$48,300.00

HMA CL. 1/2 IN. PG 64-28

$115.00{  $40,250.00

$107.42| $37,597.00

$89.00 $31,150.00

$105.00

$36,750.00

$89.00

$31,150.00

$99.00

$34,650.00

PAVEMENT REPAIR

$200.00|  $10,000.00

$33.10 $1,655.00

$50.30 $2,515.00

$35.00

$1,750.00

$45.00

$2,250.00,

$45.00

$2,250.00

CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENESTORM SEWER PIPE 12 IN.

$40.00 $8,400.00]

$16.50 $3,465.00

$21.25 $4,462.50

$36.00

$7,560.00

$35.00

$7,350.00

$30.00,

$6,300.00

CATCH BASIN TYPE 1

$2,000.00]  $12,000.00

$765.00 $4,590.00

$800.00 $4,800.00

$850.00

$5,100.00

$760.00

$4,560.00

$1,000.00,

$6,000.00

CRUSHED SURFACING TOP COURSE (For Trench Backfill)

$15.00 $1,500.00,

$14.00 $1,400.00

$13.00 $1,300.00

$15.00

$1,500.00

$17.00

$1,700.00,

$15.00,

$1,500.00

ESC LEAD

$150.00 $1,500.00,

$100.00 $1,000.00

$125.00 $1,250.00

$10.00

$100.00

$75.00

$750.00

$1.00

$10.00

GRASSY SWALE

$2,000.00 $6,000.00,

$1,850.00 $5,550.00

$1,500.00 $4,500.00

$3,750.00

$11,250.00

$5,215.00

$15,645.00

$3,000.00

$9,000.00

CEMENT CONC. TRAFFIC CURB AND GUTTER

$30.00| $44,340.00

$8.61 $12,725.58

$10.00 $14,780.00

$9.00

$13,302.00

$12.00

$17,736.00

$8.50

$12,563.00

COMMERCIAL DRIVEWAY APPROACH

$4,000.00|  $24,000.00

$4,620.00]  $27,720.00

$4,700.00 $28,200.00

$5,500.00

$33,000.00

$6,000.00

$36,000.00

$4,600.00

$27,600.00

MOUMENT CASE AND COVER

$500.00 $1,000.00,

$1,000.00 $2,000.00

$175.00 $350.00

$400.00

$800.00

$400.00

$800.00

$250.00

$500.00

CEMENT CONC. SIDEWALK, 4 IN. THICK

$50.00{  $54,900.00

$26.40| $28,987.20

$32.50 $35,685.00

$35.00

$38,430.00

$31.00

$34,038.00

$33.00

$36,234.00

CEMENT CONC. SIDEWALK RAMP, TYPE 2

$1,000.00 $4,000.00,

$660.00 $2,640.00

$700.00 $2,800.00

$850.00

$3,400.00

$1,400.00

$5,600.00,

$700.00

$2,800.00

SIGNPOST SOCKET

$350.00 $1,400.00]

$125.00 $500.00

$50.00 $200.00

$50.00

$200.00

$90.00

$360.00

$50.00]

$200.00

ILLUMINATION SYSTEM

$10,000.00f  $10,000.00

$19,425.00]  $19,425.00

$18,482.00 $18,482.00

$19,950.00

$19,950.00

$19,100.00

$19,100.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

REPAIR OR REPLACEMENT

$20,000.00{  $20,000.00

$20,000.00f  $20,000.00

$20,000.00 $20,000.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

SCHEDULE ‘A’ TOTAL

$385,397.20

$261,979.78

$268,326.50

$321,342.00

$313,689.00

$288,307.00

SCHEDULE ‘B’ (Utilities)

MANHOLE 48 IN. DIAM. TYPE 1

$3,000.00 $3,000.00§

$1,575.00 $1,575.00

$1,800.00 $1,800.00

$1,890.00

$1,890.00

$2,300.00

$2,300.00,

$2,615.00

$2,615.00

DUCTILE IRON PIPE FOR WATER MAIN 8 IN. DIAM.

$70.00]  $56,000.00]

$37.50]  $30,000.00

$45.60 $36,480.00

$20.25

$16,200.00

$27.00

$21,600.00

$65.80,

$52,640.00

GATE VALVE 8 IN.

$2,000.00]  $12,000.00}

$1,060.00 $6,360.00

$1,010.00 $6,060.00

$990.50

$5,943.00

$1,200.00

$7,200.00

$1,000.00,

$6,000.00

HYDRANT ASSEMBLY

$4,000.00]  $8,000.00]

$3,350.00 $6,700.00

$4,000.00 $8,000.00

$3,475.00

$6,950.00

$3,700.00

$7,400.00

$3,000.00,

$6,000.00

SERVICE CONNECTION 8 IN. DIAM. NO BID THIS ITEM

NO BID No BID|

PVC SANITARY SEWER PIPE 8 IN. DIAM.

$40.00]  $12,200.00]

$30.00 $9,150.00

$19.20 $5,856.00

$30.50

$9,302.50

$31.00

$9,455.00

$30.00]

$9,150.00

PVC SANITARY SEWER PIPE 6 IN. DIAM.

$40.00]  $5,600.00]

$25.00 $3,500.00

$30.30 $4,242.00

$27.70

$3,878.00

$30.00

$4,200.00

$24.00,

$3,360.00

SCHEDULE ‘B’ SUB-TOTAL.:

$96,800.00]

$57,285.00

$62,438.00

$44,163.50

$52,155.00

$79,765.00

8.2% WASHINGTON STATE SALES TAX (Schedule ‘B’ Only):

$7,937.60]

$4,697.37

$5,119.92

$3,621.41

$4,276.71

$6,540.73

SCHEDULE ‘B’ TOTAL.:

$104,737.60]

$61,982.37

$67,557.92

$47,784.91

$56,431.71

$86,305.73

TOTAL ALL SCHEDULES (‘A’+'B’)

CITY ENGINEERS REPORT

COMPETATIVE BIDS WERE OPENED ON
OCTOBER 20, 2008
ALL BIDS HAVE BEEN REVIEWED BY THIS OFFICE
| RECOMMEND THE CONTRACT BE AWARDED TO:

VALLEY EXCAVATING

CITY ENGINEER

$323,962.15

$335,884.42

AWARD MADE BY CITY MANAGER

$369,126.91

$370,120.71

CITY OF YAKIMA

McAllister Field Business Park

$374,612.73

CITY MANAGER

Phase 2 Improvements

PROJECT

NO.

DATE: OCT. 22, 2008

FILE: Project Bid Sum

2249
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BID SUMMARY KRCI LLC

HURST CONSTRUTION
LLC
P.0. BOX 7277

E. WENATCHEE, WA 98802
BOND

TTC CONSTRUCTION

P.O. BOX 365
YAKIMA, WA 98907

BOND

BELSAAS & SMITH

CONSTRUCTION INC
P.0. BOX 926
ELLENSBURG, WA 98926

BOND

GRADE INC

ROTSCHY INC. P.O. BOX 231

P.0. BOX 290
YACOLT, WA 98675

P.O. BOX 5120
WENATCHEE, WA 98807

BOND

WOODINVILLE, WA 98072

BOND

CITY PROJECT NO.
Bid Security

BOND

ITEM

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

SPCC PLAN

$500.00

$500.00]

$300.00

$300.00]

$500.00

$500.00

$450.00

$450.00

$240.00

$240.00

$1,500.00

$1,500.00}

MOBILIZATION

$43,900.00

$43,900.00]

$24,000.00

$24,000.00]

$31,000.00

$31,000.00

$26,056.96

$26,056.96

$30,200.00

$30,200.00

$35,000.00

$35,000.00]

PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL (Min. Bid $1,000)

$1,000.00

$1,000.00]

$1,000.00

$1,000.00]

$1,000.00

$1,000.00

$6,480.18

$6,480.18

$1,950.00

$1,950.00

$6,000.00

$6,000.00]

CLEARING AND GRUBBING

$3,300.00

$3,300.00]

$5,000.00

$5,000.00]

$500.00

$500.00

$15,737.07

$15,737.07

$5,900.00

$5,900.00

$13,500.00

$13,500.00]

REMOVAL OF STRUCTURE AND OBSTRUCTION

$1,100.00

$1,100.00]

$5,000.00

$5,000.00]

$1,000.00

$1,000.00

$10,709.82

$10,709.82

$990.00

$990.00

$1,500.00

$1,500.00]

SAW CUT, Per Inch Depth

$3.75

$375.00§

$0.75

$75.00]

$1.50

$150.00

$7.88

$788.00

$2.00

$200.00

$5.00

$500.00§

ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL

$7.50

$9,375.00§

$5.00

$6,250.00]

$12.00

$15,000.00

$13.78

$17,225.00

$12.00

$15,000.00

$22.00

$27,500.00]

CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE

$24.00

$25,200.00§

$25.00

$26,250.00]

$19.00

$19,950.00

$25.51

$26,785.50

$20.00

$21,000.00

$25.30,

$26,565.00]

ASPHALT TREATED BASE

$75.00

$52,500.00§

$70.00

$49,000.00]

$76.30

$53,410.00

$71.87

$50,309.00

$75.00

$52,500.00

$84.00

$58,800.00§

HMA CL. 1/2 IN. PG 64-28

$105.00

$36,750.00§

$110.00

$38,500.00]

$110.00

$38,500.00

$102.30

$35,805.00

$107.00

$37,450.00

$115.00

$40,250.00§

PAVEMENT REPAIR

$40.00

$2,000.00]

$82.00

$4,100.00]

$33.00

$1,650.00

$57.89

$2,894.50

$50.00

$2,500.00

$40.00

$2,000.00]

CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENESTORM SEWER PIPE 12 IN.

$30.00

$6,300.00]

$29.00

$6,090.00]

$20.00

$4,200.00

$34.06

$7,152.60

$26.00

$5,460.00

$26.50,

$5,565.00]

CATCH BASIN TYPE 1

$885.00

$5,310.00]

$900.00

$5,400.00]

$1,100.00

$6,600.00

$703.29

$4,219.74

$1,190.00

$7,140.00

$1,000.00

$6,000.00]

CRUSHED SURFACING TOP COURSE (For Trench Backfill)

$14.00

$1,400.00]

$17.00

$1,700.00]

$13.00

$1,300.00

$13.53

$1,353.00

$28.00

$2,800.00

$25.50

$2,550.00§

ESC LEAD

$200.00

$2,000.00]

$25.00

$250.00}

$10.00

$100.00

$150.00

$1,500.00

$150.00

$1,500.00

$150.00

$1,500.00]

GRASSY SWALE

$3,100.00

$9,300.00]

$2,900.00

$8,700.00]

$3,500.00

$10,500.00

$3,875.31

$11,625.93

$4,298.00

$12,894.00

$3,500.00

$10,500.00§

CEMENT CONC. TRAFFIC CURB AND GUTTER

$10.00

$14,780.00§

$11.00

$16,258.00]

$9.00

$13,302.00

$8.20

$12,119.60

$10.00

$14,780.00

$19.95

$29,486.10|

COMMERCIAL DRIVEWAY APPROACH

$4,400.00

$26,400.00]

$5,000.00

$30,000.00]

$5,000.00

$30,000.00

$6,002.31

$36,013.86

$6,000.00

$36,000.00

$6,675.00

$40,050.00]

MOUMENT CASE AND COVER

$295.00

$590.00]

$400.00

$800.00]

$200.00

$400.00

$439.80

$879.60

$450.00

$900.00

$950.00

$1,900.00}

CEMENT CONC. SIDEWALK, 4 IN. THICK

$35.00

$38,430.00]

$34.00

$37,332.00}

$44.00

$48,312.00

$30.24

$33,203.52

$29.00

$31,842.00

$38.50,

$42,273.00}

CEMENT CONC. SIDEWALK RAMP, TYPE 2

$745.00

$2,980.00]

$700.00

$2,800.00]

$950.00

$3,800.00

$850.00

$3,400.00

$750.00

$3,000.00

$1,150.00

$4,600.00]

SIGNPOST SOCKET

$65.00

$260.00]

$80.00

$320.00]

$75.00

$300.00

$162.00

$648.00

$150.00

$600.00

$150.00]

$600.00]

ILLUMINATION SYSTEM

$19,000.00

$19,000.00]

$19,000.00

$19,000.00]

$20,500.00

$20,500.00

$28,662.00

$28,662.00

$19,800.00

$19,800.00

$21,000.00

$21,000.00]

REPAIR OR REPLACEMENT

$20,000.00

$20,000.00]

$20,000.00

$20,000.00]

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00]

SCHEDULE ‘A’ TOTAL

$322,750.00]

$308,125.00]

$321,974.00

$354,018.88

$324,646.00

$399,139.10]

SCHEDULE ‘B’ (Utilities)

MANHOLE 48 IN. DIAM. TYPE 1

$1,780.00

$1,780.00]

$1,300.00

$1,300.00]

$2,200.00

$2,200.00

$1,888.75

$1,888.75

$2,850.00

$2,850.00

$4,000.00

$4,000.00)

DUCTILE IRON PIPE FOR WATER MAIN 8 IN. DIAM.

$30.00

$24,000.00]

$46.00

$36,800.00]

$44.00

$35,200.00

$20.22

$16,176.00

$48.00

$38,400.00

$53.00

$42,400.00]

GATE VALVE 8 IN.  NO BID -BID ITEM DELETED

$1,140.00

$6,840.00]

$1,300.00

$7,800.00§

$1,100.00

$6,600.00

$990.44

$5,942.64

$1,660.00

$9,960.00

$1,300.00

$7,800.00}

HYDRANT ASSEMBLY

$3,800.00

$7,600.00]

$4,600.00

$9,200.00]

$3,500.00

$7,000.00

$3,471.54

$6,943.08

$4,570.00

$9,140.00

$3,900.00

$7,800.00]

SERVICE CONNECTION 8 IN. DIAM. NO BID THIS ITEM

PVC SANITARY SEWER PIPE 8 IN. DIAM.

$27.00

$8,235.00|

$30.00

$9,150.00]

$27.00

$8,235.00

$30.42

$9,278.10

$37.00

$11,285.00

$24.50

$7,472.50

PVC SANITARY SEWER PIPE 6 IN. DIAM.

$21.00

$2,940.00]

$30.00

$4,200.00}

$20.00

$2,800.00

$27.66

$3,872.40

$25.00

$3,500.00

$24.00

$3,360.00]

SCHEDULE ‘B’ SUB-TOTAL.:

$51,395.00]

$68,450.00]

$62,035.00

$44,100.97

$75,135.00

$72,832.50

8.2% WASHINGTON STATE SALES TAX (Schedule ‘B’ Only):

$4,214.39]

$5,612.90]

$5,086.87

$3,616.28

$6,161.07

$5,972.27|

SCHEDULE ‘B’ TOTAL:

$55,609.39]

$74,062.90]

$67,121.87

$47,717.25

$81,296.07,

$78,804.77

TOTAL ALL SCHEDULES (‘A’+'B’)

$378,359.3

$382,187.90|

$389,095.87

$401,736.13

$405,942.07

$477,943.87

CITY ENGINEERS REPORT

COMPETITIVE BIDS WERE OPENED ON .
OCTOBER 20, 2008
ALL BIDS HAVE BEEN REVIEWED BY THIS OFFICE.
| RECOMMEND THE CONTRACT BE AWARDED TO:

VALLEY EXCAVATING

CITY ENGINEER

AWARD MADE BY CITY MANAGER

CITY OF YAKIMA

McAllister Field Business Park

CITY MANAGER

Phase 2 Improvements
PROJECT NO. 2249

DATE: OCT. 22, 2008
FILE: Project Bid Sum Tab.pub
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BID SUMMARY

CITY PROJECT NO.

JNJ CONSTRUCTION
CO.INC
511 MIDVAL ROAD
SUNNYSIDE, WA 98944

Bid Security

BOND

ITEM

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

SPCC PLAN

$3,000.00

$3000.00]

MOBILIZATION

$37,500.00

$37,500.00]

PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL (Min. Bid $1,000)

$2,000.00

$2,000.00]

CLEARING AND GRUBBING

$4,400.00

$4,400.00]

REMOVAL OF STRUCTURE AND OBSTRUCTION

$1,250.00

$1,250.00]

SAW CUT, Per Inch Depth

$3.00

$300.00§

ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL

$14.92

$18,650.00]

CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE

$23.05

$24,202.50§

ASPHALT TREATED BASE

$89.82

$62,874.00§

HMA CL. 1/2 IN. PG 64-28

$129.25

$45,237.50f

PAVEMENT REPAIR

$63.60

$3,180.00]

CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENESTORM SEWER PIPE 12 IN.

$38.46

$8,076.60]

CATCH BASIN TYPE 1

$1,020.00

$6,120.00]

CRUSHED SURFACING TOP COURSE (For Trench Backfill)

$17.80

$1,780.00]

ESC LEAD

$1,000.00

$10,000.00§

GRASSY SWALE

$2,540.00

$7,620.00]

CEMENT CONC. TRAFFIC CURB AND GUTTER

$10.57

$15,622.46

COMMERCIAL DRIVEWAY APPROACH

$6,276.67

$37,660.02

MOUMENT CASE AND COVER

$480.00

$960.00

CEMENT CONC. SIDEWALK, 4 IN. THICK

$38.82

$42,624.36

CEMENT CONC. SIDEWALK RAMP, TYPE 2

$1,077.50

$4,310.00]

SIGNPOST SOCKET

$360.00

$1,440.00]

ILLUMINATION SYSTEM

$23,102.50

$23,102.50]

REPAIR OR REPLACEMENT

$20,000.00

$20,000.00]

SCHEDULE ‘A’ TOTAL

$381,909.94]

SCHEDULE ‘B’ (Utilities)

MANHOLE 48 IN. DIAM. TYPE 1

$2,465.00

$2,465.00|

DUCTILE IRON PIPE FOR WATER MAIN 8 IN. DIAM.

$75.00

$60,000.00]

GATE VALVE 8IN.  NO BID -BID ITEM DELETED

$1,282.88

$7,697.28]

HYDRANT ASSEMBLY

$5,084.53

$10,169.06

SERVICE CONNECTION 8 IN. DIAM. NO BID THIS ITEM

PVC SANITARY SEWER PIPE 8 IN. DIAM.

$35.10

$10,705.50}

PVC SANITARY SEWER PIPE 6 IN. DIAM.

$24.75

$3,465.00]

SCHEDULE ‘B’ SUB-TOTAL.:

$94,501.84]

8.2% WASHINGTON STATE SALES TAX (Schedule ‘B’ Only):

$7,749.15

SCHEDULE ‘B’ TOTAL:

$102,250.99

TOTAL ALL SCHEDULES (‘A’+'B’)

$484,160.93

CITY ENGINEERS REPORT

COMPETITIVE BIDS WERE OPENED ON .
OCTOBER 20, 2008
ALL BIDS HAVE BEEN REVIEWED BY THIS OFFICE.
| RECOMMEND THE CONTRACT BE AWARDED TO:

VALLEY EXCAVATING

CITY ENGINEER

AWARD MADE BY CITY MANAGER

CITY OF YAKIMA

McAllister Field Business Park

CITY MANAGER

Phase 2 Improvements
PROJECT NO. 2249

DATE: OCT. 22, 2008
FILE: Project Bid Sum Tab.pub
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