BID SUMMARY  City of Yakima  Naches Avenue Parkway Fencing Project - REBID  City Project No. 2764				ENGINEERS ESTIMATE		Cortez Fencing, LLC Moses Lake, WA		Fencing & Awning Moxee, WA		L & S Fencing Yakima, WA			
ITEM	BID SECURITY									LINUT PRIOR	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT			UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AWOUNT
	BID ALTERNATE A - NOT AWARDED	-											
1	PARKWAY FENCING COMPLETE	1	LS	\$230,000.00	\$230,000.00	\$249,999.99	\$249,999.99	\$233,500.00	\$233,500.00	\$310,732.60	\$310,732.60		
2	PARKWAY FENCING COMPLETE PARKWAY LANDSCAPING ROCK	2,900	SF	\$10.00	\$29,000.00	\$10.00	\$29,000.00	\$8.50	\$24,650.00	NO BID	NO BID		
	MINOR CHANGE	1	FA	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000:00	\$1,000.00		
	SUBTOTAL			, , , , , , , , ,	\$260,000.00		\$279,999.99		\$259,150.00		\$311,732.60		
	8.3% WA. SALES TAX				\$21,580.00		\$23,240.00		\$21,509.45		\$25,873.81		
	TOTAL				\$281,580.00		\$303,239.99		\$280,659.45		\$337,606.41		
										111			
	BID ALTERNATE B - AWARDED									0			
1	PARKWAY FENCING COMPLETE	1	LS	\$155,000.00	\$155,000.00	\$149,999.99	\$149,999.99	\$173,000.00	\$173,000.00	\$218,837.58	\$218,837.58		
2	PARKWAY LANDSCAPING ROCK	2,900	SF	\$10.00	\$29,000.00	\$10.00	\$29,000.00	\$8.50	\$24,650.00	NO BID	NO BID		
3	MINOR CHANGE	1	FA	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00		
	SUBTOTAL				\$185,000.00		\$179,999.99		\$198,650.00		\$219,837.58		
	8.3% WA. SALES TAX				\$15,355.00		\$14,940.00		\$16,487.95		\$18,246.52		
	TOTAL				\$200,355.00		\$194,939.99		\$215,137.95		\$238,084.10		
											П		
											-		

## **CITY ENGINEERS REPORT**

COMPETITIVE BIDS WERE OPENED ON 3/22/2023 ALL BIDS HAVE BEEN REVIEWED BY THIS OFFICE. I RECOMMEND BID ALTERNATE B OF THE CONTRACT BE AWARDED TO:

**AWARD MADE BY CITY MANAGER** 

**Cortez Fencing, LLC** 

CITY ENGINEER

**CITY OF YAKIMA** 

**NACHES AVENUE PARKWAY** 

**FENCING PROJECT** 

City of Yakima Project No. 2764

DATE: 3/23/2023

FILE: Naches Ave Parkway Fencing Rebid BID SUMMARY.xlsx

SHEET 1 OF 1