
Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price 

S/S = Short Sleeved Assorted Sizes (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax)

L/S = Long Sleeved Enter unit prices below.
Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.

EDWARDS BRAND               

(no exception)

28-42 $37.47 $262.29 $39.00 $273.00 $42.45 $297.15

1 44-48 $44.77 $46.95 $50.44

50-54 $48.42 $50.80 $54.45

Men’s, Blue, Oxford Shirt, S/S. S-XL $19.34 $135.38 $21.40 $149.80 $26.31 $184.17

EDWARDS #1027-01. 2XL-4XL $23.48 2XL $24.35 $30.86

3X-4X $25.85

5XL $26.23 $28.80 $33.89

Men’s, Black, Oxford Shirt, S/S. S-XL $21.30 $149.10 $23.65 $165.55 $28.46 $199.22

EDWARDS #1027-10. 2XL-4XL $26.01 2XL $27.05 $33.63

3X-4X $28.80

5XL $29.17 $32.23 $37.08

S-XL $21.30 $21.30 $21.40 $21.40 $28.46 $28.46

2XL-4XL $25.98 2XL $24.35 $33.63

3X-4X $25.85

5XL $29.17 $28.80 $37.08

Men’s, Blue, Oxford Shirt, L/S. S-XL $19.98 $119.88 $22.35 $134.10 $27.08 $162.48

EDWARDS #1077-01. 2XL-4XL $24.38 2XL $25.55 $31.83

3X-4X $27.15

5XL $27.27 $30.34 $35.01

US LINEN & UNIFORM

BID 11626 UNIFORMS FOR TRANSIT

VENDOR: FITZGERALD UNIFORMS NORTHWEST

5 6

SCHEDULE 1 – MEN’S UNIFORMS

Item No. Sizes

Men’s Black, Poly/Wool Plain 

Front Slacks.  EDWARDS #2720-

10.

7

2 7

3 7

4
Men’s, Lt Grey, Oxford Shirt, 

S/S. EDWARDS #1027-06.
1



Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price 

S/S = Short Sleeved Assorted Sizes (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax)

L/S = Long Sleeved Enter unit prices below.
Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.

Item No. Sizes

S-XL $22.23 $133.38 $24.60 $147.60 $29.49 $176.94

2XL-4XL $27.25 2XL $28.26 $34.98

3X-4X $30.05

5XL $30.58 $33.70 $38.64

S-XL $22.23 $22.23 $22.35 $22.35 $29.49 $29.49

2XL-4XL $27.25 2XL $25.55 $34.98

3X-4X $27.15

5XL $30.58 $30.34 $38.64

28-42 $22.35 $402.30 $23.10 $415.80 $25.89 $466.02

44-48 $26.62 $27.70 $30.57

50-54 $28.75 $30.00 $32.92

28-42 $22.35 $22.35 $23.10 $23.10 $25.89 $25.89

44-48 $26.62 $27.70 $34.98

50-54 $28.75 $30.00 $38.64

Men’s, Pleated Black Slacks 

with/Stretch Waistband. 
28-42 $25.45 $101.80 $25.90 $103.60 $28.65 $114.60

EDWARDS #2678-010. 44-48 $29.65 $31.05 $33.88

50-54 $32.04 $33.65 $36.51

Men’s Pleated Khaki Slacks 

with/Stretch Waistband. 
28-42 $25.45 $76.35 $25.90 $77.70 $28.65 $85.95

EDWARDS #2678-015. 44-48 $29.65 $31.05 $33.88

50-54 $32.04 $33.65 $36.51

Men’s Plain Front Black Slacks 

with/Stretch Waistband. 
28-42 $25.45 $458.10 $25.90 $466.20 $28.65 $515.70

EDWARDS #2578-010. 44-48 $29.65 $31.05 $33.88

50-54 $32.04 $33.65 $36.51

Men’s Plain Front Khaki Slacks 

with/Stretch Waistband.   
28-42 $25.45 $254.50 $25.90 $259.00 $28.65 $286.50

EDWARDS #2578-015. 44-48 $29.65 $31.05 $33.88

50-54 $32.04 $33.65 $36.51

12 18

13 10

10 4

11 3

8
Men’s Pleated Khaki Shorts. 

EDWARDS #2410-15.
18

9
Men’s Pleated Black Shorts. 

EDWARDS #2410-10.
1

6
Men’s, Black, Oxford Shirt, L/S. 

EDWARDS #1077-10.
6

7
Men’s, Lt Grey, Oxford Shirt, 

L/S. EDWARDS #1077-06. 
1



Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price 

S/S = Short Sleeved Assorted Sizes (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax)

L/S = Long Sleeved Enter unit prices below.
Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.

Item No. Sizes

28-42 $23.61 $70.83 $23.80 $71.40 $27.27 $81.81

44-48 $28.13 $29.40 $32.23

50-54 $30.40 $31.85 $34.71

28-42 $23.61 $306.93 $24.50 $318.50 $27.27 $354.51

44-48 $28.13 $29.40 $32.23

50-54 $30.40 $31.85 $34.71

30-44 $17.31 $311.58 $17.50 $315.00 $19.87 $357.66

46-48 $20.57 $21.00 $23.45

50-56 $22.21 $22.75 $25.24

MISCELLANEOUS BRANDS

Men’s Burgundy Oxford Shirt, 

S/S.  
S-XL $19.68 $19.68 $21.85 $21.85 $26.94 $26.94

17 PORT AUTHORITY #S508 1 2XL $20.96 $23.30 $28.44

3XL $23.53 $26.10 $31.44

4XL $24.82 $27.50 $32.94

Polo Shirt, Hunter Green, with 

pocket, (tall sizes available), S/S.
S-XL $25.13 $653.38 $26.50 $689.00 $27.56 $716.56

RED CAP # SK-28 HG. 26 2XL-3XL $29.44 $31.15 $30.83

Polo Shirt, Royal Blue, with 

pocket, (tall sizes available), S/S.
S-XL $26.82 $616.86 $26.50 $609.50 $29.21 $671.83

RED CAP # SK-28 RB. 23 2XL-3XL $31.49 $31.15 $32.81

Men’s Black, Pullover Sweater 

Vest, S/S.  
S-XL $21.45 $21.45 $27.50 $27.50 $33.71 $33.71

SAN FRANCISCO KNITTING 

MILLS #SFKM 6600.
2XL-3XL $25.35 $31.70 $43.71

18

19

20 1

15
Men’s Plain Front Khaki Slacks. 

EDWARDS #2510-15.
13

16
Black, Leather Dress Belt. 

EDWARDS # BP00.  
18

14
Men’s, Pleated Khaki Slacks. 

EDWARDS #2610-15. 
3



Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price 

S/S = Short Sleeved Assorted Sizes (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax)

L/S = Long Sleeved Enter unit prices below.
Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.

Item No. Sizes

Men’s Black Cardigan Sweater. S-XL $24.98 $24.98 $33.80 $33.80 $41.46 $41.46

SAN FRANCISCO KNITTING 

MILLS #SFKM 6745.
2XL-3XL $28.92 $38.28 $46.26

Black, Knit Cap, 100% acrylic. $7.47 $52.29 $8.55 $59.85 $14.94 $236.01

WATCHCAP.

Black Lined Lightweight Jacket. XS-XL $40.25 $120.75 $44.30 $132.90 $51.69 $155.07

PORT AUTHORITY # J7301 41-

50.
2XL $41.53 $45.70 $53.19

3XL $44.10 $48.50 $56.19

4XL $45.39 $49.90 $57.69

Black, Canvas Style Winter Coat 

, Carhartt style.
S-XL $50.98 $254.90 $58.30 $291.50 $64.71 $323.55

TRI-MOUNTAIN #4800. 2XL $53.60 $61.30 $67.71

3XL $56.19 $34.30 $70.71

Black, Winter Jacket, (tall sizes 

available).
S-XL $38.96 $233.76 $42.90 $257.40 $50.19 $301.14

CHALLENGER # J754. 2XL $40.25 $44.30 $51.69

3XL $42.82 $47.10 $54.69

4XL $44.10 $48.50 $56.19

EDWARDS BRAND (no 

exception)

Women’s, Black, Poly/Wool 

Pleated Slacks.
0-18 $37.47 $187.35 $39.10 $195.50 $42.45 $212.25

EDWARDS #8629-19.  18w-20w $37.47 $39.10 $42.45

22w-24w $44.77 $46.95 $50.45

26w-28w $48.42 $50.85 $54.46

24 5

25 6

SCHEDULE 2 –  WOMEN’S UNIFORMS

26 5

21 1

22 7 One Size

23 3



Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price 

S/S = Short Sleeved Assorted Sizes (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax)

L/S = Long Sleeved Enter unit prices below.
Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.

Item No. Sizes

Women’s, Blue, Oxford Shirt, 

S/S.
XXS-XL $19.34 $96.70 $21.40 $107.00 $26.31 $131.55

EDWARDS #5027-01. 2XL $22.10 $24.35 $29.34

3XL $23.48 $25.85 $30.86

4XL No Bid $25.85 No Bid

Women’s, Blue, Oxford Shirt, 

L/S.
XXS-XL $19.98 $79.92 $22.35 $89.40 $27.08 $108.32

EDWARDS #5077-01 2XL $22.94 $25.55 $30.26

3XL $24.38 $27.15 $31.86

4XL No Bid $27.15 No Bid

Women’s Pleated Khaki Shorts. 0-18 $22.35 $111.75 $23.10 $115.50 $25.89 $129.45

EDWARDS #8419-15. 18w-20w $22.35 $23.10 $25.89

22w-24w $26.62 $27.70 $30.57

26w-28w $28.75 $30.00 $32.92

Women’s  Pleated Black Shorts. 0-18 $22.35 $134.10 $23.10 $138.60 $25.89 $155.34

EDWARDS #8419-10. 18w-20w $22.35 $23.10 $25.89

22w-24w $26.62 $27.70 $30.57

26w-28w $28.75 $30.00 $32.92

Women’s, Plain Front Black 

Slacks, With/Stretch Waistband.
0-18 $24.87 $348.18 $25.90 $362.60 $28.65 $401.10

EDWARDS #8576-010. 18w-20w $24.87 $25.90 $28.65

22w-24w $29.65 $31.05 $33.88

26w-28w $32.04 $33.65 $36.51

29 5

30 6

31 14

27 5

28 4



Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price 

S/S = Short Sleeved Assorted Sizes (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax)

L/S = Long Sleeved Enter unit prices below.
Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.

Item No. Sizes

Women’s, Plain Front Khaki 

Slacks, With/Stretch Waistband.
0-18 $24.87 $422.79 $25.90 $440.30 $28.65 $487.05

EDWARDS #8576-015. 18w-20w $24.87 $25.90 $28.65

22w-24w $29.65 $31.05 $33.88

26w-28w $32.04 $33.60 $36.51

Women’s, Plain Front Khaki 

Slacks.
0-18 $23.61 $118.05 $24.50 $122.50 $27.89 $136.35

EDWARDS #8519-15. 18w-20w $23.61 $24.50 $27.29

22w-24w $28.13 $29.40 $32.23

26w-28w $30.39 $31.85 $34.71

MISCELLANEOUS BRANDS

Women’s Raspberry Pink Poplin 

Shirt.
XS-XL $24.82 $397.12 $27.50 $440.00 $32.94 $527.04

PORT AUTHORITY # L6290. 2XL $26.10 $28.90 $34.44

3XL $28.68 $31.70 $37.44

4XL $29.96 $33.10 $38.94

Women’s Light Blue Poplin Shirt 

.
XS-XL $24.82 $471.58 $27.50 $522.50 $32.94 $625.86

PORT AUTHORITY # L6290. 2XL $26.10 $28.90 $34.44

3XL $28.68 $31.70 $37.44

4XL $29.96 $33.10 $38.94

Polo Shirt, Hunter Green, S/S, 

With Pocket.
S-XL $25.13 $175.91 $26.50 $185.50 $27.56 $192.92

RED CAP #SK-28 HG. 2XL-3XL $29.44 $31.15 $30.83

Polo Shirt, Royal Blue, S/S, 

With Pocket.
S-XL $26.82 $187.74 $26.50 $185.50 $29.81 $204.47

RED CAP # SK-28 RB. 2XL-3XLL $31.49 $31.15 $32.81

37 7

35 19

36 7

32 17

33 5

34 16



Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price 

S/S = Short Sleeved Assorted Sizes (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax)

L/S = Long Sleeved Enter unit prices below.
Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.

Item No. Sizes

Black, V-Neck Pullover Sweater, 

L/S.
S-XL $23.73 $47.46 $30.30 $60.60 $37.71 $75.42

SAN FRANCISCO KNITTING 

MILLS #SFKM 6500.
2XL-3XL $26.32 $33.10 $45.21

Black, Pullover Sweater Vest, 

S/S.
S-XL $21.45 $42.90 $27.50 $55.00 $33.71 $67.42

SAN FRANCISCO KNITTING 

MILLS #SFKM 6600.
2XL-3XL $25.35 $31.70 $43.71

Black, Cardigan Sweater, L/S. XS-XL $26.97 $134.85 $33.80 $169.00 $41.46 $207.30

#SAI 6300. 2XL-3XL $30.87 $38.00 $45.96

Black, Women’s Fleece Vest. 1 XS-XL $20.96 $20.96 $23.30 $23.30 $28.69 $28.69

PORT AUTHORITY #L226. New Item 2XL $22.25 $25.50 $30.19

3XL $24.82 $27.50 $33.19

4XL $26.10 $29.50 $34.69

Black, Women’s Fleece Jacket. 1 XS-XL $22.25 $22.25 $24.70 $24.70 $30.69 $30.69

PORT AUTHORITY #L223. New Item 2XL $23.53 $22.10 $32.19

3XL $26.10 $29.89 $35.19

4XL $27.39 $30.30 $36.69

Black Lined Lightweight Jacket. XS-XL $40.25 $120.75 $44.30 $132.90 $51.69 $155.07

PORT AUTHORITY # J7301 41-

50.
2XL $41.53 $45.70 $53.19

3XL $44.10 $48.50 $56.19

4XL $45.39 $49.90 $57.69 $64.71

Black, Canvas Style Winter Coat, 

Carhartt Style.
S-XL $50.98 $50.98 $58.30 $58.30 $64.71

TRI-MOUNTAIN #4800. 2XL $53.60 $61.30 $67.71

3XL $56.19 $64.30 $70.71

4XL $58.79 $67.30 $73.71

44 1

40 5

41

42

43 3

38 2

39 2



Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price Price Per Unit Extended Price 

S/S = Short Sleeved Assorted Sizes (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax) (before tax)

L/S = Long Sleeved Enter unit prices below.
Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.
Enter unit prices below.

Based on smallest range of sizes, 

for bid comparison purposes.

Item No. Sizes

Black, Winter Jacket. S-XL $38.96 $38.96 $42.90 $42.90 $50.19 $50.19

CHALLENGER #J754. 2XL $40.25 $44.30 $51.69

3XL $42.82 $47.09 $54.69

4XL $44.10 $48.49 $56.19

SUB TOTAL $8,056.65 SUB TOTAL $8,559.00 SUB TOTAL $9,864.01

WA STATE 

SALES TAX – 

Destination Based 

@8.2%

$660.65

WA STATE 

SALES TAX – 

Destination Based 

@8.2%

$701.84

WA STATE 

SALES TAX – 

Destination Based 

@8.2%

$808.85

TOTAL $8,717.30 TOTAL $9,260.84 TOTAL $10,672.86

COMMENTS
15 Day Delivery;                                 

Payment Terms 0% net 30; 
COMMENTS 25 Day Delivery COMMENTS

21 Day Delivery;                        

Payment Terms net 30

THIS FIELD MUST 

BE FILLED IN OR 

BID MAY BE 

REJECTED

Edwards:30-40%

THIS FIELD MUST 

BE FILLED IN OR 

BID MAY BE 

REJECTED

Edwards: 53%

THIS FIELD MUST 

BE FILLED IN OR 

BID MAY BE 

REJECTED

Edwards: 25%

List discount(s) offered off 

list price for any other items 

that are available but not 

specifically listed above (may 

be a range):

Other Brands:   30-40%

List discount(s) offered off 

list price for any other items 

that are available but not 

specifically listed above (may 

be a range):

Other Brands:   47%

List discount(s) offered off 

list price for any other items 

that are available but not 

specifically listed above (may 

be a range):

Other Brands:   25%

Specify preferred minimum order quantities for sweaters and 

jackets:  4

Specify preferred minimum order quantities for sweaters and 

jackets:

As stated above, the City will make an effort to meet minimum 

order requirements, but there may be exceptions.  Please refer to 

the Bid Specification, Section II, Item 6:  More or Less.

As stated above, the City will make an effort to meet minimum 

order requirements, but there may be exceptions.  Please refer to 

the Bid Specification, Section II, Item 6:  More or Less.

Specify preferred minimum order quantities for sweaters and 

jackets:  Minimum of 6 pieces would be preferred when 

embroidery

As stated above, the City will make an effort to meet minimum 

order requirements, but there may be exceptions.  Please refer to 

the Bid Specification, Section II, Item 6:  More or Less.

45 1


