
City Manager

No.
Description

Qty. Unit
Unit 
Price

Total 
Price

Unit 
Price

Total 
Price

Unit 
Price

Total 
Price

Unit 
Price

Total 
Price

Unit 
Price

Total 
Price

Unit 
Price

Total 
Price

Unit 
Price

Total 
Price

Unit 
Price

Total 
Price

Unit 
Price

1 AWWA C502 Fire 
hydrants, Bury Depth 4'

2 EA 1,358.70 2,717.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1,363.70 2,727.40 1,410.95 2,821.90 1,356.00 2,712.00 1,344.49

2
AWWA C502 Fire 
hydrants, Bury Depth 
4'6"

1 EA 1,390.19 1,390.19 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1,395.31 1,395.31 1,473.48 1,473.48 1,388.00 1,388.00 1,375.71

3 AWWA C502 Fire 
hydrants, Bury Depth 5'

8 EA 1,421.76 11,374.08 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1,427.00 11,416.00 1,506.32 12,050.56 1,420.00 11,360.00 1,406.94

4
AWWA C502 Fire 
hydrants, Bury Depth 
5'6"

12 EA 1,453.29 17,439.48 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1,458.64 17,503.68 1,539.16 18,469.92 1,450.00 17,400.00 1,438.16

5 AWWA C502 Fire 
hydrants, Bury Depth 6'

5 EA 1,484.77 7,423.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1,490.24 7,451.20 1,571.37 7,856.85 1,483.00 7,415.00 1,469.39

6
6-inch Hydrant Extension 
Kits

5 EA 246.57 1,232.85 273.48 1,367.40 321.67 1,608.35 321.67 1,608.35 305.30 1,526.50 238.77 1,193.85 259.52 1,297.60 238.00 1,190.00 248.84

7
12-inch Hydrant 
Extension Kits

5 EA 289.92 1,449.60 351.57 1,757.85 375.58 1,877.90 375.58 1,877.90 356.90 1,784.50 280.76 1,403.80 303.42 1,517.10 277.00 1,385.00 290.53

8
18-inch Hydrant 
Extension Kits

5 EA 328.24 1,641.20 364.06 1,820.30 426.40 2,132.00 426.40 2,132.00 405.64 2,028.20 317.87 1,589.35 344.40 1,722.00 315.00 1,575.00 329.68

9
Hydrant Repair Kits

5 EA 113.03 565.15 119.92 599.60 115.67 578.35 120.69 603.45 142.23 711.15 104.70 523.50 344.40 1,722.00 93.00 465.00 109.26

Vendor Name
General Pacific, 

Inc.
H.D. Fowler 
Company

Vendor NameVendor Name
Empirewest, Inc.                                                

#4                                           
(East Jordon 
BR/CD 250)

Furguson 
Waterworks

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:
Vendor Name

BUYER / DATE

I recommend award to H.D. Fowler 
Company based on theirs being the lowest 
responsive and responsible bid received.

Bid Tabulation
Project: Fire Hydrants
Bid Opening:  February 4, 2011
Project No.:  11104
Contract Term:  1 yr with 4 extentions

Vendor Name

Project Manager: James Dean

HD Supply 
Waterworks, LTD.                                                   

(CLOW)

Vendor NameVendor Name
Consolidated 

Supply Co.
Empirewest, Inc.                                

#1                                              
(Mueller Brand)

Empirewest, Inc.                            
#2                                

(M&H 129)

Empirewest, Inc.                                     
#3                                        

(M&H 929)

Vendor Name Vendor Name

Contract Term:  02/11/11 through 02/11/16



Total 
Price

2,688.98

1,375.71

11,255.52

17,257.92

7,346.95

1,244.20

1,452.65

1,648.40

546.30

Vendor Name
HD Supply 

Waterworks, LTD.                                                   
(CLOW)



General Pacific, 
Inc.

H.D. Fowler 
Company

Empirewest, Inc.                                                
#4                                           

(East Jordon 
BR/CD 250)

Furguson 
Waterworks

BUYER / DATE

I recommend award to H.D. Fowler 
Company based on theirs being the lowest 
responsive and responsible bid received.

HD Supply 
Waterworks, LTD.                                                   

(CLOW)

Consolidated 
Supply Co.

Empirewest, Inc.                                
#1                                              

(Mueller Brand)

Empirewest, Inc.                            
#2                                

(M&H 129)

Empirewest, Inc.                                     
#3                                        

(M&H 929)

10

5” Storz Coupling Nozzle 
x 4-1/2” NST connection 
with cap & cable

25 EA 127.78 3,194.50 169.35 4,233.75 169.35 4,233.75 169.35 4,233.75 169.35 4,233.75 125.81 3,145.25 121.00 3,025.00 118.00 2,950.00 123.00



HD Supply 
Waterworks, LTD.                                                   

(CLOW)

3,075.00



General Pacific, 
Inc.

H.D. Fowler 
Company

Empirewest, Inc.                                                
#4                                           

(East Jordon 
BR/CD 250)

Furguson 
Waterworks

BUYER / DATE

I recommend award to H.D. Fowler 
Company based on theirs being the lowest 
responsive and responsible bid received.

HD Supply 
Waterworks, LTD.                                                   

(CLOW)

Consolidated 
Supply Co.

Empirewest, Inc.                                
#1                                              

(Mueller Brand)

Empirewest, Inc.                            
#2                                

(M&H 129)

Empirewest, Inc.                                     
#3                                        

(M&H 929)

No bid on line items 
No. 1-5

Full freight 
allowance is based 
upon 5000 Lb. 
shipment unless 
otherwise mutually 
agreede.

NOTES: No bid on line items 
No. 1-5

No bid on line items 
No. 1-5

No bid on line items 
No. 1-5

Yes Yes

47,891.63

3,927.11

51,818.74

0.00

0% / Net 30

30 Days Maximum

INCLUDED

No 

None None

30 Days Maximum 30 Days Maximum

INCLUDED INCLUDED

4,260.43 3,922.88

56,216.84 51,762.88

0.00 0.00

51,956.41 47,840.00

N/A

0% / Net 10th Prox.

30 Days Maximum

INCLUDED

Yes

48,349.34

3,964.65

52,313.99

0.00

0% / Net 30

30 Days Maximum

INCLUDED

Yes

10,284.10

843.30

11,127.40

3,971.12

48,428.30

30 Days Maximum

52,399.42

8.2% WSST:

Grand Total Base Bid:

Payment Discount / Terms:

0.00 0.00 0.00

0% / Net 30 0% / Net 30

10,430.35

Delivery Time:

0% / Net 30

Subtotal:

30 Days Maximum

Yes Yes Yes Yes

INCLUDEDINCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

0% / Net 30

11,312.80

801.87

0.00

855.29 857.35

10,580.77 11,285.64

Freight FOB destination:

Will Vendor Share Prices?

10,455.45

30 Days Maximum 30 Days Maximum

9,778.90

Price of fuel per gallon, used to calculate trip 
rate:



HD Supply 
Waterworks, LTD.                                                   

(CLOW)

47,891.63

3,927.11

51,818.74

0.00

0% / Net 30

30 Days Maximum

INCLUDED

No 


