
approved copy in Purchasing

BUYER / DATE

Vendor 

Picks 
Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks Total Price

Vendor 

Picks 
Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks Total Price

Vendor 

Picks 
Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks Total Price

No Bid: Candy's Alterations

Coralie's Prof Alterations

Gateway Cleaners

Hans Tailoring

Happy Hemmers

Kesh Alteration Service

Miracle Cleaners

Priscilla's Chic Boutique

West Valley Dry Cleaning

City Manager

Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name

Bid Tabulation

Project No.:  11105

Contract Term:  2-22-11 to 2-22-16

Project: Dry Cleaning
Bid Opening: February 16, 2011 @ 2pm

John's Dry Cleaning Nob Hill Cleaners

I recommend, in the best interest of the City, a 

multiple award for all Schedules to John's Dry 

Cleaning and Nob Hill Cleaners except for Schedule 

H.  Will seek additional competition for Schedule H. 

Colleen Bailey 2-22-11

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

No. Description Qty. Unit

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price
Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price
Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

1 Uniform Shirts 6,000 EA 1.75 10,500.00 1.75 10,500.00 1.30 7,800.00 1.30 7,800.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

2 Uniform Pants 6,500 EA 2.00 13,000.00 2.00 13,000.00 1.50 9,750.00 1.50 9,750.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

3 Uniform Coats 60 EA 2.50 150.00 2.50 150.00 5.00 300.00 5.00 300.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

4 Uniform Winter Coats 60 EA 2.50 150.00 2.50 150.00 5.00 300.00 5.00 300.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

5 Uniform Winter Jumpsuits – As Needed60 EA 1.50 90.00 1.50 90.00 5.00 300.00 5.00 300.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

6 Uniform Ties -- As Needed 70 EA 1.00 70.00 1.00 70.00 1.00 70.00 1.00 70.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

7 Wool Pullover Sweaters 30 EA 1.75 52.50 1.75 52.50 3.50 105.00 3.50 105.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

8
Uniform Cap Tops -- As 

Needed
60 EA 0.50 30.00 0.50 30.00 1.50 90.00 1.50 90.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

9 Minor Repairs 130 EA 3.00 390.00 3.00 390.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

$24,432.50 $24,432.50 $18,715.00 $18,715.00 $0.00 $0.00

SECTION I. City of Yakima

Schedule A - Police Uniforms

Totals $24,432.50 $24,432.50 $18,715.00 $18,715.00 $0.00 $0.00Totals 



BUYER / DATE

No. Description Qty. Unit

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

No Bid: Candy's Alterations

Coralie's Prof Alterations

Gateway Cleaners

Hans Tailoring

Happy Hemmers

Kesh Alteration Service

Miracle Cleaners

Priscilla's Chic Boutique

West Valley Dry Cleaning

Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name

John's Dry Cleaning Nob Hill Cleaners

I recommend, in the best interest of the City, a 

multiple award for all Schedules to John's Dry 

Cleaning and Nob Hill Cleaners except for Schedule 

H.  Will seek additional competition for Schedule H. 

Colleen Bailey 2-22-11

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

10 Heavy Coats -- As Needed 1 EA 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

11 Jackets -- As Needed 1 EA 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Totals 

Schedule B - Parking Enforcement

$5.00 $5.00 $10.00 $10.00 $0.00 $0.00

12 Jackets -- As Needed 2 EA 2.50 5.00 2.50 5.00 5.00 10.00 5.00 10.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

13 Uniform Pants-- As Needed 2 EA 2.00 4.00 2.00 4.00 1.50 3.00 1.50 3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

$9.00 $9.00 $13.00 $13.00 $0.00 $0.00

14 Coveralls ‑‑ As Needed 35 Pair 1.50 52.50 1.50 52.50 5.00 175.00 5.00 175.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

15 Orange Safety Vests 24 EA 1.25 30.00 1.25 30.00 1.00 24.00 1.00 24.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

$82.50 $82.50 $199.00 $199.00 $0.00 $0.00

*Per pleat *per pleat

16
Kitchen Overdrape 95” x 

156” 1 Pair 15.00 15.00 15.00 15.00 3.50 3.50 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

17 Office Overdrape 95” x 162” 1 Pair 15.00 15.00 15.00 15.00 3.50 3.50 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Totals 

Totals 

Schedule C - Animal Control

Schedule D - Streets

Totals 

Schedule E - Fire Department

Station No. 1

Office Overdrape 95” x 162”

$30.00 $30.00 $7.00 $3.00 $0.00 $0.00Totals 



BUYER / DATE

No. Description Qty. Unit

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

No Bid: Candy's Alterations

Coralie's Prof Alterations

Gateway Cleaners

Hans Tailoring

Happy Hemmers

Kesh Alteration Service

Miracle Cleaners

Priscilla's Chic Boutique

West Valley Dry Cleaning

Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name

John's Dry Cleaning Nob Hill Cleaners

I recommend, in the best interest of the City, a 

multiple award for all Schedules to John's Dry 

Cleaning and Nob Hill Cleaners except for Schedule 

H.  Will seek additional competition for Schedule H. 

Colleen Bailey 2-22-11

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

18
Watch Office Overdrape 95” 

x 110”
1 Pair 15.00 15.00 15.00 15.00 3.50 3.50 3.50 3.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

19
Watch Office Liner 94-1/2” 

x 98”
1 Panel 15.00 15.00 15.00 15.00 3.50 3.50 3.50 3.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Station No. 5

19
x 98”

1 Panel 15.00 15.00 15.00 15.00 3.50 3.50 3.50 3.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

20 Uniform Shirts 3,000 EA 1.75 5,250.00 1.75 5,250.00 1.30 3,900.00 1.30 3,900.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

21 Trousers 3,000 EA 2.00 6,000.00 2.00 6,000.00 1.50 4,500.00 1.50 4,500.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

22 Patches 260 EA 2.25 585.00 2.25 585.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

23 Uniform and Dress Coats 40 EA 2.50 100.00 2.50 100.00 5.00 200.00 5.00 200.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

24 Uniform Ties 6 EA 1.00 6.00 1.00 6.00 1.00 6.00 1.00 6.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

25 Minor Repairs 100 EA 3.00 300.00 3.00 300.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

$12,271.00 $12,271.00 $8,613.00 $8,613.00 $0.00 $0.00

26 Backdrop Drapes 96” x 120” 18 EA 15.00 270.00 15.00 270.00 3.50 63.00 3.50 63.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

$15.00 $270.00 $15.00 $270.00 $3.50 $63.00 $3.50 $63.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

27
Insulated coveralls -- as 

needed 9 Pair 1.50 13.50 1.50 13.50 5.00 45.00 5.00 45.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

28
Coveralls (Summer) -- as 

needed 4 EA 1.50 6.00 1.50 6.00 5.00 20.00 5.00 20.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Totals 

Schedule F - Yakima Center

Totals 

Schedule G - Traffic Engineering

28 needed 4 EA 1.50 6.00 1.50 6.00 5.00 20.00 5.00 20.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

29
Traffic Vests, 3 to 4 times 

per year 6 EA 1.00 6.00 1.00 6.00 1.00 6.00 1.00 6.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

30 Jackets -- as needed 4 EA 2.50 10.00 2.50 10.00 5.00 20.00 5.00 20.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

$35.50 $35.50 $91.00 $91.00 $0.00 $0.00Totals 



BUYER / DATE

No. Description Qty. Unit

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

No Bid: Candy's Alterations

Coralie's Prof Alterations

Gateway Cleaners

Hans Tailoring

Happy Hemmers

Kesh Alteration Service

Miracle Cleaners

Priscilla's Chic Boutique

West Valley Dry Cleaning

Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name

John's Dry Cleaning Nob Hill Cleaners

I recommend, in the best interest of the City, a 

multiple award for all Schedules to John's Dry 

Cleaning and Nob Hill Cleaners except for Schedule 

H.  Will seek additional competition for Schedule H. 

Colleen Bailey 2-22-11

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

31 Slacks – lengthen or shorten 1 Pair 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

32
Slacks – taken in or let out 

waist
1 Pair 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Schedule H - Alterations

32
waist

1 Pair 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

33 Replace pant zipper 1 EA 12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

34
Long Sleeve Shirt – shorten 

sleeves
1 EA 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

35
Short Sleeve Shirt – shorten 

sleeves
1 EA 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

36 Shirt – take in side seams 1 EA 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

37
Lined Jacket – shorten 

sleeves
1 EA 12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

38
Unlined Jacket – shorten 

sleeves
1 EA 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

39 Replace jacket zipper 1 EA 15.00 15.00 15.00 15.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

40 Jumpsuit – Hem slacks 1 EA 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

41 Jumpsuit – Hem sleeves 1 EA 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

42 Sew on Patches – large 1 EA 2.25 2.25 2.25 2.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

43 Sew on Patches – small 1 EA 2.25 2.25 2.25 2.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

44 Scotch guard jackets 1 EA 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0044 Scotch guard jackets 1 EA 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

45 Sew on name tabs 1 EA 2.25 2.25 2.25 2.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

46 Sew on stripes or other rank 1 EA 2.25 2.25 2.25 2.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

$109.00 $109.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00Totals 



BUYER / DATE

No. Description Qty. Unit

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

No Bid: Candy's Alterations

Coralie's Prof Alterations

Gateway Cleaners

Hans Tailoring

Happy Hemmers

Kesh Alteration Service

Miracle Cleaners

Priscilla's Chic Boutique

West Valley Dry Cleaning

Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name

John's Dry Cleaning Nob Hill Cleaners

I recommend, in the best interest of the City, a 

multiple award for all Schedules to John's Dry 

Cleaning and Nob Hill Cleaners except for Schedule 

H.  Will seek additional competition for Schedule H. 

Colleen Bailey 2-22-11

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

47

Shirts – Short Sleeve 

Polyster/Wool/Polyster 1 EA 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

SECTION II. Yakima County

Schedule I - Office Uniforms

47 Polyster/Wool/Polyster 

Blend

1 EA 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

48

Shirts – Long Sleeve 

Polyester/Wool/Polyester 

Blend

1 EA 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

49

Shirts – Long Sleeve 

Cotton/Cotton/Polyester 

Blend

1 EA 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

50
Pants – Polyester 

Wool/Polyester Blend
1 Pair 1.40 1.40 1.40 1.40 1.50 1.50 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

51

Pants – 

Cotton/Cotton/Polyester 

Blend

1 Pair 1.40 1.40 1.40 1.40 1.50 1.50 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

52 Jackets (Tuffy Style) 1 EA 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

53
Pull Over Sweater – 100% 

Acrylic
1 EA 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 3.50 3.50 3.50 3.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

$13.70 $13.70 $15.40 $15.40 $0.00 $0.00

54

Clerical Blouses – Short 

Sleeve Cotton/Polyester 

Blend
1 EA 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Clerical Blouses – Long 

Totals 

Schedule J - Clerk Uniforms

55

Clerical Blouses – Long 

Sleeve Cotton/Polyester 

Blend
1 EA 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 1.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

56
Slacks – Cotton/Polyester 

Blend 1 Pair 1.40 1.40 1.40 1.40 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

57 Vests – Polyester Blend 1 EA 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

58 Cardigan Sweater 1 EA 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

$7.00 $7.00 $5.10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00Totals 



BUYER / DATE

No. Description Qty. Unit

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

Vendor 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

City or 

County 

Picks 

Up/Delivers 

Unit Price

Total Price

No Bid: Candy's Alterations

Coralie's Prof Alterations

Gateway Cleaners

Hans Tailoring

Happy Hemmers

Kesh Alteration Service

Miracle Cleaners

Priscilla's Chic Boutique

West Valley Dry Cleaning

Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name

John's Dry Cleaning Nob Hill Cleaners

I recommend, in the best interest of the City, a 

multiple award for all Schedules to John's Dry 

Cleaning and Nob Hill Cleaners except for Schedule 

H.  Will seek additional competition for Schedule H. 

Colleen Bailey 2-22-11

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

59
Pants/Coats – Standard 

Press 1 Pair 3.00 3.00 3.00 3.00 20% off 20% off 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Shirts – Military press.  

Press to be entered on shirt 

Schedule K - Non-Uniform Clothing

60

Press to be entered on shirt 

pockets and entered on 

sleeves, arm patches, and 

stripes.

1 EA 2.75 2.75 2.75 2.75 20% off 20% off 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

61 Dresses – Standard press 1 EA 7.00 7.00 7.00 7.00 20% off 20% off 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

$12.75 $12.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00Totals 

Payment Discount / Terms:

20% off 20% off

none none

SECTION III - Both City and County

SCHEDULE L:  Items not specifically called out shall 

be determined at regular retail price minus percent 

discount of:

20% off 20% off


