



**Bid Tabulation**  
**Project: Motor Patrol Grader**  
**Bid Opening: February 23, 2012 @ 11am**  
**Project No.: C11203**  
**Contract Term:**  
**Project Manager: Dave Veley/Equipment Services**

<u>AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:</u>		Vendor Name	Vendor Name	Vendor Name	Vendor Name	Vendor Name							
See Resolution 94-2012 for award.		Central Machinery Sales Inc.	Clyde West Inc	NC Machinery	Pape	Pape							
BUYER / DATE:													
<u>SCHEDULE I</u>													
No.	Description	Qty.	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1	Three (3) Motor Patrol Graders (AWD)	3	EA			325,811.88	977,435.64	253,940.00	761,820.00	268,500.00	805,500.00	240,555.00	721,665.00
	Manufacturer			NO BID		Volvo		Caterpillar		John Deere		John Deere	
	Model #			NO BID		G946B		140M2 (AWD)		772G		672G	
2	The undersigned certifies that he has examined to his satisfaction, the trade-in Graders (Equipment No. 7215, 7216 & 7258) and submits the following bid.	3	EA	NO BID									
	Yakima County will not accept any offer of less than One Hundred Seventy-Eight Thousand Dollars (\$178,000.00/ea) for each Motor Patrol Grader. If your offer exceeds the minimum price, you must list your bid on the appropriate space (either B for cash or C for trade-in.)			NO BID									

		Vendor Name	Vendor Name	Vendor Name	Vendor Name	Vendor Name
See Resolution 94-2012 for award.		Central Machinery Sales Inc.	Clyde West Inc	NC Machinery	Pape	Pape
A	Minimum bid:	#7215				
		#7216				
		#7258				
or	(IF your bid equals or exceeds minimum price, list below)					
B	For Cash:	#7215				
		#7216				
		#7258				
or	(This item is for vendors interested in purchase of trade-in when not supplying new unit.)					
C	For Trade-In:	#7215	178,700.00	190,000.00	180,000.00	180,000.00
		#7216	178,700.00	190,000.00	180,000.00	180,000.00
		#7258	178,700.00	190,000.00	180,000.00	180,000.00
	Total Trade-In		536,100.00	570,000.00	540,000.00	540,000.00
Subtotals			441,335.64	191,820.00	265,500.00	181,665.00
7.9% WSST (Yakima County)			34,865.52	15,153.78	20,974.50	14,351.54
3	<b>Total Net Bid</b> (Figured on amount after deduction of trade-in)		476,201.16	206,973.78	286,474.50	196,016.54

			Vendor Name	Vendor Name	Vendor Name	Vendor Name	Vendor Name
See Resolution 94-2012 for award.			Central Machinery Sales Inc.	Clyde West Inc	NC Machinery	Pape	Pape
4	Guaranteed repurchase price at the end of 5,000 operating hours or six (6) years (whichever comes first)	3 EA		85,000.00 255,000.00	175,530.00 526,590.00	155,000.00 465,000.00	135,430.00 406,290.00
5	<b>Total Cost of BID (Item 3 MINUS Item 4)</b>			<b>221,201.16</b>	<b>-319,616.22</b>	<b>-178,525.50</b>	<b>-210,273.47</b>
	<b>Bid Bond</b>			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes