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Project: Bulk Purchase and Delivery of fuels, "As Needed" Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF), and Incidentals
Bid Opening: 12/20/2019
) Project No.: J11902
“N i Contract Term: 1-Year with Possible Four 1-Year Renewals
R g Department: Multiple City/County Contract Term: WZ?
%
I AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE: Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
| reccommend award of Schedule |, II, Ill, V and VI to
Connell Oil on the basis that their Bid was they were
E.DmOSt responsible pidder. Christensen Coleman Oil Connell Oil
WV WIS 0]~ 512020
== BUYER/DATE /
SCHEDULE | Unleaded Clear Unleaded Clear Unleaded Clear
+/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon + Multiplier Total Price Per Gallon + Multiplier Total Price Per Gallo
RS 2,500 2,500 wen : 2,500 2,500 ol ; 2,500 2 5r:)0
No. Rack Fuel Type Average Full z Full 7 Average Full y Full i Average | Full ¢ Full :
12110119 Lnaii 1/2 Load| Gallons ol 1/2 Load| Gallons 12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Lok 1/2 Load| Gallons 12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Load 1/2 Load| Gallons
or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less
Unleaded
1 |Moses Lake, WA Mid
Premium 2.3474| 1.0150| 1.0200 1.0310} 2.3826| 2.3943 2.4202
2.3274 2.3623| 2.3739| 2.3995
> v 2.2101| 2.2339
Unleaded 2.1605] 0.0790| 0.1190 0.2390 22305| 22795 23995 2.1605] 1.0170f 1.0230 1.0340 21972 2.2102 29340
2 |Pasco, wa 2.1305 2.2095| 2.2495| 2.3695 2.1305 2.1667| 2.1795| 2.2029
Mid
Premium
Unleaded 2.1003] 0.1100] 0.1500f 0.2700] 2.2103|] 2.2503| 2.3703 2.1062] 1.0364| 1.0450] 1.0550] 2.1829| 2.2010] 2.2220 2.1062] 1.0400] 1.0500f 1.0900] 2.1904| 2.2115] 2.2958
2.1089 2.2189]| 2.2589 2.3789 2.1089 2.1857| 2.2038 2.2249 2.1089 2.1933| 2.2143 2.2987
3 |Seattle, WA Mid
Premium
Unleaded
4 |Spokane, WA Mid
= 2.3650
Premium 2.3191] 1.0200f 1.0310 1.0440 23655 2.3910 24211
2.2975 2.3435| 2.3687| 2.3986§
Unleaded
5 |Tacoma, WA Mid
Premium
Unleaded
6 |Other Mid
Premium
Additives, (IT not already added nto T s T
7 |the price above) Additives: 0.0150 Additives: None Additives: 0.0000
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STLSERVICE=R ).
Project: Bulk Purchase and Delivery of fuels, "As Needed" Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF), and Incidentals 3/ i Qg
Bid Opening: 12/20/2019 ik E
Project No.: J11902
Contract Term: 1-Year with Possible Four 1-Year Renewals
Department: Multiple City/County
Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
Cougar Den Mansfield Energy Petroleum Traders
SCHEDULE | Unleaded Clear Unleaded Clear Unleaded Clear
oPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon OPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon OPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon
2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500
No. Rack Fuel Type Average Full # Full ’ Average Full ¢ Full ¥ Average | Full - Full ¢
12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons P 1/2 Load| Gallons 12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Yiad 1/2 Load| Gallons 1211019 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Load 1/2 Load| Gallons
or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less
Unleaded
1 |[Moses Lake, WA |Mid
Premium 2.3474| 0.0475| 0.2500 0.2500] 2.3949| 2.5974 2.5974
2.3274 2.3749| 2.5774 2.5774
Unleaded 2.1505| 0.0475| 0.2500 0.2500 21980 2.4005 2 4005
2 |Pasco, WA 2.1305 2.1780| 2.3805| 2.3805
Mid
Premium
Unleaded 2.1062| 0.0475( 0.2500 0.2500] 2.1537| 2.3562 2.3562
2.1089 _33532
3 |Seattle, WA Mid
Premium
Unleaded
4 |Spokane, WA Mid
Premium 2.3191| 0.0475| 0.2500 0.2500 23666] 25691 2 5691
2.2975 2.3450) 2.5475| 2.5475
Unleaded 2.1452| 0.0475| 0.2500 0.25000 2.1927| 2.3952 2.3952
2.1514 2.1989| 2.4014 2.4014'
5 |Tacoma, WA Mid 23650 0.0475| 0.2500 0.2500] 2.4125| 2.6150 2.6150|
2.3900 2.4375| 2.6400) 2.6400
Premium 2.4863| 0.0475| 0.2500 0.2500] 2.5338| 2.7363 2.7363
2.5326 2.5801| 2.7826| 2.7826
Unleaded
6 |Other Mid
Premium
Additives, (IT not already added sae ] et o
7 |into the price above) Additives: N/A Additives: Additives:
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Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
SCHEDULE Il Christensen Coleman Oil Connell Oil
Unleaded Ethanol (10%) Unleaded Ethanol (10%) Unleaded Ethanol (10%)
+/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon + Multiplier Total Price Per Gallon + Multiplier Total Price Per Gallon
rabid 2,500 2,500 ore 2,500 2,500 ke 2,500 2,500
No. Rack Fuel Type Average Full ! Full ! Average Full y Full 3 Average Full : Full ;
12110119 Losd 1/2 Load| Gallons Lo 1/2 Load| Gallons 12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Lond 1/2 Load| Gallons 12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons L séd 1/2 Load| Gallons
or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less
Unleaded 1.6446] 1.0022| 1.0083 1.0100] 1.6482| 1.6583 1.6610
1.6965 1.7002] 1.7106/ 1.7135
. 1.7710 1.7849
1.7673 ] 4 i I
1 |Moses Lake, WA |Mid 7 1.0022| 1.0083( 1.0100 17712| 1.7820
1.8244 1.8284| 1.8395
Premium 19212 1.0022| 1.0083| 1.0100f 1.9254| 1.9371
1.9783 1.9827| 1.9947
Unleaded 1.7130] 0.0680| 0.1080] 0.2280] 1.7810] 1.8210] 1.9410 1.7130f 1.0024| 1.0087| 1.0120f 1.7171] 1.7279
1.7266 1.7946] 1.8346]| 1.9546 1.7266 1.7307| 1.7416
2 |Pasco, WA Mid 1.8948] 0.0680( 0.1080| 0.2280] 1.9628| 2.0028| 2.1228 1.8948| 1.0024| 1.0087 1.0120' 1.8993] 1.9113
1.9034 1.9714| 2.0114] 2.1314 1.9034 1.9080( _1.9200
Premium 2.0338] 0.0680| 0.1080] 0.2280] 2.1018| 2.1418| 2.2618 2.0338] 1.0024| 1.0087| 1.0120] 2.0387| 2.0515
é0458h 21138 2.1538| 2.2738 2.0458 2.0507| 2.0636
Unleaded 1.8092] 0.0950( 0.1350] 0.2550] 1.9042| 1.9442| 2.0642 1.8188] 1.0050] 1.0170|] 1.0230f] 1.8279]| 1.8497 1.8188| 1.0070] 1.0170] 1.0370] 1.8315| 1.8497| 1.8861
1.8046 1.8996| 1.9396| 2.0596 1.8046 1.8136| 1.8353 1.8046 1.8172] 1.8353| 1.8714
3 |seattie. WA Mid 1.9920] 0.0950f 0.1350 0.2550] 2.0870| 2.1270 2.2470 2.0000] 1.0050{ 1.0170 1.0230f] 2.0100] 2.0340 2.0000| 1.0400| 1.0500 1.0700] 2.0800( 2.1000 2.1400
DAt 1.9894 2.0844| 2.1244| 22444] 19894 1.9993| 2.0232 1.9894 2.0690| 2.0889| 2.1287
n i , 2.2716 2.2695
Premium 2.1134] 0.0950| 0.1350( 0.2550 2.2084| 2.2484| 2.3684 2.1211| 1.0050( 1.0170( 1.0230 21317] 21572 : 2.1211] 1.0400| 1.0500{ 1.0700 22050l 222721 22608
2.1086 2.1086( 2.1086| 2.1086) 2.1086 2.1191| 2.1444| 2.1571 2.1086 2.1929| 2.2140| 2.2562
1.6779
.67 d .007 t
Unleaded 1.6721] 1.0035| 1.0075| 1.0140, 16780 1.6848] 1.6955
1.6937 1.6996| 1.7064| 1.7174
4 |Spokane, WA y I 1.8284
1.8221 i b .014
Mid 2 1.0035( 1.0075( 1.0140 18285 18358 1.8476
1.8459 1.8524| 1.8597| 1.8717
Premium 1.9525| 1.0035/ 1.0075/ 1.0140] 1.9593| 1.9671| 1.9798
1.9740 1.9809] 1.9888| 2.0016)
Unleaded
5 |Tacoma, WA Mid
Premium
Unleaded
6 |Other Mid
Premium
7 |the price ,above) Additives: 0.0150 Additives: None Additives: 0.0000
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Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Petroleum Traders

SCHEDULE II Cougar Den Mansfield Energy
Unleaded Ethanol (10%) Unleaded Ethanol (10%) Unleaded Ethanol (10%)
oPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon oPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon OPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon
2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500
e Rk Fuel Type | Average | Full |, il Gallons| F“" [1/2 Load| Gallons | Y888 | Full |40} cad| Galions | P! [1/2 Load| Gallons | A¥r98 [ FU! 1405\ cad| Gallons | 7" |1/2 Load| Gallons
12/10/19 | Load Load 12/10/19 | Load Load 12/10/19 | Load Load
or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less
Unleaded 1.6446| 0.0250| 0.0500 0.0750] 1.6696| 1.6946 1.7196
1.6965 1.7215| 1.7465| 1.7715
1 |Moses Lake, WA |Mid 1.7673| 0.0250( 0.0500 0.0750! 17923 18173 1.8423
1.8244 1.8494| 1.8744| 1.8994
Premium 1.9212] 0.0250| 0.0500 0.0750] 1.9462| 1.9712 1.9962
1.9783 2.0033] 2.0283| 2.0533
Unleaded 1.7088| 0.0150| 0.0350 0.0550] 1.7238| 1.7438 1.7638 1.7088] 0.0237 1.7325 1.7088| 0.1165| 0.2366 0.3200] 1.8253| 1.9454 2.0288
1.7266 1.7416| 1.7616 1.7816 1.7266 1.7503 1.7266 1.8431| 1.9632( 2.0466)
2 |Pasco, WA Mid 1.8918| 0.0150| 0.0350 0.0550] 1.9068| 1.9268 1.9468 1.8918| 0.0322 1.9240 1.8918| 0.1790| 0.2992 0.3700] 2.0708] 2.1910 2.2618
1.9034 1.9184| 1.9384| 1.9584 1.9034 1.9356 1.9034 2.0824| 2.2026| 2.2734
Premium 2.0296] 0.0150| 0.0350 0.0550] 2.0446| 2.0646 2.0846 2.0296] 0.0322 2.0618 2.0296f 0.1790( 0.2992 0.3700] 2.2086| 2.3288 2.3996
2.0458 2.0608| 2.0808| 2.1008 2.0458 2.0136 2.0458 2.2248| 2.3450| 2.4158
Unleaded 1.8188| 0.0475| 0.0775 0.0975] 1.8663| 1.8963 1.9163
1.8046 1.8521| 1.8821 1.9021
3 |Seattle, WA Mid 2.0000] 0.0475| 0.0775 0.0975] 2.0475| 2.0775 2.0975
vkl 1.9894 2.0369] 2.0669| 2.0869
i 2. 121% i .0775 0.0975
Premium 2.121 0.0475| 0.0 0 21686 21988 22186
2.1086 2.1561| 2.1861 2.2061
1.6721 i .0800 0.
Unleaded 0.0600| O 1000 17321l 17521 1.7721
1.6937 1.7537) 1.7737] 1.7937
4 |Spokane, WA .
Mid 1.8221] 0.0600( 0.0800 0.1000 1.8821] 1.9021
1.8459 1.9059| 1.9259
Premium 1.9525] 0.0600( 0.0800 0.1000f 2.0125| 2.0325
1.9740 2.0340( 2.0540
Unleaded 1.7998] 0.0499| 0.0799 0.0999] 1.8497| 1.8797
1.7979 1.8478| 1.8778
5 |Tacoma, WA Mid 1.9963] 0.0499] 0.0799 0.0999] 2.0462| 2.0762
1.9885 2.0384| 2.0684
Premium 2.1188| 0.0499| 0.0799 0.0999] 2.1687| 2.1987
2.1226 2.1725| 2.2025
Unleaded
6 |Other Mid
Premium
7 linto the price above) Additives: N/A Additives: N/A Additives:
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Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
SCHEDULE Il Christensen Coleman Oil Connell Oil
Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate - 2% Biodiesel Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate - 2% Biodiesel At Times
+/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon + Multiplier Total Price Per Gallon + Multiplier Total Price Per Gallon
OPIS OPIS OPIS
oy S Fuel Type | SWIR] Full 1412 Load Gi’f.f,’ﬂs Full 1412 Load Gza’:::s Average |  Full ..} ;ad Gz::::s Full ‘142 Load Gza,lfg:s s P9l 1412 Load Gz;,lslggs Full 1412 Load Gza':::s
1211019 | Load - Load 1211019 | Load Load 1211019 | Load Load
or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less
No. 2 1.8824 1.019 1.028 1.036] 1.9182] 1.9351 1.9505‘
1 |Moses Lake, WA 1.9698 2.0072] 2.0250| 2.0407
No. 1
No. 2 2.0087] 0.0680| 0.1080| 0.2280 20137| 1.0210] 1.0310| 1.0400| 20559
2 |Pasco, wa " i i B : 2.0767] 2.1167 2.2367 ' : ’ 2.0560| 2.0761 2.0942
. 1.9763 2.0443| 2.0843| 2.2043 1.9763 2.0178| 2.0376] 2.0554
No. 1 2.5923] 0.0680| 0.1080 0.2280] 2.6603| 2.7003 2.8203 2.3900{ 1.0210] 1.0310 1.0400] 2.4402| 2.4641 2.4856
25222 2.5902| 2.6302 2.7502 2.5222 2.5752| 2.6004| 2.6231
1.9661| 1.9756] 2.0136
No. 2 1.9113] 0.0950( 0.1350| 0.2550 20063 20463 21663 1.8850( 1.0391| 1.0460 1.0510 195871 1.9717 1.9811 1.8997| 1.0350( 1.0400 1.0600 19662] 1.97571 20137
3 |Seattle, WA 1.8602 1.9552] 1.9952| 2.1152 1.8602 1.9329 1.9458 1.9551 1.8602 1.9353 1.9346| 1.9718
2.2680| 2.3080 2.4280 i 2.2431 2.3078
No. 1 1.9113] 0.0950{ 0.1350| 0.2550 20063 20463 21663 2.1619] 1.0391| 1.0460 1.0510 2.2464] 22613 2.2722 2.1569] 1.0400] 1.0500 1.0700 22432 226471 23079
2.1255 2.2205| 2.2605| 2.3805 _2.1255 2.2086] 2.2233| 2.2339 2.1255 2.2105] '2.2318] 122743
2.0523]
No. 2 1.9621| 1.0260f 1.0390 1.0460§ 20131l 2.0386] 2.0524
4 |Spokane, WA 1.8736 1.923 1.9467] 1.9598
2.4099
No. 1 2.3195| 1.0260| 1.0390 1.0460 23708 24100 24262
2.3045 2.3644| 2.3944| 2.4105
No. 2
5 |Tacoma, WA
No. 1
No. 2
6 |Other
No. 1
7 |the price ;bove) Additives: 0.0150 Additives: 27.00 Additives: 0.0200
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Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Petroleum Traders

SCHEDULE il Cougar Den Mansfield Energy
Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate - 2% Biodiesel Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate
oPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon oPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon oPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon
No Rack Fuel Type Average Full 400 Full i Average Full ~H0 Full =50 Average Full £709 Full %809
i yp 9 1/2 Load| Gallons 1/2 Load| Gallons 9 1/2 Load| Gallons 1/2 Load| Gallons 9 1/2 Load| Gallons 1/2 Load| Gallons
12/10/19 | Load Load 12/10/19 | Load Load 12/10/19 | Load Load
or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less
No. 2 1.9009| 0.0800{ 0.1000 0.1200] 1.9809| 2.0009 2.0209
1 |[Moses Lake, WA 1.9698 2.0498| 2.0698| 2.0898
No. 1
b et No. 2 2.0008| 0.0300] 0.0400 0.0500 2.0308| 2.0408 2.0508 2.0008] 0.1159| 0.2068 0.3700 21167 2.2076] 23708
2 . 1.9763 2.0063| 2.0163] 2.0263 1.9763 2.0922| 2.1831| 2.3463
No. 1 2.5828| 0.0400] 0.0500 0.0600] 2.6228| 2.6328 2.6428 2.5828| 0.1159| 0.2068 0.3700] 2.6987| 2.7896 2.9528]
2.5222 2.5622| 2.5722| 2.5822 2.5222 2.6381] 2.7290( 2.8922
No. 2 1.8997| 0.0825| 0.0925 0.1025 1.9822| 1.9922 2 0022
3 |Seattle, WA 1.8602 1.9427| 1.9527| 1.9627
No. 1
No. 2 1.9378| 0.1100{ 0.1300 0.1500 2.0478] 2.0678 20878
4 |Spokane, WA 1.8736 1.9836| 2.0036] 2.0236
No. 1 2.3145| 0.1100{ 0.1300 0.1500 24245 24445 24645
_2.3045 2.4145| 2.4345| 2.4545
No. 2 1.8878] 0.0825] 0.0925] 0.1025] 1.9703| 1.9803| 1.9903|
5 |Tacoma, WA 1.8333 1.9158| 1.9258| 1.9358
No. 1
No. 2
6 |Other
No. 1
bt e itives: 0.025 Additives: NIA Additives:
7 |into the price above) Additives: .0250 itives: ditives: 0.0150
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I . -'| m Vendor Name T Vendor Name Vendor Name
SCHEDULE IV Christensen Coleman Oil Connell Oil
WINTER Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate WINTER Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate WINTER Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate
il | oPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon oPIS + Multiplier Total Price Per Gallon oPIS + Multiplier Total Price Per Gallon
2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500
No. Rack Fuel Type Average Full ’ Full ; Average | Full ! Full . Average | Full ! Full !
12110119 Laad 1/2 Load| Gallons Load 1/2 Load| Gallons 12110118 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Load 1/2 Load| Gallons 12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Losd 1/2 Load| Gallons
or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less
No. 2
1 |Moses Lake, WA
No. 1
No. 2
2 |Pasco, WA
No. 1
No. 2
3 |Seattle, WA
No. 1
No. 2
4 |Spokane, WA
No. 1
oo M
No. 2 I....
5 |Tacoma, WA
No. 1
No. 2
6 |Other :I—
No. 1
ATANIVES, (IT Ot alreaqay aaaed Mo T e a:d T
7 |the price above) | Additives: N/A . Additives: o Additives:
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Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
SCHEDULE IV Cougar Den Mansfield Energy Petroleum Traders
WINTER Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate WINTER Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate - 2% Biodiesel WINTER Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate
OPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon oPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon OPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon
2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500
No. Rack Fuel Type Average Full ; Full ’ Average Full ¥ Full i Average Full ) Full 4
12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons bl 1/2 Load| Gallons 12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons o 1/2 Load| Gallons 12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Load 1/2 Load| Gallons
or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less
No. 2 1.8824] 0.1100] 0.1300( 0.1500f 1.9924| 2.0124| 2.0324
1 |Moses Lake, WA 1.8286 1.9386] 1.9586 1.9786]
No. 1
No. 2
2 |Pasco, WA
No. 1
No. 2
3 |Seattle, WA
No. 1
No. 2 1.9491] 0.1100] 0.1300 0.1500] 2.0591| 2.0791 2.0991
4 |Spokane, WA 1.8808 1.9908| 2.0108| 2.0308
No. 1
No. 2
5 |Tacoma, WA
No. 1
No. 2
6 |Other
No. 1
7 |into the price above) Additives: Additives: N/A Additives: N/A
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Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
SCHEDULE V Christensen Coleman Oil Connell Oil
RED DYED Ultra Low Sulfer Distillate - 2% Biodiesel RED DYED Ultra Low Sulfer Distillate RED DYED Ultra Low Sulfer Distillate - 2% Biodiesel At Times
+/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon + Multiplier Total Price Per Gallon + Multiplier Total Price Per Gallon
i 2,500 2,500 e 2,500 2,500 ki 2,500 2,500
Pl Fuel Type | Average | Full | .| b el Ful' |42 0ad| Galions | A¥erage | Full | ., cad| Gallons | FU" |12 Load| Gallons | A¥er29¢ | Full |41} oad| Gallons | P! (172 Load| Gallons
12/10/19 Load Load 12/10/19 | Load Load 12/10/19 | Load Load
or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less
No. 2 19009| 1.0190] 1.0280] 1.0360] 1.9370| 1.9541| 1.969
Moses Lake, WA 1.8556 1.8909| 1.9076] 1.9224
No. 1
No. 2 2.0137] 0.0790] 0.1190] 0.2390] 2.0927| 2.1327| 2.2527 7.0087| 1.0210] 1.0310] 1.0400] 2.0509| 2.0710]  2.0890
Pasco, WA 1.9850 2.0640| 2.1040( 2.2240 1.985 2.0267 gg;g: 2.0644
No. 1 2.3900] 0.0790| 0.1190| 0.2390 24690| 25000 2.6290 2.5923| 1.0210 1.0310| 1.0400 26467| 267271 2.6960
2.2775 2.3565| 2.3965| 2.5165 2.2775 2.3253| 2.3481} 2.3686
1.9739
No. 2 1.8967] 0.1100| 0.1500( 0.2700 20067 20467 2.1667 1.8997| 1.0391| 1.0460| 1.0510 19740l 19871 1.9966 1.8850] 1.0350( 1.0400| 1.0600f 1.9510 19604 1.9981
Seattle, WA 1.8538] 1.9638| 2.0038] 2.1238 1.8538 1.9263] 1.9391] 1.9483 1.8538 1.9187| 1.92808 1.9650)
2.2484
No. 1 2.1780] 0.1100| 0.1500| 0.2700 22880 23280 2.4480 2.1569| 1.0391| 1.0460| 1.0510 22412| 22561] 22669 2.1619] 1.0400| 1.0500| 1.0700 22484 22700| 2.3132
2.1305 2.2405| 2.2805| 2.4005 2.1305 2.2138| 2.2285| 2.2392 2.1305 2.2157| 2.2370] 2.2796]
1.9881
No. 2 1.9378| 1.0260| 1.0390| 1.0460, 19882| 2.0134| 2.9838
Spokane, WA 1.9073 1.9569| 1.9817] 1.9950
2.3746
No. 1 2.3145| 1.0260( 1.0390| 1.0460| 237471 2.4048| 2.4210
2.3095 2.3695| 2.3996| 2.4157|
No. 2 — -
Tacoma, WA
No. 1
No. 2
Other
No. 1
AT ; R ke ) AT
the price above) Additives: 0.0150 Additives: 27.00 Additives: 0.0200
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Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
SCHEDULE V Cougar Den Mansfield Energy Petroleum Traders
RED DYED Uitra Low Sulfer Distillate RED DYED Ultra Low Sulfer Distillate - 2% Biodiesel RED DYED Uitra Low Sulfer Distillate
oPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon oPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon OPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon
2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500
No. Rack Fuel Type Average Full ¢ Full ! Average Full Y’ Full : Average Full s Full ¥
12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Losd 1/2 Load| Gallons 12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Lond 1/2 Load| Gallons 12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Lkas 1/2 Load| Gallons
or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less
No. 2 19211] 0.0800{ 0.1000 0.1200] 2.0011| 2.0211 2.0411
1 |Moses Lake, WA 1.8556 1.9356) 1.9556] 1.9756
No. 1
No. 2 2.0061| 0.0600] 0.0750 0.0900f 2.0661| 2.0811 2.0961 2.0061] 0.0628 2.0689 2.0061] 0.1159| 0.1917 0.4100] 2.1220] 2.1978 2.4161
1.9850 2.0450/ 2.0600{ 2.0750 1.9850 2.0478 1.9850 2.1009| 2.1767] 2.3950
2 |Pasco, WA
No. 1 2.3775|] 0.0600] 0.0750 0.0900 24375| 2.4525 2.4675 2.3775] 0.0818 2 4593 2.3775] 0.1749] 0.2517 0.4500 25524] 26292 28275
2.2775 2.3375| 2.3525] 2.3675 2.2775 2.3593 2.2775 2.4524| 2.5292| 2.7275
No. 2 1.8850| 0.0825| 0.0925 0.1025 19675 1.9775 1.9875
3 |Seattle, WA 1.8538 1.9363] 1.9463] 1.9563
No. 1 2.1619] 0.0825| 0.0925 0.1025 2.2444| 2.2544 2.2644
2.1305 2.2130| 2.2230/ 2.2330
No. 2 1.9621] 0.1200] 0.1300 0.1500 20821] 2.0021 21121
4 |Spokane, WA 1.9073 2.0273| 2.0373| 2.0573
No. 1 2.3195] 0.1200{ 0.1300 0.1500 24395 2.4495 2 4695
2.3095 2.4295| 2.4395| 24595
srsmen o R, 1 W TN T SRR AR
No. 2 1.8902| 0.0825| 0.0925 0.1025] 1.9727| 1.9827 1.9927
5 |Tacoma, WA 1.8339 1.9164| 1.9264| 1.9364]
No. 1
No. 2
6 |Other
No. 1
ATUIIVES, (IT MOt alreaay agoed — e i,
7 |into the price above) Additives: 0.0250 Additives: N/A Additives: 0.0150
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Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

SCHEDULE VI Christensen Coleman Oil Connell Oil
WINTER RED DYED Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate WINTER RED DYED Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate WINTER RED DYED Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate
+/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon + Multiplier Total Price Per Gallon + Multiplier Total Price Per Gallon
Dpis 2,500 2,500 i 2,500 2,500 e 2,500 2,500
No. Rack Fuel Type Average Full g Full ; Average | Full : Full ¢ Average | Full g Full :
12110119 Lisied 1/2 Load| Gallons Load 1/2 Load| Gallons 12110119 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Cosil 1/2 Load| Gallons 1211019 | Load 1/2 Load| Gallons Lost 1/2 Load| Gallons
or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less
No. 2
1 |Moses Lake, WA
No. 1
No. 2
2 |Pasco, WA
No. 1
No. 2
3 |Seattle, WA
No. 1
No. 2
4 |Spokane, WA
No. 1
No. 2
5 |Tacoma, WA
No. 1
No. 2
6 |Other
No. 1
SCHEDULE VI Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)
1 |Per 55 Gallon Drum||s Drum Returnable Yes Yes Yes
Returnded Drum Deposit None 0.00 0.00
Per Gallon 2.15 412.50 1.09
Price Include Tote? Yes No Yes
2 |Totes Price to LEASE Tote N/A 20.00 a Month 0.00
Price to BUY Tote N/A 475.00 225.00
Size of Tote(s) 275 Gallon or 330 Gallon 330 Gallon 330 Gallon
Emergency Delivery Fee: !
For Delivery within 24 Hours 250.00 85.00 After Business Hours 0.00
Payment Discount / Terms: N/A N/A 0.00
Delivery Time: MAX 2 Business Days ARO MAX 2 Business Days ARO MAX 2 Business Days ARO
Freight FOB destination: Included Included Included
Comments:|DEF; Storage tanks and delivery is dependant on a number |Premium Unleaded Gasoline; 92 Octane not requested 91 octane. Credit Card; Connell Oil will charge a 2.5% admin. Fee.

of factors including size of tank requested.

Volume Verification; monitor readings are available and
may take place of stick readings unless requested in
advance.

Subcontractor(s); None.

Use of certified dispensing meters and delivery volumes not
temperatured corrected; Only on tank wagons.

Contractor to perform back-ground check on drivers used to
service this contract an provide to City/County; With driver's
permission. Subcontractor(s);
None.

Diesel; May contain up to 2% biodiesel at times.
Additives/Conditioners; Not included in price. Power Service will be
added per contact or request and billed separate.

Racks & Billing; Connell purchases off fixed forwards & rail car delivery
so all billing will be based off Seattle OPIS only.

Subcontractor(s); No
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Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
SCHEDULE VI Cougar Den Mansfield Energy Petroleum Traders
WINTER RED DYED Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate WINTER RED DYED Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate - 2% Biodiesel WINTER RED DYED Ultra Low Sulfur Distillate
oPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon OPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon oPIS +/- Price Differential Total Price Per Gallon
2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,500
i it Fuel Type | Average | Fun | o | S0 1 Ful | ) ol Gations | AVerage | Full 1) oal Gations | P [172 Load| Gallons | AYera88 | Full 1415} 5ad| Gallons | F". |4/2 Load| Gallons
12/10/19 | Load Load 12/10/19 | Load Load 12/10/19 | Load Load
or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less or Less
No. 2 1.9512] 0.1100f 0.1300 0.1500] 2.0612| 2.0812 2.1012]
1 |Moses Lake, WA 1.8858| 1.9958| 2.0158| _2.0358
No. 1
No. 2 2.0599] 0.0868 2.1467
2 |Pasco, WA
No. 1
No. 2
3 |Seattle, WA
No. 1
No. 2 1.9795] 0.1100] 0.1300] 0.1500] 2.0895] 2.1095| 2.1295
4 |Spokane, WA 1.9243| 2.0343| 2.0543| 2.0743
No. 1
No. 2
5 |Tacoma, WA
No. 1
No. 2
6 |Other
No. 1 md—
SCHEDULE ViI Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)
177.54 No Bid
Per 55 Gallon Tyt DI
1 Iorum Is Drum Returnable Yes
Returnded Drum Deposit 20.00 No Bid
Per Gallon 2.03 No Bid
Price Include Tote? Yes
2 |Totes Price to LEASE Tote N/A No Bid
Price to BUY Tote 200.00 No Bid
Size of Tote(s) 330 Gallons
Emergency Delivery Fee:
For Delivery within 24 Hours P 150,00
Payment Discount / Terms: 0.00 0.0045 Per Gallon
Delivery Time: MAX 2 Business Days ARO MAX 2 Business Days ARO MAX 2 Business Days ARO
Freight FOB destination: Included Included Included
Comments:|DEF Totes; There is not a charge to swap totes but, there is JAdditives/Conditioners; #1 blended is subject to terminal availability. [Volume Verification; Per addenda, metered trucks are no longer
a fee of $200 if a tote is damaged or not returned. Winterized premium dyed diesel provided if #1 isn't avaiable. rquired.
Subcontractor(s); Bretthauer Oil Subcontractor(s); None Subcontractor(s); Does not own it's own trucks. Uses Texstar Crude
Transport and other common carriers




