Project: Water Neter Covers, Lids and Rings
Bid Opening: July 26, 2021 @ 11:00 AM

AWARDING Bid Tabulatio )
Yoy 5

Project No.: 12112
Contract Term: 5-Years
Project Manager: Emilio Lopez, Water Distribution Supervisor

Approval: City Manager / Date
Contract Term: 8/75 /Z] O E/Z——/Zb

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE: Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
| recommend award of item No. 1 to General Pacific Inc., because their bid was the only
Iresponsive bid from a responsible bidder and award of items No. 2 & 3 to HD Fowler Co., because Goiiaikl Paciie Olvisilc Found
theirs was the rlc;mz responsive bid from g responsible bidder. Inc , HD Fowler Co. y plnc iy
\ 4 @Kﬂﬁﬁ 07/2.6/202/
= BUYER/DATE L
City ) i :
Item LER .| Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. St;ck i e i 90| tnis Price Price Price Price Price Price
10” No break Polypropylene polymer, Insert water meter lid for Yakima standard
and heavy-duty with ribbing reinforcement and Yakima stamp. ANSI Tier 15/H20 load . ; g
1 |#7501 rated. Nicor, Inc. #10.0LLBLKYAK1d03 100 | EA 51.00| 5,100.00] No Bid 0.00] No Bid 0.008
Prevailing Wage applies to this item
2 #7502 ;:a;vii::l)uty Vault Top meter rings. Material to comply with ASTMA 48 - Class 35 150 | EA 120.00| 18.000.00 65.88| 9.882.00 75.00 11,250.0%
Yakima standard water meter cover, with opening for smaller 10” Composite/Plastic
3 |#7384|Insert lid. Must fit Heavy-Duty Vault meter rings. Material to comply with ASTM A48 | 50 | EA | 130.00| 6,500.00f 64.12| 3,206.00] 74.00| 3,700.00
— CL30 B grey iron.
4 Bid aherfmte to Iltem 3. Please lpron.’.:de S.Dectﬁca{mns anid;or drc_zwmzs of product bid 150 | EA No Bid 000l No Bid 000l NoBid 0.00 F
Composite type traffic rated lid with 10 opening for insert lid.
Bid alternate to Item 1. Please provide specifications and/or drawings of product bid.
Composite type small 10” insert meter lid for Standard and or Heavy-Duty H-20
Loading meter lids. Lids must fit Heavy-Duty Vault meter rings with a maximum ' g ;
il
B clesfatice of 1/8” atound lid, Lid is % be 21 3/8" i overall outside diameter, Liduust| 0 | B | NoBid B "tk e e Q.00
also fit securely on 18” diameter sch. 40 PVC pipe.
Prevailing Wage applies to this item
Subtotal: 29,600.00 13,088.00 14,950.00
WA STATE SALES TAX - Destination Based @ 8.3%: 2,456.80 1,086.30 1,240.85
Freight FOB destination: INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
Grand Total Base Bid: 32,056.80 14,174.30 16,190.85
Payment Discount / Terms: 0% / Net 30 None 1% / Net 30
Delivery Time: 40 Days 40 Days 40.00
Discount Offered Off List Price For Items Not Listed: None None 10%
Comments:




