

AWARDING Bid Tabulation 12126S



Project: Unit-Price Electrical Services
 Bid Opening:
 Project No.: 12126S
 Contract Term: 3-Yrs with possible 1-Yr extension
 Project Manager: Randy Pitney

Randy Pitney
 Approval: City Manager/Date

Contract Term: DECEMBER 11, 2021 - DECEMBER 6, 2025

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:		Vendor Name	Vendor Name	Vendor Name	Vendor Name						
I recommend award of the highlighted section to Core Northwest, LLC., as they were the lowest responsive bid from a responsible bidder and the highlighted section to Knobel's Electric, Inc., as they were the only responsive bid from a responsible bidder. <i>Susan Kuehn</i> 11/19/2021 BUYER / DATE		Bigfoot Electric, LLC.	Core Northwest, LLC.	Knobel's Electric, Inc.	Titan Electrical, LLC.						
No.	Description	Qty.	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
	Electical Services Provided.			Low Voltage, Electrical Construction, Electric Vehicle Charging Station, Exterior Lighting, Interior Lighting		Low Voltage, Electrical Construction, Electric Vehicle Charging Station, Exterior Lighting, Interior Lighting, Panel Manufacturing & Upgrading, Street Lighting, Illuminated Signs, HVAC Wiring & Install		Low Voltage, Electrical Construction, Electric Vehicle Charging Station, Exterior Lighting, Interior Lighting, Panel Manufacturing & Upgrading, Street Lighting, Illuminated Signs, HVAC Wiring & Install, Traffic Sign Installation & Replacement, High Voltage, Power Line/Pole Construction & Relocation, Traffic Control Devices & Signals, Traffic Loop, High Voltage Electrical Testing, Transformer Maintenance & Repair		Low Voltage, Electrical Construction, Electric Vehicle Charging Station, Exterior Lighting, Interior Lighting, Panel Manufacturing & Upgrading	

AWARDING Bid Tabulation 12126S

No.	Description	Qty.	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
Labor - Regular											
1	Labor Rate per Hour by Licensed Electrician	1	HR	140.00	140.00	86.45	86.45	126.00	126.00	125.00	125.00
2	Labor Rate per Hour by Certified Apprentice	1	HR	140.00	140.00	86.45	86.45	98.00	98.00	105.00	105.00
3	Other (Listed Wage Classification(s) intended to be utilized on this contract)	1	HR	No Bid	0.00	75.00	75.00	116.00	116.00	No Bid	0.00
4	Other Unidentified Labor (if other labor classifications become necessary to complete this work). Indicate the % over prevailing wage rate to be charged.			No Bid %		18 %		20 %		No Bid %	
				Comments: 1st Hour of Labor \$280 - Minumin Trip if labor is under 7-hours.							
Labor - After Hours, Holidays, Overtime											
5	After normal business hours, holidays & overtime by Licensed Electrician	1	HR	220.00	220.00	146.84	146.84	215.00	215.00	250.00	250.00
6	After normal business hours, holidays & overtime by Certified Apprentice	1	HR	220.00	220.00	146.84	146.84	165.00	165.00	210.00	210.00
7	Other (Listed Wage Classification(s) intended to be utilized on this contract)	1	HR	No Bid	0.00	140.00	140.00	197.00	197.00	No Bid	0.00
8	Other Unidentified Labor (if other labor classifications become necessary to complete this work). Indicate the % over prevailing wage rate to be charged.			No Bid %		18 %		20 %		No Bid %	
				Comments: 1st Hour of Labor \$440 - Minumin Trip if labor is under 7-hours							
Labor - Emergency											
9	Labor Rate per Hour for emergency call out by Licensed Electrician	1	HR	220.00	220.00	86.45	86.45	215.00	215.00	125.00	125.00
10	Labor Rate per Hour for emergency call out by Certified Apprentice	1	HR	220.00	220.00	86.45	86.45	165.00	165.00	105.00	105.00
11	Other (Listed Wage Classification(s) intended to be utilized on this contract)	1	HR	No Bid	0.00	75.00	75.00	197.00	197.00	No Bid	0.00
12	Other Unidentified Labor (if other labor classifications become necessary to complete this work). Indicate the % over prevailing wage rate to be charged.			No Bid %		18 %		20 %		No Bid %	
				Comments: 1st Hour of Labor \$440 - Minumin Trip if labor is under 7-hours							

