Bid Tabulation
Project: YSO Uniforms - Officers and Clerical
Bid Opening: November 3, 2014 @ 11 am

Project No.: C11410

Contract Term:
RECOMMENDATION OF
AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:
Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
As time was of the essence in this solicitation, 911 Supply Blumenthals Blumenthals Alpha Parts & Supply, Chough, Inc dba
Chough, Inc cannot make delivery in time Keizer, OR Bid No. 1 Bid No. 2 Inc. dba Bratwear Extreme Products
specified and has been deemed non- Des Moines, WA Des Moines, WA Fife, WA Clackamas, OR
responsive. We recommend award to the most EXCEPTIONS non-responsibe bid
responsive bidder who bid all items which is
Alpha Parts & Supply Inc. dba Bratwear for
Schedule 1 and 2 based on being the most
responsive and responsible bid.
yer/Dal
SCHEDULE 1
No. Description Qty. | Unit | Unit Price | Total Price| Unit Price | Total Price| Unit Price | Total Price| Unit Price | Total Price| Unit Price [ Total Price
Horace Small Sentry Plus
wi/zipper, short-sleeved shirt,
1 SPRUCE GREEN - Model 253 | EA 38.65 9,778.45] 35.00 8,855.00] 20.00 5,060.00] 40.25 10,183.25| 35.85 9,070.05
M-HS1247/WHS 1404
Embroidered Name Tag,
2 |coLo 27| Ea 4.49 1,019.23 5.00 1,135.00 5.00 1,135.00 6.00 1,362.00 5.00 1,135.00
Sew on Customer Supplied
3 |Arm Patches 454 | EA 0.00 0.00 1.00 454.00 1.00 454.00 0.00 0.00 0.90 408.60)
|Badge Holder
4 227 | EA 0.00 0.00! 1.00 227.00 1.00 227.00 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00
Horace, Small Sentry Plus
wi/zipper, long-sleeveed
shirt, SPRUCE GREEN - 41.09 10,395.77| 37.25 9,424.25] 24.00 6,072.00 4225 10,689.25] 38.11 9,641.83
Models M-
5 |ﬂS1 147/WHS1403 253 | EA
Embroidered Name Tag,
s lcolp 227 | EA 4.49 1,019.23 5.00 1,135.00 5.00 1,135.00 6.00 1,362.00 5.00 1,135.00
Sew on Customer Supplied
7 |Arm Patches ass | Ea 0.00 0.00 1.00 454,00 1.00 454,00 0.00 0.00 0.90 408.60
8 |Badge Holder 227 | EA 0.00 0.00 1.00 227.00 1.00 227.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Fitting Service - on-site
measurements prior to 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00| 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
9 |ordering and final fitting
Schedule 1 Subtotal 2221268 21,911.25 14,764.00 23,596.50 21,799.08




RECOMMENDATION OF
AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
As time was of the essence in this solicitation, 911 Supply Blumenthals Blumenthals Alpha Parts & Supply, Chough, Inc dba
Chough, Inc cannot make delivery in time Keizer, OR Bid No. 1 Bid No. 2 Inc. dba Bratwear Extreme Products
specified and has been deemed non- Des Moines, WA Des Moines, WA Fife, WA Clackamas, OR
responsive. We recommend award to the most EXCEPTIONS non-responsibe bid
responsive bidder who bid all items which is
Alpha Parts & Supply Inc. dba Bratwear for
Schedule 1 and 2 based on being the most
responsive and responsible bid.
Buyer/Date
—_———
SCHEDULE 2
**If bidding brand other than
Bratwear, samples must be
submitted with bid
submittal*™ no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 94.00 5,640.001 no bid no bid
Traditional Pants with Ninja
Pocket, BLACK - Model P-
10 | TDO2NPB 60 | EA
**If bidding brand other than
Bratwear, samples must be
submitted with bid
?_‘::;?;:;Ial Pants with Ninja no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 94.00 20,210.00  no bid no bid
Pocket, PINK/TAN - Model
P-TDO2CPPT/PTDOZNPPT
11 215 | EA
Fitting Service - on-site
measurements prior to no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 0.00 0.00 no bid no bid
12 Jordering and final fitting s
Schedule 2 Subtotal 0.00 0.00 0.00 25,850.00 0.00
8.2% WSST: 1,821.44 1,796.72 1,210.65 4,054.61 1,787.52
Quote discount offered off list price for any
other items not specifically listed: 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 30%
Grand Total Base Bid: 24,034.12 23,707.97 15,974.65 53,501.11 23,586.60
Within 30 days after Within 25 days after Within 25 days after Within 30 days after Within 45-60 days after
Delivery receipt of order. receipt of order. receipt of order. receipt of order receipt of order.
Prompt Payment Discount 0 0 0 0 5% net 30
Exception Items: Shirt is
Cold Black Brand, but After first two (2) fitting

Extra Notes

No additional fees for
fitting appointments after
the first two (2).

same Specs - however
not available in Womens
short or long sleeve.

appointments, a $200 fee
will apply for fitting
appointment.
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