



# AWARDING QUOTE TABULATION & COMPARISON SHEET

**Project:** Bus Books  
**Quote Opening:** Friday, June 26, 2020 @ 11:00 AM  
**Project No.:** 22011  
**Department:** Transit  
**Project Manager:** Jessica Bland  
**Contract Term:** 1-Yr. with possible four 1-Yr. extension

*Maria Mayhue*  
 Maria Mayhue, Acting Purchasing Manager

07.13.2020 to 07.12.2025

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:			Vendor Name			
I recommend award of Options One to Yakima Herald Republic because they are the lowest responsive quote received from a responsible Bidder.  <i>Susan Knott 07.07.2020</i> BUYER/DATE:			Instant Press	Northwest Offset Printing	Print Guys	Yakima Herald Republic
			Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price
No.	Description	Qty.	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price	Total Price
OPTION ONE						
1	48 page Bus Book including a 4-page cover, printed 4-color process on all pages. Trimmed page size 7-1/4 inches x 9-7/8 inches. Inside pages printed on 41 lb. E-Brite or equivalent; cover printed on 68 lb. white gloss gook or equivalent. Saddle stitch binding. Plate-ready PDF files provided by customer.	15000 Books or Less	No Bid	Non-Responsive	\$8,462.45	\$5,055.00
2	52 page Bus Book including a 4-page cover, printed 4-color process on all pages. Trimmed page size 7-1/4 inches x 9-7/8 inches. Inside pages printed on 41 lb. E-Brite or equivalent; cover printed on 68 lb. white gloss gook or equivalent. Saddle stitch binding. Plate-ready PDF files provided by customer.	15000 Books or Less	No Bid	Non-Responsive	No Bid	No Bid
3	56 page Bus Book including a 4-page cover, printed 4-color process on all pages. Trimmed page size 7-1/4 inches x 9-7/8 inches. Inside pages printed on 41 lb. E-Brite or equivalent; cover printed on 68 lb. white gloss gook or equivalent. Saddle stitch binding. Plate-ready PDF files provided by customer.	15000 Books or Less	No Bid	Non-Responsive	\$9,300.00	\$5,635.00



OPTION TWO						
4	48 page Bus Book including a 4-page cover, printed 4-color process on all pages. Trimmed page size 7-1/4 inches x 9-7/8 inches. Inside pages printed on 41 lb. E-Brite or equivalent; cover printed on 68 lb. white gloss gook or equivalent. Saddle stitch binding. Plate-ready PDF files provided by customer.	15000 to 20,000 Books	No Bid	Non-Responsive	\$9,627.95	\$5,595.00
5	52 page Bus Book including a 4-page cover, printed 4-color process on all pages. Trimmed page size 7-1/4 inches x 9-7/8 inches. Inside pages printed on 41 lb. E-Brite or equivalent; cover printed on 68 lb. white gloss gook or equivalent. Saddle stitch binding. Plate-ready PDF files provided by customer.	15000 to 20,000 Books	No Bid	Non-Responsive	No Bid	No Bid
6	56 page Bus Book including a 4-page cover, printed 4-color process on all pages. Trimmed page size 7-1/4 inches x 9-7/8 inches. Inside pages printed on 41 lb. E-Brite or equivalent; cover printed on 68 lb. white gloss gook or equivalent. Saddle stitch binding. Plate-ready PDF files provided by customer.	15000 to 20,000 Books	No Bid	Non-Responsive	\$106,000.00	\$6,168.00
OPTION THREE						
7	48 page Bus Book including a 4-page cover, printed 4-color process on all pages. Trimmed page size 7-1/4 inches x 9-7/8 inches. Inside pages printed on 41 lb. E-Brite or equivalent; cover printed on 68 lb. white gloss gook or equivalent. Saddle stitch binding. Plate-ready PDF files provided by customer.	20,000 Books or More	No Bid	Non-Responsive	10,793.650	6,270.00
8	52 page Bus Book including a 4-page cover, printed 4-color process on all pages. Trimmed page size 7-1/4 inches x 9-7/8 inches. Inside pages printed on 41 lb. E-Brite or equivalent; cover printed on 68 lb. white gloss gook or equivalent. Saddle stitch binding. Plate-ready PDF files provided by customer.	20,000 Books or More	No Bid	Non-Responsive	No Bid	No Bid
9	56 page Bus Book including a 4-page cover, printed 4-color process on all pages. Trimmed page size 7-1/4 inches x 9-7/8 inches. Inside pages printed on 41 lb. E-Brite or equivalent; cover printed on 68 lb. white gloss gook or equivalent. Saddle stitch binding. Plate-ready PDF files provided by customer.	20,000 Books or More	No Bid	Non-Responsive	11,901.050	6,860.00

OPTION FOUR					
10	Price per page over 56 pages.	1 Each	No Bid	Non-Responsive	Not Applicable
WA State Sales Tax			Destination Based 8.3%	Destination Based 8.3%	Destination Based 8.3%
Shipping			Included Inside Delivery	Included Inside Delivery	Included Inside Delivery
Prompt Payment Discount					2% / 10 Days
Delivery					8-10 DaysAfter Approval of Proof
Discount Off Any Other Items or Services Not Specifically Listed Including Order Reprints			Not Applicable	Not Applicable	Not Applicable
Comments:			_____	_____	Trimmed page size is 7.25 inches by 9.875
					Bus book will be 48 + 4 cover pages and 56 + 4