Preliminary Bid Tabulation (

Project: Lids, Bottoms, Extensions, Valves, fittings, Couplings & Misc. - Water/Irrigation
Bid Opening: March 19, 2015 @ 2:00 PM

Project No.: 11511

Contract Term: 1yr. (with 4 possible additional 1yr. ﬁ ZO
Project Manager: Dave Brown, Water/Irrigation Mgr. Contract Term: W \q PEI L‘—'E\

Manager

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE: Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
| recommend award of Schedule 1-5, 7-12, 16, & 18-20 to H.D.
Fowler and Schedules 6, 10, 12-17 to H.D Supply Waterworks ”
based op theirs being the most respopsive. 4 0 l General Pacific HD Fowler HD Supply Waterworks
BuyerjDate j j
No. |[Description | [Qty.] Unit] Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price| Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
SCHEDULE 1 - - FIP X FIP GATE VALVES
Brand, Make, Model EJ, RW Valves, Flowmater M&H Valve, C509 Clow, 2639-F6103
Mé&H 4067, 2-inch SE gate valve, AWA, C509 non-
1 |rising stem, 2-inch squarc operating nut, open left, FIP| 5 | Each 256.00 1,280.00 260.31 1,301.55 261.68 1,308.40 0.00
X FIP ends. I
Schedule 1 - Subtotal; 1,280.00] 1,301.55 1,308.40 0.004
SCHEDULE 2 - - M] X M] GATE VALVES
Brand, Make, Model EJ, RW Valves, Flowmater M&H Valve, C509/C515 Clow, 2639-F6100

Mé&H C515, 3-inch gate valve, ductile iron body,
epoxy coated, bronze "O" ring sealed non-rising stem,
2 |2-inch square operating nut, open left operation, 4 | Bach 358.00 1,432.00§ 381.72 1,526.88) 400.94 1,603.76} 0.00§
mechanical joint by mechanical joint ends, less
accessories.

M&H C515, 4-inch gate valves: ductile iron body,
epoxy coated, bronze "O" ring sealed non-rising stem,
3 |2-inch square operating nut, open left operation, 4 | Each 360.00 1,440.00§ 390.00 1,560.00) 428.80 1,715.20 0.00§
mechanical joint by mechanical joint ends, less
accessories.

M&H C515, 6-inch gate valves ductile iron body,
epoxy coated, bronze "O" ring sealed non-rising stem ,
4 [2-inch square operating nut, open left operation, 4 | Each 444.00 1,776.00 544.32 2,177.28 547.17 2,188.68| O.UOF

mechanical joint by mechanical joint ends, less
accessories.

M&H C515, 8-inch gate valve ductile iron body,
epoxy coated, bronze "O" ring sealed non-rising stem ,
5  |2-inch square operating nut, open left operation, 4 | Each 712.00 2,848.00F 866.98 3,467.92 867.85 3,471.40 0.00§
mechanical joint by mechanical joint ends, less

accessories.

Mé&H C515, 12-inch gate valve, ductile iron body, 15.880.00 J
epoxy coated, bronze "O" ring sealed non-rising stem , 1,588.00 6,352.00
6  [2-inch square operating nut, open left operation, 4 | Each Should bis 1710.62 6,342.48r 1,719.58 6,878.32 0.00§
mechanical joint by mechanical joint ends, less
accessories.
Schedule 2 - Subtotal: 13,848.00§ 15,574.56 15,857.36} 0.008
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Ire”
Fo\

“mend award of Schedule 1-5, 7-12, 16, & 18-20 to H.D.
and Schedules 6, 10, 12-17 to H.D Supply Waterworks
based on theirs being the most responsive.

Buyer/Date

(
General Pacu..

SCHEDULE 3- - FLANGED X M] GATE VALVES

HD Fowler

HD Supply Waterworks

Brand, Make, Model

EJ, RW Valves, Flowmater

M&H Valve, C515

Clow, 2639-F6106

M&T C515, 4-inch gate valve, ductile iron body,
epoxy coated, bronze “O” ring sealed non-rising stem,
2-inch square operating nut, open left operation,
flanged by mechanical joint ends, less accessories.

Each 336.00 672.00 407.24

814.48

409.37

0.00J

M&H C515, 6-inch gate valve, ductile iron body,
epoxy coated, bronze “O” ring sealed non-rising stem,
2-inch square operating nut, open left operation,
flanged by mechanical joint ends, less accessories.

Each 465.00 930.00] 497.67

995.34

547.17

1,094.34

0.00’

M&H C513, 8-inch gate valve, ductile iron body,
epoxy coated, bronze “O” ring sealed non-rising stem,
2-inch square operating nut, open left operation,
flanged by mechanical joint ends, less accessories

Each 705.00 1,410.004 777.67

1,555.34

855.03

1,710.06

0.00J

10

M&H C515, 12-inch gate valve, ductile iron body,
epoxy coated, bronze “O” ring sealed non-rising stem,
2-inch square operating nut, open left operation,
flanged by mechanical joint ends, less accessories.

Each 1,432.00 1,432.00 1632.24

1,632.24

1,640.79

1,640.79

0.00

Schedule 3 - Subtotal;

4,444.00§

4,997.40§

4,445 19

0.00

SCHEDULE 4 - - FLANGED X FLANGED

DUCTILE IRON VALVES

Brand, Make, Model

No Bid M&H Valve, C509/C515

Clow, 2639-F6102

1

M&H C515, 3-inch gate valve, ductile iron body,
epoxy coated, bronze “O” ring sealed non-rising stem,
hand wheel, open left operation, flanged by flanged
ends.

Each O.DUF 378.44

2,270.64

380.42

2,282.52

0.004

12

M&H C515, 4-inch gate valve, ductile iron body,_
epoxy coated, bronze “O” ring sealed non-rising stem,
hand wheel, open left operation, flanged by flanged
ends.

Each 0.00F 422.92

1,691.68]

42513

1,700.52

0.00]

Schedule 4 - Subtotal 0.00

3,962.32

3,083.04

0.00

SCHEDULE 5 - - MJ X M] BUTTERFLY VALVES

Brand, Make, Model

No Bid M&H Valve, 150B

Clow, 4500

13

M&II C504, 12-inch butterfly valves, ductile iron
body, epoxy coated, 2-inch square operating nut, open
left operation, mechanical joint by mechanical joint
ends, less accessories.

Each 0.00J 1031.25

Z,OBZ.SOJ 1,310.99

2,621.98

0.00§

Schedule 5 - Subtotal 0.00§

2,062.50

2,621.98

0.00§
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I re” ~mend award of Schedule 1-5, 7-12,.16, & 18-20 to H.D. (
Fo and Schedules 6, 10, 12-17 to H.D Supply Waterworks -
hased on theirs being the most responsive. General Pac..w HD Fowler HD Supply Waterworks
Buyer/Date
S T S T e e
SCHEDULE 6- - TAPPING SLEEVES
*Nominal Pipe size provided for pricing purposes. Specific 0.D. size range to be determined at time of order
Brand, Make, Model No Bid Romac, FT5420 Romac, FTS420
6” x 4” Romac FTS420 Tapping Sleeve, Ductile . 974.64 a.0ol
14 Iron/Cast Iron O.D. x Branch Ductile Iron Flange. g | Essh S iy i By )
6” x 6” Romac FT5420 Tapping Slecve, Ductile
: .34 1,144.02 0.00
15 Iron/Cast Iron O.D. x Branch Ductile Iron Flange. 3[Rk 0.a0 aelis Lt =813
8” x 4” Romac FTS420 Tapping Sleeve, Ductile ) 7 1.061.01 0.00
18 | oniCastlfon O.D:x Branich Ductile Tton Flange. 2 | C o ek P |
8” x 6” Romac FTS420 Tapping Sleeve, Ductile sl .00l
17 Iron/Cast Iron O.D. x Branch Ductile Iron Flange. 4 | Bach f.004 446.81 176024 363.92 15808 ’
8” x 8” Romac FTS420 Tapping Sleeve, Ductile 1
: : ,A447.38] 0.00
L Tron/Cast Tron O.D. x Branch Ductile Tron Flange. g [ 0-00) SBilies L BRUEI i r
12”7 x 4” Romac FT15420 Tapping Sleeve, Ductile 769.56 0.00
12 Iron/Cast Iron O.D. x Branch Ductile Iron Flange. e || Gk e | Haas RAR.9a Rl )
12" x 6” Romac FT5420 Tapping Sleeve, Ductile | 40.98 0.00
2y Iron/Cast Iron O.D. x Branch Ductile Iron Flange. 4 8 HakiSE i 2040 w4l
12 x 8” Romac FTS8420 Tapping Sleeve, Ductile
¥ ; : 2. 2,131.56 0.00
21 [ron/Cast Iron O.D. x Branch Ductile Iron Flange. 4 [Fasb O'OOI S 2008 Eaee I I
12” x 12” Romac FTS420 Tapping Sleeve, Ductile : I 97 812.18 812 18| 0.00I
22 Iron/Cast Iron O.D. x Branch Ductile Iron Flange. 1| B . SR — a )
Schedule 6 - Subtotal] 0.00§ 12,438.37 10,717.01 0.004
SCHEDULE 7 - - TEES
Brand, Make, Model No Bid Tyler Union, C110/C153 Tyler Union
2y |3 Flange x 3" Flange x 3" Branch Flange Ductlle | ¢ | 5oy 0.00]  47.71 286.26]  67.59 405.54 0.00
Iron Tee (Cement Lined).
24 4" Flange x 4 .Flange x 4” Branch Flange Ductile Iron 6 Each 0.0ol 135 53 813.1 sr 134.11 804.66 0.00
Tee (Cement Lined).
25 6” Flange x 6 l*langc x 67 Branch Flange Ductile 2 | Bach 0.00] 169.14 338.28 169.14 338.28l 0.00§
Iron Tee (Cement Lined).
ge: |T MElBeX M EUps . FFRENERODI. | 4 | gy ooo| 187.03 187.03]  187.03 187.03 0.00
Tron Tee (Cement Lined).
6 Mechanical Joint x 6” Mechanical Joint x 6"
27 |Branch Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Tee (Cement 1 | Each 0.00§ 94.87 94.87 94.87 94.87 0.00§
Lined) less accessories.
8” Mechanical Joint x 8 Mechanical Joint x 87
28 |Branch Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Tee (Cement 1 Each 0.00§ 142.58 142.58) 142.58 142.58) 0.00§
Lined) less accessories.
8” Mechanical Joint x 4" Mechanical Joint x 8”
29 |Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Tee (Cement Lined) 1 | Each 0.00 102.46 102.46 102.46 102.46 O-UOI
less accessories. I
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| rt?r 'mend award of Schedule 1-5, 7-12, 16, & 18-20 to H.D. (
Fou and Schedules 6, 10, 12-17 to H.D Supply Waterworks \
based on theirs being the most responsive. General Paci .. HD Fowler HD Supply Waterworks
Buyer/Date
8” Mechanical Joint x 6" Mechanical Joint x 8~ J
30 |Mechanical Joint, Duetile Iron Tee (Cement Lined) 1 | Each 0.00§ 118.18 118.18] 118.18 118.18 0.00
less accessories.
127 Mechanical Joint x 12" Mechanical Joint x 12”
31 |Branch Mechanical Joint, Ductile Tron Tee (Cement 1 Each 0.00§ 284 .61 284.61 284.61 284.61 0.00
Lined) less accessories.
Schedule 7 - Subtotal; 0.00§ 2,367.45 2,478.21 0.00
SCHEDULE 8 - - BENDS
Brand, Make, Model No Bid Tyler Union, C110/C153 Tyler Union
gp |4 Bed MochaigllenbxMelinion ot |, | gy 000 3307 132.28] 3307 132.28) 0.00
Dugtile Iron (Cement Lined) less accessories.
33 |§43°Bend, Mechanical Joint x Mechanical Joint, | , | g, ooof 5313 106.26]  53.13 106.26 0.00
Ductile Tron (Cement Lined) less accessories.
ga |82 Beng, Michanied Joivt cMechntioalJliL, | o | g 000] 7753 155.06]  77.53 156.06 0.00
Ductile Iron (Cement Lined) less accessories.
gy |25 Bl MiChinica JombxMecharcaLIngt, | 5 | g o.00f 169.14 338.28]  169.14 338.28) 0.00]
Ductile Tron (Cement Lined) less accessories, r
gg || el Mechianallpptaiichatialiont: | 5 | gy 000 4012 40.12 40.12 40.12 0.00]
Ductile Iron (Cement Lined) less accessories.
37 6 -99 Bend, Meohanlc.al Joint x Mechan}.cal Joint, 1 Each 0.0l 65.60 65.60l 6560 65.60 0.00
Ductile Iron (Cement Lined) less accessories.
gg [0 o0 Dand, Msdmmel JomtxBlangeDuctliehon. | 4 | g, 000 4554 4554] 4554 45.54) 0.00
(Cement Lined) less accessories.
29 67-90 Be:?d, Mechanical Jogltxklangc Ductile Iron 1 Fach 0.00 81.32 81.32 81.32 81.32 o.00l
(Cement Lined) less accessories.
»_gne " i -
gn [0 P Hlanges Fauke DuchieTran (Beniett | o | g o.00f  47.71 286.26)  47.21 283.26 00|
Lined).
_ono : .
g | 20" Bond Flangeacklange. Duetielron(Conetl | o pam ooof 7427 445.62 74.27 44562 0.0]
Lined).
_ono : :
42 iinzg) Bend, Flaggsac Flange, BuctisIrao (Cameit | o | gaen 000f 11493 22086 11493 229.86 0.00
43 6‘-22 Ber.jd, Mechanical x Mechanical Ductile Iron 5 | Each 0. OOI 4879 97. 58' 48.79 9758 0.00
(Cement Lined).
Schedule 8 - Subtotal: 0.0DI 2,023.78' 2,020.78 0.00§
T
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Ire- mend award of Schedule 1-5, 7-12, 16, & 18-20 to H.D.
Fo. and Schedules 6, 10, 12-17 to H.D Supply Waterworks \
based on theirs being the most responsive. General Pacuw HD Fowler HD Supply Waterworks
Buyer/Date
SCHEDULE 9 - - ADAPTERS
Brand, Make, Model No Bid Tyler Union, C153 Tyler Union
44 3 Mechan.lcal Joint x 3 Fiar.tge Adapter, Ductile Tron 5 | Bach 0.00 3307 66.14 33.07 66.14 0.00
(Cement Lined) less accessories.
45 4 Mechan}cal Joint x 4 F]anlge Adapter, Ductile Iron > | Bach 0.00 3795 75.90 37.95 75.90l o.00l
(Cement Lined) less accessories.
46 6 Mechan.wal Joint x 6 Fla:?ge Adapter, Ductile Iron o | Bach o000l 52 59 105.18l 52 59 105.184 0.0Di
(Cement Lined) less accessories.
47 8 Mechan}ca] Joint x 8 Fla_nlge Adapter, Ductile Iron 2 | Bach 0.00 79,69 159.38} 7969 15938’ 0.00
(Cement Lined) less accessories.
ag |\ Didiadical Joun L12° Mt pebtopor. DUetlE | 5 | gy o00] 177.81 177.81] 17781 177.81 0.00
Iron (Cement Lined) less accessories. l
Schedule 9 - Subtotal: 0.00] 584.41 584.41 0.00
SCHEDULE 10 - - COMPANION FLANGE
Brand, Make, Model No Bid Tyler Union, C110 Tyler Union
3” Ductile Tron, 4-bolt hole Companion Flange, 7-
’ ; 59.20 0.00§
49 1/2” O.D. Tapped 1-1/2” LP. Thread (125%). 4 | Each 0.00§ 43.37 173_48J 14.80
4" Ductile Iron, 8-bolt hole Companion Flange, 9"
; : 49.64 0.00
50 O.D. Tapped 2" LP. Thread (1254). 6 | Each 0.00I 49.87 299.22 24.94 149 I
51 |4" Blind Flange x 2" FIPT Tap 4 | Each 0.00I 49.87 199.48] 50.40 201 .60' 0.00
52 |4" Blind Flange 4 | Each 0.00I 34.16 136.64 50.40 201 .GOI 0.00
Schedule 10 - Subtotal] 0.00] 808.82 612.04 0.00
SCHEDULE 11 - - HYMAX
Brand, Make, Model No Bid HYMAX #2000-0303-260 HYMAX, Hymax Coupling
53 [2" Style Hymax (2.10-3.03) 4 | Each 0.00I 82.09 328.36' 87.64 350.56 0.00
Schedule 11 - Subtotal: _ 0.00§ 328.36| 350.56 o.qol
SCHEDULE 12 - - COUPLINGS
Brand, Make, Model No Bid Romac, 501 Romac, 501
3" Style "501" Romac Coupling (3.50 x 4.00) (1-
54 [ROS501MRS9, 2-RO501ERRS9, 2-R0O501G400, 4- 4 | Each 0.00 63.84 255,36 65.73 262.92 0.00F
RO501B2X10).
16" Style "501" - Romac (17.80 x 17.80) Straight
55 |Coupling (17.40 x 17.80) range Ductile Iron, Yellow | 1 [ Each 0.00! 452.10 45210 375.45 375.45| 0.00
Shopcoat, Stainless Steel nuts and bolts. F
Schedule 12 - Subtotal: 0.00 707.46] 638.37 0.00}
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Ire- ymend award of Schedule 1-5, 7-12, 16, & 18-20 to H.D. y
Fo and Schedules 6, 10, 12-17 to H.D Supply Waterworks \
based on theirs being the most responsive. General Pacu.. HD Fowler HD Supply Waterworks
Buyer/Date E
G S e S S R T e e L e e L
SCHEDULE 13 - - MACROS
Brand, Make, Model No Bid Romac, Macro Romac, Macro HP
4" Macro 2-Bolt Coupling (4.40 - 5.60) NBR Gasket J
56 |Inner Gasket Range (4.40 - 5.05) Outer Gasket Range Each 0.00§ 154.68 928.08] 145.77 874.62 0.00
(4.95-5.60)
6" Macro 2-Bolt Couplings (6.60-7.60) NBR Gasket
57 |Inner Gasket Range (6.60-7-15) Outer Gasket Range Each 0.00} 204.12 1,224.72 192.37 1,154.22 0.00
(7.10-7.60)
8" Macro 2-Bolt Coupling (8.60-9.75) NBR Gasket
58 |Inner Gasket Range (8.60-9.20) Outer Gasket Range Each 0.00 231.16 924.64 218.99 875.96’ 0.00F
(9.10-9.75) F
10" Macro 2-Bolt Coupling (10.70-11.30 NBR
59 |Gasket Inner Gasket Range (10.70-11.30) Outer Each 0.00 299.00 299.00P 283.26 283.26 O-OUF
Gasket Range (11.25-11.90)
12" Macro 2-Bolt Coupling (12.70-13.30) NBR J J
60 |Gasket Inner Gasket Range (12.70-13.30) Outer Each 0.00§ 351.90 351.90 329.91 329.91 0.00
Gasket Range (13.15-13.80)
Schedule 13 - Subtotal: 0.00§ 3,728.34 3,517.97 0.00§

SCHEDULE 14 - - REPAIR CLAMPS

*Nominal pipe size provided for pricing purposes. Unit Pricing Consists of every clamp within the normal pipe size (0.D. size range) X length. All clamp sizes to be per Romac §S1 chart standard 0.D. size ranges.
Specific 0.D. size range to be determined at time of order.

Brand, Make, Model No Bid Romac, 551 Romac, §51, OD Xlength
61 z;’;“gcsél s 50_'3 ¥ é‘)sfzf’,i_ﬁ"’d epgm e follewne Bach 0.00] 5918 118.36] 4156 83.12 0.00
R e Fach ooo] 7314 14628] 5136 102.72 0.00
63 gg:i‘f,s(i’_tﬁ'?gz)szegff%d et el ane Each ooof 6611 26444 4594 183.76f 0.00]
64 ig;nics(izso?&; = L Fach ooof 8250 33000f  57.92 231.69) .00}
65 2‘7’:‘3‘“‘3(314505’365‘)52";5"‘1 lexigth in the following Bech 0.00] 131.04 131.04 92.01 92.01 0.00}
66 5::11""3(3250?6%?‘??“ lengthininetelowiog Bach 0.00] 14570 14570 1023 102.30 0.00}
67 z;’ ! s(ssl.ég):r;.. ;‘O&;p;‘;if‘:d Meigiis e Eollowing Each ooof 8229 164.58 57.79 115.58| 0.00
68 |Somee S(S;; 50_'?'8’8)5 S Each ooof 9872 39488  69.32 277.28) 0.00§
69 i‘z’;“aﬁcs(sslg?g;‘;)p:cg“’d e Each ooo 15762 94572]  110.11 660.66 0.00
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I re- “mend award of Schedule 1-5, 7-12, 16, & 18-20 to H.D. 4 :
Fo.  and Schedules 6, 10, 12-17 to H.D Supply Waterworks \
based on theirs being the most responsive. General Paci. HD Fowler HD Supply Waterworks
Buyer/Date
Romac 881, O.D. x specified length in the following .
2 : : 366.24 0.00j
70 size: 67 (5.95 - 7.80) x 167, 3 | Each 0.00 173.84 521.52 122.08
7y |SamasSal O borspeeiicd lengihinthefollowtng | o | g,y ooo] 9668 193.36 67.87 135.74 0.00}
size: 87 (7.95-9.70) x 67,
79 RomaiSSl, 0D.x specf‘ied length in the following 2 | Bach o.00l 115.68 23136 81.21 162.42 .00l
size: 8” (7.95-9.70) x 8”.
Romac 881, O.D. x specified length in the following
; ; ) 60.72 0.00§
73 size: 8 (7.95-9.70) x 127 2 | Each 0.00§ 185.64 371.28 130.36 2
qq |[OSGEBT, ORIY ¥ specii gt Ve Ol0W | 5 | gask 0.00f 21214 42428]  148.96 207.92 0.00}
size: 87 (7.95-9.70) x 16”.
Romac S81, O.D. x specified length in the following ) 393,64 o.00l
75 size: 127 (12.10 - 14.50) x 127 2 | Each 0.00§ 280.29 560.58 196.82 : .
Romac 881, O.D. x specified length in the following - 445.08 0.00
76 size: 127 (12.10 - 14.50) x 167, 2 ] Each 0.00I 316.93 633.86 222.54 : . I
Schedule 14 - Subtotal 0.00§ 5,577.24 3,910.87 0.00§
SCHEDULE 15 - - REDUCERS
Brand, Make, Model No Bid Tyler Union, C110 Tyler Union
77 4 Mechan'ical Joint x 3 Flar.age Reducer, Ductile Tron 6 | Each 0.00 116.81 700.861 61.84 371.04 0.00§
{Cement Lines) less assessories
78 8" Mcchan.ical Joint x 6" Flan.ge Reducer, Ductile Tron > | Each O.UOJ 161.55 323.10 16155 323.10 0.00
(Cement Lined) less accessories.
vy {32 Meddionigl ot MR ElaiieBedudtn Distlle | o | gy o.00f 60857  1217.14] 13119 262.38) 0.00
Iron (Cement Lines) less accessories. I I
Schedule 15 - Subtotal; 0.00] 2,241.10 956.52 0.00
SCHEDULE 16 - - SLEEVES
Brand, Make, Model No Bid Tyler Union, C153 Tyler Union
6" Mechanical Joint x Mechanical Joint Long Pattern J
80 [Solid Repair Sleeve, Ductile Iron (Cement Lined) less | 2 | Each 0.00 59.09 118.18 44 .45 88.90) 0.00
acCessories.
6" Mechanical Joint x Mechanical Joint Short Pattern
81 [Solid Repair Sleeve, Ductile Iron (Cement Lined) less | 4 | Each 0.00§ 44.45 177.80} 59.09 236.36 0.00§
accessories.
8" Mechanical Joint x Mechanical Joint Long Pattern J
82 |Solid Repair Sleeve, Ductile Iron (Cement Lined) less | 2 | Each 0.00§ 97.04 194.08 58.01 116.02 0.00
accessories.
8" Mechanical Joint x Mechanical Joint Short Pattern _
83 [Solid Repair Sleeve, Ductile Iron (Cement Lined) less | 4 | Each O.DOr 58.00 232.00F 97.04 388.16 0.004
accessories.
12" Mechanical Joint x Mechanical Joint Long Pattern
84 |Solid Repair Sleeve, Ductile Iron (Cement Lined) less [ 2 | Each 0.00 156.13 312.26 156.13 312.26 O.UOI
acCessories.
Schedule 16 - Subtotal] 0.00 1,034.32 1,141.70] 0.00
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Ire mend award of Schedule 1-5, 7-12, 16, & 18-20 to H.D. /
Fo and Schedules 6, 10, 12-17 to H.D Supply Waterworks L
based on theirs being the most responsive. General Paciw HD Fowler HD Supply Waterworks
Buyer/Date
SCHEDULE 17 - - ACCESSORY PACKS, M] EACH JOINT RESTRAINERS
Romac, Grip Ring, Roma
Erard;Maje, Model No Bid Grip, 600 Series Romac, Romagrip & 611
3" Romac Grip Accessory Pack (incl. Romagrip 1 |
85 gasket. nuts & T-bolts) Romac Part #248-03 5 | Each 0.00§ 26.46 132.30 2493 124.65 .
4" Romac Grip Ring Accessory Pack for Ductile Iron | - 0.00
86 Pipe and C-900, Catalog #4" GRAP-DIL. 20 | Each 0.00 32.60 652.00 30.56 611.20§ ;
6" Romac Grip Riong Accessory Pack for Ductile . | 0.00
87 Tron Pipe and C-900, Catalog #6 GRAP-DL. 70 | Each 0.008 37.90 2,653.00r 35.53 2,487.10 :
8" Romac Grip Ring Accessory Pack for Ductile Tron o.00l
88 Pipe and C-900, Catalog #8 GRAP-DI. 30 | Each 0.00§ 54.02 1,620.60) 50.65 1,519.50' :
12" Romac Grip Ring Accessory Pack for Ductile 0.00
89 Tron Pipe and C-900, Catalog #12" GRAP-DL 10 | Each 0.00 105.74 1,057.404 99.14 991.40 ; r
4" Romac Style 611 Bell & Spigot Pipe Restraint 0.00
90 System for PVC and Ductile Tron Pipe Joicits 3 | Each 0.00 30.87 119.61 37.77 113.31 ;
6" Romac Style 611 Bell & Spigot Pipe Restraing o.0ol
2 System for PVC and Ductile Iron Pipe Joints. 18 || et — el 09 H2.58 743'4% '
8" Romac Style 611 Bell & Spigot Pipe Restraing 0.00
4e System for PVC and Ductile Iron Pipe Joints. o G.UOI agar 58556 S0 i ’ I
Schedule 17 - Subtotal 0.00f 7,713.32 7,233.04 0.00
SCHEDULE 18- - FIELD FLANGE - UNI-FLANGE
] Romac, Piranha Ford 5 :
Brand, Make, Model No Bid Mater Box: Serles 300 Tyler Union, Uni Flange
93 |3" Field Flange 2 | Each D.OOI 25.92 51.84 41.30 82.60 0.00I
94 14" Field Flange 2 | Each O.UOI 33.83 67.66) 58.22 116.44 O.GDI
95 |6" Field Flange 2 | Each 0.00I 39.33 78.66) 62.35 124.70 U-OOI
96 |8" Field Flange 2 | Each ooof 6941 13882] 7327 146.54 0.00f
97 |12" Field Flange 2 | Bach 0.00I 159.81 319.62 183.09 366.18 D.OOI
98 |3" Field Lock Gasket 2 | Each 0.00I 42.78 85.56' 33.15 66.30 O-UOI
99 |4" Field Lock Gasket 2 | Each 0.00I 37.90 75.80' 37.08 74.1 6' 0.00
100 (6" Field Lock Gasket 2 | Each O.DOI 54.25 108.50 66.51 133.02 0.00|
101 |8" Field Lock Gasket 2 | Each 0.00 72.49 144.98' 88.52 177.04 O.GOI
102 [12" Field Lock Gasket 2 | Each 0.00I 119.04 238.08' 116.52 233.04 0.00l
Schedule 18 - Subtotal: 0.00] 1,309.52 1,520.02 0.00§
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-'mend award of Schedule 1-5, 7-12, 16, & 18-20 to H.D.
and Schedules 6, 10, 12-17 to H.D Supply Waterworks
based on theirs being the most responsive.

Buyer/Date

General Pacu..

SCHEDULE 19 - - VALVE BOX PARTS - CAST IRON (Domestic/Imports

HD Fowler

3

HD Supply Waterworks

Brand, Make, Model No Bid I Olympic Foundry, 940 Olympic Foundry, 940

103 |Valve Box Tops 8" 940 Top (Irrigation) Domestic 25 | Each O_OOI 28.50 712.50 0.00 0.00i
103-A [Valve Box Tops 8" 940 Top (Irrigation) Import 25 | Each 0.00] 1574 393.50]  18.21 455,25 0.00)

104 |Valve Box Tops 18" 940 Top Cast Iron, Domestic | 25 | Each 000 4284 1,071.00f 4560 1,140.00} 0.00

104-A |Valve Box Tops 18" 940 Top Cast Iron, Import 25 | Each O.DOI 22.74 568.50| 25.83 645.75 0.00

105 |Valve Box Bottoms - 36" Cast Iron, Domestic 25 | Each ooof 67.06 1,676.50]  74.46 1,861.50 0.00

105-A | Valve Box Bottoms - 36" Cast Iron, Import 25 | Each 0.00' 25.74 643.50l 36.13 903.25 0.00
106 [0 08 round B writh “Water logo= 00808 | ag gk o.ool 14.58 36450] 1535 383.75 0.0

106-A i‘;g‘:‘y: v i with "Ware logo -MOBIIE- | | Bk o.ool 8.42 210.50 9.78 244 50 0.00

107 ggm(i’;:ﬁ wgunid fid withYigation; logo-JA0SIR: | o, | ey e.ooI 16.15 403.75 o_ool 0.00
107-A IL[;‘;(?I:’Y: colind et vt “Reiganon™ Lot ~SMUBHIE | o | aks o.ool 10.16 254.00' 9.78 244.50I 0.00f

108 |12" Extension Cast Iron, Domestic 16 | Fach 0.00 69.06 1,035.90] 0.00 0.00

108-A | 12" Extension Cast Iron, Import 15 | Each 0.00 24.95 374.25] 2821 423.15 0.00

109 |18" Extension Cast Iron, Domestic 1 Each 0.00I 71.01 71.01 0.00' 0.00
109-A | 18" Extension Cast Tron, Import 1 | Each U.OOI 71.01 71.01 0.00F 0.00§

Schedule 19 - Subtotal: 0.00] 7.850.42 6,301.65 0.00

SCHEDULE 20- - PAVING RISERS - CAST IRON
Brand, Make, Model No Bid I Olympic Foundry, 940 I Olympic Foundry, 940

110 [1" Drop in Paving Riser Cast Iron 1 | Each 0.00f 13.16 13.16' 18.18 18.18 0.00
111 |2" Drop in Paving Riser Cast [ron 1 | Eash 0.00 19.32 19.32 21.59 21.59 0.06'
112 |2 1/2" Drop in Paving Riser Cast Iron 1 | Each 0.00 22.84 22.84 25.00 25,00} 0.00I
Schedule 20- Subtotal 0.00] 55.32 64.77 0.00]

Subtotal: $19,572.00] $76,666.56 $70,263.89 $0.00

Freight - FOB Destination: INCLUDED INCLUDED TNCLUDED INCLUDED
8.2% WSST: $1.604.90 $6,286.66 $5,761.64 $0.00]
Grand Total: $21,176.90 $82,953.22 $76,025.53 $0.00
Payment Discount/Terms: 0 0 0
Delivery Days: 10 Days 21 Days 10 Days
Comments fpssed on uanttyshown. LTSRS | amatactuo stock avatabiy.
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