Bid Tabulation

Project: Manholes, Rings, Catch Basins, Covers & Grates =1 _ _

Bid Opening: June 27,2013 @ 2 p.m. A e =,
Project No.: 11326 ity Manage Date B

Contract Term: Five Years
Project Manager: Shelley Willson/\Waste Water Collections Contract Term

|

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE: Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
| recommend award to HDSupply Waterworks, General Pacific HD Supply Waterworks
based on Em:.m being the lowest responsive and *Non-Responsive* (Quoting EJIW)
iy Dinie, 4_:, E
BUYER UDATE
No. Description _02._ Unit] Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price| Unit Price | Total Price| Unit Price | Total Price
1 Locking, hinged manhole ring and lid with
LOGO. Sizes:
1inch by 25 1/4 in. diameter 1 lea
by 6 in. ring 536.65 629.60
1 inch by 25 1/4 in. diameter 1 lea
by 4 in. ring 513.12 597.86
1inch by 25 1/4 in. diameter 1 EA
by 2 in. ring N/Q NO BID
2 Locking, hinged manhole ring and lid with
LOGO. Sizes:
1 inch by 25 1/4 in diameter 1 | Ea
by 6 in ring 536.65 629.60
1 inch by 25 1/4 in diameter 1 | Ea
by 4 in ring 513.12 597.86
1 inch by 25 1/4 in diameter 1 EA
by 2 in ring N/Q NO BID
3 |Manhole Lid ONLY no LOGO. Sizes:
1inch by 25 1/4 in diameter 1 EA
218.95 201.44
4 Manhole Lid ONLY with
LOGO. Sizes:
1inch by 25 1/4 in diameter 1 |l ea
250.73 243.68
5 |Slotted Manhole Lid. Sizes:
21 1/2 in diameter by 1 1/4 in 1 | Ea
thick N/Q 213.85




AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

| recommend award to HDSupply Waterworks,

_rmwmn_ on theirs being the lowest responsive and

responsible bid received.

BUYER / DATE

General Pacific
*Non-Responsive*

HD Supply Waterworks
(Quoting EJIW)

No.

Description

Qty.

Unit

Unit Price | Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

25 in diameter by 1 in thick

._

EA

257.67

253.21

Catch Basin Grate. Cast or Fabricated
Galvanized Steel Grates Sizes:

Diagram A

211/2inby 15 3/8 in by 1
1/4 in.

220.05

202.45

215/8in. by 15 3/8 in by 1
1/4 in

T

220.05

202.45

211/2inby 15 1/4 in by 1
3/8 in

220.05

202.45

Diagram B

16 1/2 in by 21 5/8 in by 1
3/8in

EA

306.47

319.05

211/2inby 151/2in by 1
3/8in

170.00

134.92

22 1/2in by 16 1/2 in by 1
7/8 in

2

217.06

198.42

213/8inby 15 3/8 in by 1
3/8in

306.47

319.05

Diagram C

237/8in by 19 7/8 in by 1
1/2 in

181.89

150.97

Diagram D

15 1/4in by 15 1/4 in by 1
3/8in

224 .15

207.98

Diagram E

16 1/2 in by 21 5/8 in by 1
3/8 in

306.47

319.05

151/2inby 21 1/2in by 1
3/8in

170.00

134.92

16 1/2in by 22 1/2 in by 1
7/8in

EA

217.086

198.42

15 3/8 in by 21 3/8 in by 1
3/8 in

EA

170.00

134.92

7 .>oommm Cover. Size:




Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:
| recommend award to HDSupply Waterworks,
based on theirs being the lowest responsive and
responsible bid received.

General Pacific
*Non-Responsive*

HD Supply Waterworks
(Quoting EJIW)

BUYER / DATE
No. Description Qty. | Unit] Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
313/8inby 17 5/8 in by 1 1 | Ea
3/8in 24471 235.71
8 |Sewer Cleanouts - Lids and Rin Sizes:
1in by 12 in diameter by 2 in 1 | Ea
ring N/Q NO BID
1 inch by 12 in diameter by 4 1 EA
in ring 155.02 107.87
1 inch by 12 in diameter by 6 1 | ea
in ring N/Q NO BID
9 |Sewer Cleanouts - No Ring. Size:
1inch by 12 in diameter 1 | EA 164.81 120.28
Similar Items not Specifically Shown. 5
10 Amount of Discount: NQ 3%
FREIGHT: FOB Destination:
204 W. Pine, Yakima, WA 98902 INCLUDED INGLUOED
Subtotal: 6,321.15 6,556.01
8.2% WSST: 518.33 537.59
Grand Total Base Bid: 6,839.48 7,093.60
45 Working Days /6to 8
Delivery Days: 30-60 Days weeks to manufacture
new items.
Payment Terms: 0 0%, Net 25

Comments:

No bid - items 1,25 & 8

All items with NPR numbers
are fabricated grates, not
cast iron, or ductile iron
materal. Pricing expires
9/1/14. No Bid - items 1,2&8
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