Bid Tabul
Project:

ation
Car Wash Services

Bid Opening: 7/11/13 @ 2pm
Project No.:
Project Manager:

11327

Various Departments

A

City Manager

Contract .?._.SHJMS/\M m..__w_.: _m1 i Tu?md

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

VendorName | __ VendorName | _ VendorName | __ VendorName | __ VendorName |
| recommend award to all bidders, based on all Auto Spa Classic Auto Wash GTO Splash Express Walker Wash Inc
being responsive and responsible. | further dba Desert Sun Car
recommend that each City/County department
make the selection as to which car wash will be Wash
the best value & convenience to their individual
locatiop.

_ 1124)\3
BUYER / DAT,
Total Price . Total Price . . Total Price . Total Price . Total Price
No Description Qty.| unit Unit Price (not incl. tax) Unit Price (not incl. tax) Unit Price (not incl. tax) Unit Price (not incl. tax) Unk Price (not incl. tax)
Schedule |
Basic Wash: Sedans, Mini-
1 [Vans, Trucks and SUV's: 1 | EA 6.00 5.50 6.47 5.00 NO BID
EXTERNAL WASH ONLY
Basic Wash: Extended Cab
2 |Trucks, Vans and Suburban's: | 1 | EA 6.00 5.50 6.47 5.00 NO BID
EXTERNAL WASH ONLY
Schedule Il - 24 Hour Access
Basic Wash: Sedans, Mini- _
1 |Vans, Trucks and SUV's: 1 | EA 6.00 5.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXTERNAL WASH ONLY
Basic Wash: Extended Cab
2 |Trucks, Vans and Suburban's: | 1 | EA 6.00 5.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXTERNAL WASH ONLY _
Schedule lll - TOPPENISH - 24 Hour Access (or within 10 mile radius of Toppenish 98948)
Basic Wash: Sedans, Mini-
1 |Vans, Trucks and SUV's: 1 | EA *6.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.50
EXTERNAL WASH ONLY
Basic Wash: Extended Cab
2 |Trucks, Vans and Suburban's: | 1 | EA *6.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.00
EXTERNAL WASH ONLY
Tax Rate: 8.2% 8.2% 8.2% 8.1% 7.9%




" AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

_VendorName

|____Vendor Name

Vendor Name

_Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Walker Wash Inc

| recommend award to all bidders, based on all Auto Spa Classic Auto Wash GTO Splash Express
being responsive and responsible. | further dba Desert Sun Car
recommend that each City/County department
make the selection as to which car wash will be Wash
the best value & convenience to their individual
location.
BUYER / DATE
Vehicles will be washed in our |Pre-Wash, soft cloth wash, 1. Heated foam pre-soak; 2. Automatic wash, rinse, dry. We
automatic car wash. Pre soak [rinse, dry Foaming tire & wheel cleaner; 3. Juse premium brush or brushless
for bugs, a soap pass, rinse [High pressure wash; 4. Softn  |machines-Driver decides.
What does the basic wash include?: __umww. clear coat pass & on foamy wash; 5. Triple foam
board dryer. cleaner; 6. Heated blow dry; 7.
|Free vacuum use self serve.
Self service 5 bays $2 for 4 Jmmmm_:_m_ wash-basic + tri foam |1. Rubber & carpet mat Premium upgrade $7.50-
minutes. Vacuum's (12/$1 -4  |$8.78; VIP Wash - Essential + |shampoo & cleaning (self serve) Jincludes: Automatic wash,
mins.) rain-x total body protectant *$4.50 incl. tax; 2. Various car [rinse, dry with a hot wax
$10.63; Ultimate - VIP + hot wax|care cleaning . application to exterior & under
w/ carnauba + wheel + tire shine|items/refreshments (vending) [car wash that includes
$16.17; Detailing services .75 4.50 incl. tax durashield protectant that
Other Optional Services & Rates: exterior/interior price TBD per cleans & seals the exterior &
vehicle condition. underside of vehicle against
mag. Chloride/road deicer &
salts. Tire & wheel brush
cleaners, blow dry. Application
of wax protectant.
Will professional biodegradable car wash Yes Yes Vism Yos Ves
soaps/detergents be used?
Do you treat and/or recycle wash water?: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
_um__cmé,.lmm,a from which work will commence upon :
award of contract at prices and terms specified unless 2 Days 1 Day (Immediately) 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day
Payment Terms: 0% 0% 0% 0%, 30 Days 0%, 30 Days




* AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

—Vendor Name

| recommend award to all bidders, based on all

being responsive and responsible. | further

recommend that each City/County department
make the selection as to which car wash will be

the best value & convenience to their individual

location.

BUYER / DATE

Auto Spa

____Vendor Name ___

Classic Auto Wash

GTO

Splash Express

| VendorName | __ Vendor Name

Walker Wash Inc
dba Desert Sun Car
Wash

Comments:

*Cannot bid schedule IlI-They
are not within a 10 mile radius off
Toppenish, WA. Noted
on signature sheet, pg. 7, basic
wash regular $8, bid submittal
$6.

All wash packages come with
unlimited self-serve vacuum use
at no additional charge. Serving
Yakima for over 25 years, GTO
offers professional service an is
open 7 days a week. With the
completion of our remodel in
July 2013, we have the newest,
state of the art car wash

emphasis on water & energy
conservation.

equipment in the valley with an Jand the retail price, your "fleet

Each designated vehicle will
have an affixed radio frequency |
ID (RFID) tag on the inside of
the windshield, allowing wash
selection and entry. A receipt
can be requested at the pay
station touch screen. The
receipt shows the wash service,
name the term "fleet account”

price" is shown on the monthly
billing statement to each
department. the monthly billing
statement will show the vehicle
ID, the date of each wash and
wash service received by
vehicle. Hours of operation:
Mon-Sat; 8:30am- 6:30pm;
Sunday 10am-5pm (closed
major national holidays)

We are open and accessible 24
hours a day, 7 days a week,
year around. We have the
ability (with heated floors) to
operate in freezing
temperatures. We also have an
attendant on duty 7 days a
week, 7-5pm
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