Bid Tabulation & Comparison

Project: New Rifles and Equipment
Bid Opening: April 21, 2023, 11:00 AM PST
Project No.: 12320

Project Manager: Sgt. Travis Shephard, YPD

Amendment No. 1 Effective 03/14/25
Amendment No. 2 Effective 05/28/25

Contract Term

City Manager, Date

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

I recommend multiple awards to LC Action Caracal USA Clyde Armory LC Action Police Primary Arms LLC Proforce Law Red Dog Sporting Sig Sauer The Range
Police Supply - Line items 5 & 7, Primary Supply Enforcement Company
Arms LLC - Line items 3 & 4, Proforce Law
Enforcement - Line items 1 & 2, Red Dog
Sporting Company - Line items 6 & 8 and
Clyde Armory (Backup Only), based on all
being responsive bids received from
responsible bidders. Backup contractors only
to be used as secondary to primary award.
BUYER / DATE
Schedule 1
No. Description Qty. | Unit | UnitPrice | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
FN-15 SRP G2 rifle — Color: Black
Barrel Length: 11.5”
1 906.00 | 18,120.00 968.00 | 19,360.00 1,050.45 | 21,009.00 1,038.52 | 20,770.40 1,101.54 | 22,030.80 861.49 | 17,229.80 1,474.97 | 29,499.40
Magpul MBUS PRO front and
fli ights.
rear Tlip up signts 20 EA NO BID
Alternate ltem Bid CARACAL - CAR814A2 AERO PRECISTION RIFLE WRM400-556N-11B-PRO-
ernate ftem Bt Patrol 11.5" APC R640371 SER
e —
Price Bid =____% discount 38% 8% 37.361% 37% 34% 15% 15%
off MSRP - REQUIRED
FN-15 SRP G2 rifle — Color:
Black
2 |Barrel Length: 16” 906.00 | 18,120.00 939.00 | 18,780.00 1,050.45 | 21,009.00 1,038.52 | 20,770.40 1,101.54 | 22,030.80 823.20 | 16,464.00 1,474.97 | 29,499.40
Magpul MBUS PRO front and
rear flip up sights. 20 EA NO BID
, CARACAL - CAR814A2 AERO PRECISION RIFLE APC
Alternate Item Bid Patrol 16" R640364 WRM400-556N-16B-PRO
e —
Pricc Bid =____% discount 38% 9% 37.361% 37% 34% 15% 15%
off MSRP - REQUIRED
Surefire — Socom 556 RC2
Suppressor — Color: Black
3 Surefire — 3 Prong Flash Hider — 829.00 | 16,580.00 1,134.07 | 22,681.40 1,055.51 | 21,110.20 919.68 | 18,393.60 1,076.28 | 21,525.60 1,087.10 | 21,742.00 949.45 | 18,989.00 1,159.99 | 23,199.80
1/2-28 thread pitch for caliber
5.56. 20 EA
10f4
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AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

| recommend multiple awards to LC Action
Police Supply - Line items 5 & 7, Primary
Arms LLC - Line items 3 & 4, Proforce Law
Enforcement - Line items 1 & 2, Red Dog
Sporting Company - Line items 6 & 8 and
Clyde Armory (Backup Only), based on all
being responsive bids received from
responsible bidders. Backup contractors only
to be used as secondary to primary award.

BUYER / DATE

Caracal USA

Clyde Armory

LC Action Police
Supply

Primary Arms LLC

Proforce

Law

Enforcement

Red Dog Sporting
Company

Sig Sauer

The Range

Alternate Item Bid

Price Bid = % discount
off MSRP - REQUIRED

HuxWrx HX-QD 556k
w/Flash Hider

SSLX556C-QD

27%

17.1%

22.9%

32.8%

21%

24%

15%

15%

Surefire M600U Scout Light,
6V Ultra High Output — Color:
4 Black

Surefire UE-SRO7 Scout light
remote switch — Color: Black 20 EA

Alternate Item Bid

Price Bid = % discount
off MSRP - REQUIRED

129.00 2,580.00

329.69 6,593.80

342.87 6,857.40

322.76

6,455.20

416.39

8,327.80

426.15 8,523.00

Streamlight ProTac HL-X w/
Remote Switch

M640U-BK-PRO

37%

35.1%

22.9%

36.5%

18%

30%

NO BID

389.99 7,799.80

M640

21%

Magpul MS3 Single QD Gen 2
sling — Color: Black

Alternate Item Bid 20 EA

Price Bid = % discount
off MSRP - REQUIRED

42.00 840.00

42.20 844.00

41.76 835.20

46.76

935.20

43.30

866.00

49.95 999.00

36.98 739.60

50.99 1,019.80

SLING-BUNGEE-1PT-TAC

27%

15.5%

30%

22%

27%

20%

15%

15%

EOTECH — HWS EXPS2 — 1 dot
reticle — Color: Black

Alternate Item Bid 20 EA

Price Bid = % discount
off MSRP - REQUIRED

575.00 | 11,500.00

519.44 | 10,388.80

515.54 | 10,310.80

527.73

10,554.60

522.83

10,456.60

509.55 | 10,191.00

489.29 9,785.80

599.99 | 11,999.80

Vortex AMG UH-1 Gen Il

SOR81002

30%

23.5%

24%

22.5%

23%

25%

15%

12%

AIMPOINT Micro H2 Red Dot
7 |Reflex Sight, with LRP mount
and 39mm spacer. Color: Black

20 EA
Alternate Item Bid

170.00 3,400.00

718.85 | 14,377.00

713.39 | 14,267.80

Vortex SPARC-AR Red Dot
Sight w/ 39mm Spacer
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NO BID

972.00

19,440.00

744.00 | 14,880.00

369.95 7,399.00

899.99 | 17,999.80

SOR43031
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AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE: Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name Vendor Name
I recommend multiple awards to LC Action Caracal USA Clyde Armory LC Action Police Primary Arms LLC Proforce Law Red Dog Sporting Sig Sauer The Range
Police Supply - Line items 5 & 7, Primary Supply Enforcement Company
Arms LLC - Line items 3 & 4, Proforce Law
Enforcement - Line items 1 & 2, Red Dog
Sporting Company - Line items 6 & 8 and
Clyde Armory (Backup Only), based on all
being responsive bids received from
responsible bidders. Backup contractors only
to be used as secondary to primary award.
BUYER / DATE
Price Bid =____% discount 32% 29.8% 30% 5% 27% 15% 12%
off MSRP - REQUIRED
EOTECH - G43 Magnifier -
Color: Black, with factory 247.00 | 4,940.00 506.22 | 10,124.40 502.67 | 10,053.40 514.69 | 10,293.80 509.00 | 10,180.00 489.00 | 9,780.00 139.53 | 2,790.60 589.99 | 11,799.80
mount (change per addendum no 1,
issued 4/7/23)
20 EA - —
Alternate Item Bid Vortex Micro 3x Magnifier SOJM001
w/ Mount
Price Bid = ___% discount off 45% 22% 22% 20.7% 21% 23% 15% 9%
IMSRP - REQUIRED
Subtotals: $76,080.00 $65,009.40 $101,574.80 $88,650.40 $112,336.80 $110,176.60 $73,397.80 $132,817.60
WSST - Destination Based 8.3%: $6,314.64 $5,395.78 $8,430.71 $7,357.98 $9,323.95 $9,144.66 $6,092.02 $11,023.86
GRAND TOTAL: $82,394.64 $70,405.18 $110,005.51 $96,008.38 $121,660.75 $119,321.26 $79,489.82 $143,841.46
FREIGHT: SHIPPING/HANDLING/INSRUANCE INCLUDED
Backup award - Backup award - Backup award - Backup award - Backup award -
Award Detail: No Award No Award No Award
Schedules 5,6,7 & 8 | Schedules3,4,6 & 8 Schedules 1 & 2 Schedules 3 & 4 Schedules 1 & 2
Di t offered off list price (MSRP) f th . . . 5% Firearms 10%
scount ottered oft st price ( _)_ or any otner 25% None listed 10% None listed 1-50% None listed 9% 0 . ?
items not specifically listed: % everything else
Project completion: Entire project will be completed
within _days after receipt of order: 40 days 60-180 days 30-60 days 90 days 30-150 days 30-90 days 120 days 60 days
Prompt payment discount: 2%, net 10 days None listed 0%, net 30 days None listed None listed 0%, net 30 days None listed 3%, net 10 days
Price will need to be negotiated for
None. No minimum order any potential renewal. Future
Exemptions: - ) orders of less than 20 units per line None listed None listed None listed None listed None listed None listed
quantity requirements. item
of any Magpul or Surefire product | —
Alternate it d#s1& i id#'s 1-
Alternate items bid #'s 1-8 Alternate item bid #4 ernate rems pia s No alternate bids No alternate bids No alternate bids Alternate |_ter_'ns bid ##'s 1-8 Alternate item bid #4
2 No bid item #4
Comments: Bid price on item #8 "with Bid price on item #8 "with
factory mount" is included, per factory mount" included on PP
vendor 5-2-23 spreadsheet

Tab 12320 Rifles and Equipment YPD_FINAL_REV_05-28-25.xIsx

3 of 4




AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

I recommend multiple awards to LC Action Caracal USA Clyde Armory LC Action Police Primary Arms LLC Proforce Law Red Dog Sporting Sig Sauer The Range
Police Supply - Line items 5 & 7, Primary Supply Enforcement Company
Arms LLC - Line items 3 & 4, Proforce Law
Enforcement - Line items 1 & 2, Red Dog
Sporting Company - Line items 6 & 8 and
Clyde Armory (Backup Only), based on all
being responsive bids received from
responsible bidders. Backup contractors only
to be used as secondary to primary award.
BUYER / DATE
Amendment No. 1 - Effective 03/14/25
No. Description Qty. | Unit | UnitPrice | Total Price [ Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price [ Unit Price | Total Price
14152-XFET S&W 9MM 10 EA
9 [Direct Cut 489.67 4,896.70
RMHD2-C-3200002 TRJ 10 EA
10 |[MOA RED DOT 672.73| 6,727.30
$1,162.40| $11,624.00
Amendment No. 2 - Effective 05/28/25
No. Description Qty. | Unit | UnitPrice | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price [ Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price [ Unit Price | Total Price
0212807344047-X Daniel
Defense DDI DDM4V7S 5.56
Short Barrel Rifle - 11.5" 12 EA
11 1,380.82| 16,569.84
SU5059-DS SilencerCo
Velos LBP: Low Back 12 EA
12 |Pressure 709.56( 8,514.72
SOR44001 Sig Suer
Romeo4XT Pro Red Dot 12 EA
13 |Sight 450.12( 5,401.44
MAG116BLK Magpul MBS 12 EA
14 |3 Front Sight - Black 24.41 292.92
MAG1167BLK Magpul 12 EA
15 |[MBUS 3 Sight - Rear 36.63 439.56
MAG953BK MPI MS4 QDM 12 EA
16 [SLNG BLK 57.74 692.88
$2,659.28| $31,911.36
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