T YAKIMA
y cOUNTY,

Bid Tabulation
Project: Inmate Clothing

Bid Opening: July 28th, 2011 @ 11am

Project No.: C11107
Contract Term: 5 year
Department: YCDOC

Revised 11/29/12
Revised 2/1/2013
Revised 12/04/14
Revised 12/26/14

Project Manager: Corporal Chuck Dimick

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

Vendor Name

| recommend award to the following vendors based on
theirs being overall the lowest most responsive and
responsible bids received. Schedule |, lines #1-5 to Bob
Barker, line #6 to Robinson Textiles. Schedule II, lines

#7-13 to Caolina Textiles, line #14 to Robinson Textiles. . . " Gold Water n . Uniforms
?C;ﬁdme I to Bob Barker. Schedule IV to Robinson Bob Barker Carolina Textiles Goaltex Corp JNC Supplies Inc Industries Robinson Textiles Manutacturing Inc.
extiles.
BUYER / DATE
Schedule | - FOOTWEAR
No. Description Qty.| Unit JUnit Price|Total Price] Unit Price| Total Price] Unit Price| Total Price] Unit Price|Total Price] Unit Price| Total Price] Unit Price|Total PricejUnit Price| Total Price]
1 |Low Top Shoes — White 4.95 . .
Sizes 4-16 455 | Pair 5.01 2,252.25 No Bid 4.65 2,115.75 No Bid 4.30 1,956.50 5.25 2,388.75 6.45 2,934.75
#850-(size)
2 |Velcro Shoes — White 8.45 . .
Size 4-15 1404| Pair 8.56 11,863.80 No Bid 10.04 14,096.16 No Bid 4.52 6,346.08 4.77 6,697.08 13.73 19,276.92
#V54-(size)
3 |Work Boot 15.85
Sizes 5-15 36 Pair 16.06 570.60 No Bid 18.25 657.00 No Bid 13.92 501.12 17.00 612.00 22.00 792.00
#B525D-(size) 2pr/Sizes
4 |Winter Boots 9.25 |
ynter Boots 36 | par | ¥ 33300 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2000 | 72000 | 1502 | 54072
Sizes 6-15 9.37
2KBP-(size)
5 [Sandals 1.59
Sizes S-3XL 3135| Pair 1l61 4,984.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.36 4,263.60 1.87 5,862.45 3.00 9,405.00
#SABR-(size)
Sandal, Soft PVC, Tan
36-pr/mc
Size S-2X1.|4536| Pair 1.59 7,212.24
3XL| 144 Pair 1.62 233.28
#6101-(Size)
6 [Safety Slip-on
Overshoes 140 | Pair No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20-00 2,800.00 15.99 2,238.60
Sizes XS-XL
SUB TOTAL: 27,449.82 0.00 16,868.91 0.00 13,067.30 19,080.28 35,187.99




Bob Barker

Carolina Textiles

Goaltex Corp

JNC Supplies Inc.

Gold Water
Industries

Robinson Textiles

Uniforms
Manufacturing Inc.

Schedule Il - UNDERGARMENT

Gray socks

780

Dozen

515
5.22
#2772

4,017.00

5:94

4,633.20

7.88

6,146.40

6.54

5,101.20

No

0.00

7.25

5,655.00

5.50

4,290.00

8 |Underwear - Men's

Sizes S-XL|

2XL)

3XL

4XL)
SXL
6XL)|

7XL

845

Dozen

+H-80—

11.95 9,971.00

9.35

1275—
12.92

1340—
13.27

13256—
13.42

1478 —
14.97

15:50—
15.70

15:50—
15.70

#EBRLS-(size)

10.45

1155

12:65

14.85

1595

7,900.75

11.04

9,328.80

9.49

8,019.05

12.22

10.49

13.40

11.49

14.58

12.49

15.75

13.49

17.52

16.49

18.69

18.49

No

Bid

11.00

9,295.00

10.54

8,906.30

12.00

11.66

13.00

11.97

14.00

12.39

15.00

13.63

17.00

14.87

20.00

16.11

9 |Underwear — Women’s
Sizes 6-10

11-13

Dozen

9.36—

0.48 7,731.36

8.25

6,814.50

10.22

8,441.72

8.49

7,012.74

9:95—
10.08

H#ELBLS-(size)

11.40

12pribag
20pr/carton

9.49

No

Bid

9.50

7,847.00

9.90

8,177.40

10.25

11.15

Sizes 6-10

40-42

Dozen

24-50—

24.82 465.50

21.89

415.91

24-50—
24.82

#EBASPLS-
(size)

No

Bid

21.89

415.91

23.89

No

Bid

25.00

475.00

23.25

441.75

27.00

24.49

11 |T-Shirt, White
Sizes S-XL|

2XL

396

Each

2450—
2178 709.50
21.60

192

760-32

24-:00—
2431+
26.55

27-00—
2735
26.55

#683-(size) or
#671-(size)
#Sold by Dz

229

No

Bid

1.99

788.04

237

2.51

No

Bid

1.75

693.00

1.48

586.08

2.05

1.77

2,07




Gold Water

Uniforms

Bob Barker Carolina Textiles Goaltex Corp JNC Supplies Inc. . Robinson Textiles .
Industries Manufacturing Inc.
12 |Thermal Tops
Sizes SKL| 24 | ozen| 34907 | sosoo | atse | 7s74e No Bid 2049 | 707.76 No Bid 3800 | 91200 | 2097 | 719.28
2XL, 34.50— A
34.95 33.76 30.49 41.00 29.97
3XL 36.50
36.97 3596 32.09 43.00 29.97
4XL 37.50—
37.99 37.06 33.49 44.00 29.97
5XL 39.70—
20.42 39.26 35.09 46.00 29.97
6XL 39:-70—
20.42 e 37.09 50.00 29.97
#63-(size)
13 |Thermal Bottoms
Sizes S-XLf 45 [ pozen 33 . 4909 37200 | 3156 378.72 No Bid 2949 | 353.88 No Bid 38.00 | 456.00 | 27.54 | 330.48
2XL 28.50—
28.87 3376 30.49 41.00 27.54
3XL 3100—
31.40 35.96 32.09 43.00 27.54
4XL 32:00—
32.42 37.06 33.49 44.00 27.54
SXL 36.00
36.47 39:26 35.09 46.00 27.54
6XL) 36.50
36.47 e 37.09 50.00 27.54
#112-(size)
14 [Women's Robes
Sizes S-XL| 36 | Each 15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15-00 5406.00 14.95 538.20
XL-2XL) 16.00 16.00 18.66
3XL 17.00 17.00 20.52
SUB TOTAL: 24,094.36 21,660.84 23,916.92 22,398.58 0.00 25,873.00 23,989.49




Bob Barker Carolina Textiles Goaltex Corp JNC Supplies Inc. Gold Wz:ner Robinson Textiles Unlforr'ns
Industries Manufacturing Inc.
Schedule Il - CLOTHING
15 |Polo Shirt, White,
Stencil on Back
Sizes S-XL| 276 | Each 4'76 1,297.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.61 2,376.36
2X1 5.95 6.03 10.80
3XL 595
6.03 10.80
4XL) 6.55
6.64 10.80
5XL| N/A 10.80
#Z88000WH-(size)
16 [Polo Shirt, Burgundy,
Stencil on Back
Sizes S-XU| 36 | gacn | 309 | 180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1012 | 364.32
2XL 625 6.33 11.85
3XL]| 6.55
6.64 11.85
4X1) 6.55 11.85
SXL N/A 11.85
#Z88000MA-(size)
17
Polo Shirt, Forest
Green, Stencil on Back
Sizes S-XL| g5 | £ach 55'0997 480.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1042 | 97152
2XL1 6.5 6.33 11.85
3XL 6.55 11.85
4XL 6.55 11.85
5XL) N/A 11.85
#Z88000FG-(size)
Polo Shirt, Hunter
Green, 100% Pique
Ctn, NO STENCIL
Size 4XL| 1 Each 8.95




Gold Water

Uniforms

Bob Barker Carolina Textiles Goaltex Corp JNC Supplies Inc. Industries Robinson Textiles Manufacturing Inc.
18 |Polo Shirt, Royal Blue
Stencil on Back
Sizes S-XL{1200| Each | 595 | 600000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1012 | 12,144.00
2XL 6.25
6.33 11.85
3XL 6.55 6.64 11.85
4X1) 6.55 11.85
SXL N/A 11.85
#Z88000RB-(size)
Polo Shirt, Royal Blue,
100% Pique Ctn, NO
STENCIL
Size SXL| 1 | Each 8.95 8.95
#ZM200RB-5X|
19 |Sweat Shirt, White,
Stencil on Back
Sizes S-XL| 96 | Each 6.25 600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.78 842.88
2X1J 7.25 9.43
3XL 8.25 9.43
4X1) 9.25 10.40
SXLJ 9.99 11.05
Sweatshirt, White, NO
STENCIL l-ea
Size L-XL| 1 Each 5.25 5.25
SXLJ| 1 Each 7.95 7.95
Z18000WH-(size
20 |Sweat Shirt, Burgundy,
Stencil on Back
Sizes S-XL| 36 | Each 6.25 225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.78 316.08
2X1 7.25 9.43
3XL 8.25 9.43
4XL 9.25 10.40
SXL 9.95 11.05
Sweat Shirt,
Burgundy, Crewneck,
NO STENCIL, 50/50
8oz l-ea
Size XL| 1 | Each 6.50
Sweat Shirt,
Burgundy, Crewneck,
NO STENCIL
1-dz
Size SXL| 1 | Dozen

105.00 105.00




Gold Water

Uniforms

Bob Barker Carolina Textiles Goaltex Corp JNC Supplies Inc. . Robinson Textiles .
Industries Manufacturing Inc.
21 |Sweat Shirt,
Forest Green,
Stencil on Back
Sizes S-XL| 48 | Each 6.25 300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.78 421.44
2XL 7.25 9.43
3XL 8.25 9.43
4XL 9.25 10.40
SXL 9.95 11.05
22 |Sweat Shirt, Royal
Blue, Stencil on Back
Sizes S-XL| 600 | Each 6.25 3,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.78 5,268.00
2XL 7.25 9.43
3XL 8.25 9.43
4X1) 9.25 10.40
SXL 9.95 11.05
Sweat Shirt, Royal
Blue, NO STENCIL
1-dz
Sizes 4XL-5XL| 1 |Dozen 105.00
23
Sweat Shirt, Safety
Green, Stencil on Back
Sizes 3XL| 30 | Each 8.25 247.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.98 419.40
4X1) 9.25 14.34
24 .
Jeans, Elastic Waste
Sizes S-Ml 540 | £aoh | 22| 499500 | o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 427 | 230580
LG-2XL] 9.25—
9.37 4.27
3XL-6XL| 12.50-
12.66 5.00
#BDT-(size)
SUB TOTAL: 18,322.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 25,429.80




Bob Barker Carolina Textiles Goaltex Corp JNC Supplies Inc. Gold Wz:ner Robinson Textiles Unlforr'ns
Industries Manufacturing Inc.
Schedule IV - UNIFORM CLOTHING
25 V- Neck Uniform Shirt,
Gray, no pocket,
Stencil on Back
Size S-2XL| 198 | Each |, 4% | 97020 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 450 | soteo | 499 | 98802
3XL 525 5.32
4.75 475 4.99
4XL1 5.35 5.42
5.00 5.00 5.25
5XL 6.95—
704 5.25 e 5.25
6XL| 715
7.24 5.50 5.50 5.50
7XL, 745—
755 5.75 575 5.50
8XL) 745—
7.55 6.00 6.00 5.75
9XL 7.55
765 6.25 G2 6.00
10XL 8-25- 8.36
6.50 6.50 6.00
#JTGYSNP-(size)
26 |V- Neck Uniform Shirt,
Orange, no pocket,
Stencil on Back
Size S-2XL 30 Each 4—96 4.50 147.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.50 135.00 4.99 149.70
3XL 5.25 5.32
4.75 475 4.99
4X1 535 5.42
5.00 5.00 5.25
5XL) 6:95—
704 5.25 e 5.25
6XL| 15—
724 5.75 €Y 5.50
7XL| 7.45
7.55 5.75 575 5.50
8XL 7.45
7-55 6.00 e 5.75
9XL} 7.55—
265 6.25 6.25 6.00
10XL} 8.25- 8.36
6.50 6.50 6.00
#TOSNP- (size)
Shirt, Orange,
TriStitch with Pocket,
NO STENCIL
1-ea, 36-ea/mc
Size 3XL| 1 Each 6.10




Gold Water

Uniforms

Bob Barker Carolina Textiles Goaltex Corp JNC Supplies Inc. Industries Robinson Textiles Manufacturing Inc.
27 |V- Neck Uniform Shirt,
Spruce Green no
pocket, Stencil on Back
Size S-2XU 1799| Each |, 041‘945 | 890505 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 450 | 800550 | 499 | 8977.01
3XL 525 5.32
4.75 4.75 4.99
4X1 540 547 5.00 5.25
5XL, 6:95—
704 5.25 i 525
6XL 75—
7.24 5.50 5.50 5.50
TXL 7.45
755 5.75 &8 5.50
8XL 745 —
7-55 6.00 e 5.75
9XL)| 7.55
765 6.25 G2 6.00
10XL 8.25- 8.36
6.50 6.50 6.00
£ TGSNP-(size)
28 |V- Neck Uniform Shirt,
‘White no pocket,
Stencil on Back
Size S-2XL| 214 | Each %i’ 540'6' 973.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 450 | 98300 | 479 | 102506
3XL 515 5.22]
4.75 4.75 4.79
4XL 5.55 5.62
5.00 5.00 5.00
5XL) 5:85—
593 5 525 5.00
6XL 6-15—
6.23 5.50 5.50 5.50
TXL| 6:35—
6.43 5.75 575 5.50
8XL 6:55—
6.64 6.00 6.00 5.75
[$)'e8 6-70—
679 6.25 625 5.75
10XL 6:85—
8.36 6.50 6.50 6.00
JrJ TWSNP-(size)
Shirt, White, TriStitch
with Pocket, NO
1 Each 5.38
1 Each 6.10
29 |No Pocket, NO
STENCIL
Size $-2XL 6 | Each | 263‘ 5530 540.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 530 | s0s80 | 576 | 55296
3XL-6XL 726—
734 6.00 g 6.25
TXL-8XL 8:05—
815 8.00 £y 7.00
9XL-10XL} 8.65—
8.76 8.50 8.50 8.00
TGYT-(size)




Gold Water

Uniforms

Bob Barker Carolina Textiles Goaltex Corp JNC Supplies Inc. . Robinson Textiles .
Industries Manufacturing Inc.
30 |Uniform Pant, Orange,
No Pocket, NO
STENCIL
Size S-2XL{ 54 | Each 623 & 55 20| 33210 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 530 | 28620 | 576 | 311.04
3XL-6XL 725 —
7.34 6.00 6.00 6.25
TXL-8XL 8:05—
815 8.00 Gy 7.00
9XL-10XL} 8:65—
8.76 8.50 8.50 8.00
#TOT-(size)
31 [Uniform Pant, Spruce
Green, No Pocket, NO
STENCIL
Size $-2XL1475g| Each 6435' 55 | 1081170] o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 530 | 931740 | 576 |10,126.08
3XL-6XL #25—
734 6.00 6.00 6.25
TXL-8XL 8.05—
8.45 8.00 8.00 7.00
9XL-10XL} 8-65—
8.76 8.50 E=y 8.00
#TGT-(size)
52 |Uniform Pant, White,
No Pocket, NO
STENCIL
Size S-2XL) g1 [ gach | o0 | 198570 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 530 | 168540 | 480 | 1,526.40
3XL-6XL 725—
7.34 6.00 6.00 5.10
TXL-8XL 8:05—
8:15- 8.00 e 5.75
9XL-10XL} 8:65—
8.76 8.50 8.50 6.25
TWT-(size)
33 Striped Overall, Green
& White, Velcro, No
Pockets, Stencil on
Back
Sizes XL| 13.24
180 | Each 13.41 2,383.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.00 1,980.00 13.81 2,485.80
11.00
2XL 13.84
14.02 11.50 13.81
11.50
3XL]| 14.25 |
14.44 12.00 13.81
12.00
4XL 14.55—
14.75 12.50 15.20
12.50
SXL 1525
15.45 13.00 15.20
13.00
6XL)| 16.25
16.46 13.50 15.20
13.00
TXL) 16.45
16.66 14.00 17.00
14.00
8XL 16.45
16.66 14.50 17.00
14.50
#JGWVINP-(size)
SUB TOTAL: I 27,036.63 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 23,862.30 26,142.07




Sub Total: 96,903.11 21,660.84 40,785.83 22,398.58 13,067.30 68,815.58 110,749.35
7.9% WSST 7:655-35 3,222.08 1,769.49 1,032.32 5,436.43
Grand Total Base Bid: 104,55846 21,660.84 44,007.91 24,168.07 14,099.62 74,252.01 110,749.35
Payment Discount / Terms: 0% / 30 Days Net 30 N/A Net 30 0.00 0% / Net 30 0% / Net 30
Delivery Time| ? 30 Days 30 Days 30 Days 30 Days 7 - 30 Days 14 -30 Days
Freight FOB destination: Included Included Included Included Included Included Included
Catalog Name & Number: None None None 2011 Catalog Manufactoring
Personal Care
ltems/Brands Available:| SOMES All ltems All ltems
5%
Discount: 5% 3% 15%

At Discount Structure:|

$10 order fee on
orders under $100

Comments or Exceptions|

30) Extended price
corrected.

Inclusive of State
]& County Tax

3) No padded Collar

12/1/2012

* Price Increase

2/1/2013]

* Price Increase

Additional items added to contract

* Canceled Contract with Carolina Textiles

* Bob Barker assumes Robinson Textiles contract with current Robinson pricing.

12/4/2014
12/26/2014
ADDED CONTRACT ITEMS Bob Barker
37|Gloves, Synetron o | case | 11580 EI
50/bx, 10bx/mc : :
#ZSYXXL
38| Ultiltiy Glove, Brown
Jersey 1 | Dozen 8.05 8.05
12-pr/dz, 25-dz/mc
#WGLCE9
41| Latex Glove
12-ea/dz, 12-dz/me B el I
#6029-XL
39|Cap, Watch Orange
12-onldz, 12-dzime B el I
#101N-OR
40 [Hood, Protective
Detainee 7 | Case 36.00 252.00
10-ea/cs, 10-cs/mc
#7000
40 |Blanket, Cozy 66x90
Gray 1 Case 79.95 79.95
w/Blue, 15-ea/ca
#CZ6690GY
41|Suicide Cell Smock
Sherwood Green, 5 Each 89.54 447.70
6-ea/mc
#505
42 |Suicide Cell Blanket,
80x54, Sherwood
. 9 Each 87.51 787.59
Green,
6-ea/mc
#SB5480
43 |Suiside/Isolation All-In
1 Each 228.48 228.48
One Bed
#BBSSB
43 |Sheet, White, 54''x90"'
12-ea/dz, 4-dz/mc 212 | Dozen 36.00 7,632.00
#SH5490N
44 |Pillowcase, White
42x34 12-] 24 | Dozen] 10.50 252.00
ea/cs, 10-cs/mc
#PC4234




ADD CONTRACT ITEMS Bob Barker
44 |Laundry Bag, 24x36
Sliplock, Red 1 | Dozen| 55.00 55.00
12-ea/dz, 4-dz/mc
#R2436
45 |Laundry Bag, 30x48,
Sliplock, White 1 | Dozen| 55.00 55.00
12-ea/dz, 3-dz/mc
#W3048
#6|Laundry Cart 1 | Each | 278.00 | 278.00
14 bushel
#2700-14BK
47 |Liner, Blosstex
14 Bushel BI 1 Each 97.00 97.00
L#Z4UOU65GMK
46 |Laundry Detergent,
Pre-Emptive 7 | Each 28.65 200.55
1 Gallon
#5100
47 |Shower Curtin
w/grmts 62''x77 1 | Each 18.95 18.95
l1-ea, 12-ea/mc
#SCG62
48 |Curtain, Hookless
Translucent
36"W x 77"L 4 | Each | 14.69 58.76
l1-ea, 12-ea/mc
#TSC36
49 |Curtain, Hookless
Translucent
62 x 771 4 | Each | 22:50 90.00
1-ea, 12-ea/mc
#TSC62
50 |Shower Curtin Rings,
Clear 124 1 Pack 3.54 3.54
ea/pk, 12-pk/mc
#RINGS
51|Bath Towel, White,
20x40, 4.251b 500 | Dozen] 15.25 7,625.00
12-ea/dz, 25-dz/mc
#BT425
52|Hand Towel, White,
15x25 1 | Dozen 7.33 7.33

12-ea/dz, 50-dz/mc

#HT1525




ADD CONTRACT ITEMS Bob Barker
51|Toothbrush, short
handle, 25 tuft 160 | Case 7.19 1,150.40
144-ealcs, 10-cs/mc
#BBST25
51 |Toothpast, Colgate
15 oz, 1 Case 143.75 143.75
1000 Pk ea/cs 1-cs/mc
#CG50130
52| Toothpast,
NatureMint .280z 88 | Case 84.95 7,475.60
1000-ea/cs
#NMFP
52|Soap, Unwrapped, Soz.
1000-ea/cs, 1-cs/mc 74 | Case 32.35 2,393.90
#U1
53 |Soap, Wra .250:
Soap, Wrapped 1.2S0z | o f oo | sasa | 4006
500-ea/cs, 1-cs/mc
#62105
54 |Shampoo,
Conditioning .340z 2 | D e
ase g b
pkt, 1000-ea/cs, 1- ’
cs/me
#PKS
55 |Shampoo, Lice
Control, 1-gal w/pump | 11 | Case | 39.90 438.90
1-gal/mc
#LCS-128
53|Comb, 5"
192 | Case 35.23 6,764.16
2160-ea/cs
#C5B
54|Lice Comb, 3" Black | 192 |Dozen| 1.24 238.08
#LSC
57 |Ponytail Holder, Black
12-ea/dz, 72dx/mc 216 | Dozen 1.28 276.48
#4200-BK
55 |Sanitary Napkin, Inc
‘Wrpd. 98 | Case 37.00 3,626.00
576-ea/cs, 1-cs/mc
#SN12
53 |Razor, Single Blade
3 Cs 89.00 267.00
2000-ea/cs, 1-cs/mc
#SR2000
5411 < Piec
L'hpper. Wahl 11-Piece| 71 | Each 15.50 1,100.50
Set
#9633-500
56 | Chair. Stacke
Chair, Stackable, 1 Each 43.00 43.00
Armless, Tan
#786484-TN
57 IM: < Polves
]\l‘mfe”’ Polyester 50 | Each 33.61 1,680.50
25x75x4
#PJIM25754
58 |Mi Security, 2pc
Mirror, Security, 2pc, 1 Each 2200 22.00
8x10
#2SM810
57 |Pencil, 3" Golf
175 | C 6.35 1,111.25
144-ealcs, 25-cs/mc ase
#GP-1
58 |Pen, Max Sec Black
Clear Cover 1 | Case 23.46 23.46

144-ealcs, 24-cs/mc

#MSBP




