SEALED BID NO.: C11610

DUE DATE: January 20, 2017
BID NAME: Inmate Clothing and Miscellaneous Supplies
DEPARTMENT: Department of Corrections

YAKIMA COUNTY

BID TABULATION & COMPARISON SHEET

Page 1

VENDORS
AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:
I recommend all schedule be awarded to Bob Barker Company, Inc. American Bob Barker | Carolina Textiles Phoenix Uniforms Victory Supply
due to their Bid being the lowest responsive and responsible Bid Amenities, Inc. | Company, Inc. | Nonresponsive | Trading, Inc | Manufacturing LLC
received. & Disqualified
M 0320 /%
er 7 Datﬁ"
;Ig; " QTY | UNIT | DESCRIPTION
L -
SCHEDULE 1 - Footwear
Low Top Shoes Sizes: 4-
1. Pair |16 No Bid 45.01 No Bid 4.97
2.4 Pair | Knee Boots Sizes: 4- ) 1 1-44
16 No Bid 10.55 No Bid 16.61
Seva Sandals Sizes: S-
3 Pair |XL No Bid 1.39 No Bid 1.74
2XL-3XL No Bid 1.39 No Bid 1.74
4. Pair | Shoe Coverings 0.144 No Bid 19.97
SCHEDULE 2 - Undergarments
3. Dozen | Socks No Bid 4.92 8.11 6.50 6.64
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VENDORS
ITEM American Bob Barker Carolina Phoenix Uniforms Victory Supply,
NO. OTY | UNIT DESCRIPTION Amenities, Inc. | Company, Inc. Textiles Trading, Inc. Manufacturing Inc.
P
6. Dozen |Underwear — Men’s Sizes: S-XL No Bid 9.11 11.32 11.50 9.87
2XL No Bid 10.88 12.50 10.94
3IXL No Bid 10.88 13.00 11.94
4XL No Bid 10.88 13.25 12.24
5XL No Bid 11.88 14.50 12.94
6XL No Bid 11.88 15.25 13.44
XL No Bid 11.88 15.50 13.74
s Dozen |Underwear — Woman’s Sizes: 6-10 No Bid 6.33 9.25 7.44
11-13 No Bid 6.33 10.00 8.78
14-16 No Bid 6.33 11.00 9.94
8. Dozen |Bras Sizes: 32-38 No Bid 16.60 23.00 18.94
40-42 No Bid 16.60 23.00 18.94
44-46 No Bid 17.70 23.00 18.94
48-50 No Bid 17.70 23.00 18.94
52-54 No Bid 17.70 23.00 18.94
SCHEDULE 3 — Misc. Clothing
9. Each Polo Shirts Sizes: S-XL No Bid 5.022 6.94 7.44
2XL No Bid 6.33 9.67 9.74
3XL No Bid 6.64 10.97 10.74
4XL No Bid 6.64 1227 12.44
5XL No Bid 7.77 13.57 12.44
10. Each Sweat Shirts Sizes: S-—-XL No Bid 6.19 8.11 7.24
2XL No Bid 7.31 8.71 8.24
3XL No Bid 8.10 11.96 8.24
4XL No Bid 8.10 12.20 8.97
5XL No Bid 8.10 12.53 8.97
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VENDORS
ITEM American Bob Barker Carolina Phoenix Uniforms Victory Supply,
NO. QIy | LAlL DESCRIPTION Amenities, Inc. | Company, Inc. Textiles Trading, Inc. Manufacturing Inc.
11. Each Jeans Sizes: S-—-XL No Bid 7.09 9.30 9.24
2XL No Bid 7.09 9.30 9.24
3XL No Bid 7.09 9.30 12.42
4XL No Bid 7.99 9.30 12.42
5XL No Bid 8.20 9.30 12.42
6XL No Bid 8.20 9.30 12.42
12. Each Robes Sizes: S-LG No Bid 7.70 10.73 16.00
XL-2XL No Bid 7.70 12.35 16.00
3XL No Bid 7.70 14.30 17.00
13, Each Gloves Sizes: S-LG No Bid No Bid 2.04 90.00
XL -2XL No Bid No Bid 2.04 90.00
Quantity per box 12 12
SCHEDULE 4 — Uniform Clothing
14.
Each Uniform Shirts Sizes: S-2XL No Bid 5.16 4.55 5.74
3XL No Bid 5.16 4.55 6.34
4XL No Bid 5.35 4.90 6.34
5XL, No Bid 5.35 5.00 6.84
6XL No Bid 5.65 5.45 6.84
7XL No Bid 6.99 5.70 7.34
8XL No Bid 6.99 6.00 7.34
9XL No Bid 6.99 6.00 7.84
10XL No Bid 6.99 9.00 7.84
15.
Each Uniform Pants Sizes: S-2XL No Bid 5.209 4.55 6.35
3XL No Bid 5.64 4.55 6.99
4X1. No Bid 6.08 4.55 7.44
5XL No Bid 6.32 5.00 7.44
6XL No Bid 6.96 5.45 7.99
TXL No Bid 7.69 5.70 7.99
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VENDORS
ITEM American Bob Barker Carolina Phoenix Uniforms Victory Supply,
NO. OTY | UNEL DESCRIFTION Amenities, Inc. | Company, Inc. Textiles I Trading, Inc. | Manufacturing Inc.
8XL No Bid 8.02 6.00 8.74
9XL No Bid 8.02 6.00 8.74
10XL No Bid 8.02 9.00 8.74
16. Each | Striped Overalls Sizes: S-2XL No Bid $11.66 11.00 14.84
3XL No Bid $12.48 11.00 15.84
4XL No Bid $12.48 12.00 15.84
5XL No Bid $14.36 12.00 16.84
6XL No Bid 14.36 13.00 16.84
TXL No Bid 17.00 14.00 17.90
8XL No Bid 18.00 14.00 17.90
9XL No Bid 18.00 16.00 18.99
10XL No Bid 19.20 16.00 18.99
SCHEDULE 5 — Bedding & Towels
17 Dozen |Sheets No Bid 22.80 No Bid 30.74
18. Dozen |Blankets No Bid 55.80 No Bid 67.68
19. Each | Suicide Blankets No Bid 65.20 No Bid 7311
20. Each Suicide Smocks No Bid 59.20 No Bid i L
Z1. Dozen | Towels No Bid 8.70 No Bid 13.44
SCHEDULE 6 — Hygiene & Personal Care
22 Each Soap, Unwrapped 0.031 0.0285 0.03145 No Bid 47.21
Quantity per case 1000 1000 1000 1000
23. Each | Soap, Individually Wrapped 0.094 0.07458 0.0999 No Bid 61.99
Quantity per case 500 500 500 500
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VENDORS
ITEM American Bob Barker Carolina Phoenix Uniforms Victory Supply,
NO. QTY | UNIL DESCRIPTION Amenities, Inc. | Company, Inc. Textiles Trading, Inc. Manufacturing Inc.
24. Gallon | Lice Shampoo No Bid 38.20 1375 No Bid No Bid
Quantity per case 1 4
25. Each | Toothpaste No Bid 0.0535 0.05995 No Bid 79.44
Quantity per case 1000 1000 1000
26, Each | Toothbrushes 0.0489 0.04 0.0483 No Bid 6.94
] 144 Bx,
Quantity per case 10Bx/M Case 144 144 144
27. Each | Combs 0.0158 0.016 0.0167 No Bid 41.21
Quantity per case 2160 2160 2160 2160
28. Each |Maxi Pads 0.061 0.04 0.059 No Bid 38.74
576
Quantity per case 250 576 12/pk, 48pk/cs 500
29. Each |Razors 0.054 0.0395 0.04425 No Bid 106.50
Quantity per case 1000 2000 2000 2000
SCHEDULE 7 - Mattresses
30. Each | Mattresses No Bid 36.20 No Bid 54.00
SCHEDULE 8 - Miscellaneous
31. Each | Golf Pencils No Bid 0.02 No Bid 5.97
Quantity per case 144 144
32. Each | Clincher ID Bands No Bid 0.31 No Bid 189.00
Quantity per case 500 500
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VENDORS
ITEM American Bob Barker Carolina Phoenix Uniforms Victory Supply,
NO. QLY | B DESCRIPTION Amenities, Inc. | Company, Inc. Textiles Trading, Inc. Manufacturing Inc.
= T T
Prompt Payment Discount / Terms: 0%/0 0% /NA 0%/30 0% /30
14-16 Days 7-10 Days
Delivery Time: 14 Days 30 Days 3-5 Days Uniforms 60 | Uniforms 21-30
Days Days
Will Vendor Share Prices?
Freight: FOB DESTINATION Included Included Included Included Included Included
Discount offered on items not specifically called out for in Bid Specifications

Foot Wear: 0 % 5% 20 % 10 %
Clothing & Apparel: 0% 8% 20 % 10 %
Officers Only: 0% 5% 10 %
Bedding, Towels & Linens: 0% 5% 10 %
Facility Maintenance: 0% 5% 10 %
Mattresses: 0 % 5% 10 %
Furnishings: 0 % 5% 10 %
Personal Care & Hygiene: 0% 5% 10 %
Health Care: 0% 5% 10 %
Recreation: 0% 5% 10 %
Security: 0% 5% | 10 %
Emergency Management: 0% 5% 10 %
Office Supplies: 0% 5% 10 %
Miscellaneous, Other: 0% 5% | 10 %
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VENDORS
ITEM American Bob Barker I Carolina Phoenix Uniforms Victory Supply,
NO. LG g TR DESCRITTION Amenities, Inc. | Company, Inc. Textiles Trading, Inc. | Manufacturing Inc.
—_——————— M
Comments: | e [tem #23 e Item #1 Low . o Jtem #11 — e Jtem #2 —
N
Soap - Top Shoes: No d:::ﬁslllj :: s l:: Jeans: 60 Days| Knee Boots:
Individually size 4. the required Delivery. has a price
me (ﬁeid 2]5 o Item #2 Knee |documents e [tem #14 — llage%]; ;112 f Zj_
0/ o bic:l Boots: No size bcmg. Uniforms s df 4.1 6. @
- 16. submitted: Shirts: 60 -
specifications s it $16.61
call for. e Item #4 Shoe Signature A Ly
~ H A l)age~ o ® Item #] 8 =
Coverings: are | e [tem #15 Wlambais:
substituted *Technical Uniform ' i
: o B | Quoted by
with Specifications Pants: 60 Days | | er bid
Polyethylene | Analysis, Delivery. Specs _p
shoe covers at *Bid Form. T packaged 15
$0.072 Ea. & o bal
$21.60 per Personnel Striped per bale.
case;/BOO Inventory Gverall. 60 e On non bid
Form, Days Delivery. | .. _ 10%
Item #19 S o i
" i Vendor discount,
GUsein; Questionnaire, however
$69.73 per * : depending on
Chincl 1S Published penaing
Price List quantity and
e [tem #24 item freight
Toothpaste: may be
Size 0.28 oz. is additional.
$53.50 per
case/1000
Size 0.15 oz. is
$44.95 per

case/1000




