AWARDING Tabulation

Project: Manhole Covers, Lids, Rings, and Catch Basin Grates and Drain Covers
Bid Opening: September 7, 2023 @ 2:00 PM PST =
Project No.: 12322 i . ol

Contract Term: 1-Yr. with possible two 1-Yr. Extensions Approval: City' Manager Date
Project Manager: Marc Cawley, Wastewater Operations Superintendent

AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE: Vendor Name Vendor Name

| recommend award to H. D. Folwer as their Bid was the
lowest responsive Bid received from a responsible

Bidder. Core and Main H. D. Fowler
BUYER / DATE
A =
No. Description | Qty.| Unit] Stock#/Min Qty ] Unit Price| Total Price] Stock#/ Min Qty | Unit Price | Total Price
1 Locking, hinged manhole ring and lid with SEWER Logo
d :_003705 Order/Stock #: _00370
A.|1 Inch by 25 % inch diameter by 6 inch ring. | 1 Iof AN MRS | sevn | o | FicTStotcR DRISINL. | aonad | epoind
Minimum Qty: 10 Minimum Qty: _1
Order/Stock #: 00370501102 Order/Stock #:
B.|1 inch by 25 % inch diameter by 4 inch ring. 1 i ‘_w i - 716.08 716.08 I r ?r’ = it 595.24 595.24
Minimum Qty: 10 Minimum Qty: _1
2 Locking, hinged manhole ring and lid with STORM WATER Logo
v ; 0 75105 ;
A.|1inch by 25 % inch diameter by 6 inch ring. 1 EA 3 ‘d?r/smck # 00370508101 757.70 757.70 D_rd_er/StOCk #: 00370501101 629.84 629.84
Minimum Qty: 10 . Minimum Qty: _1
der/Stock #: 00370501102 d k #: 00370501102
B.|1inch by 25 % inch diameter by 4 inchring. | 1 | EA [POC/StOck® SBIBSONR2 | Si5 08 | 7qgog  [OreC/Stock#: Q0II0SNN0R | gonos | 59524
Minimum Qty: 10 Minimum Qty: _1
3 Manhole Lid ONLY no Logo
d k #: der/Stock #:
1 inch by 25 % inch diameter g | e e N 22124 | 22124 |°', e et 17699 | 176.99
Minimum Qty: Minimum Qty: _1
4 Manhole Lid ONLY with Logo
Order/Stock # _LC00370500 d k #: _LC0O0370500
1 inch by 25% inch diameter. 1 | pa [Prievstokd AORNE0. | 41954 | 41354 [OTOC/StockM MO0 | 4in05 | 34375
Minimum Qty: _10 Minimum Qty: _1
5 Slotted Manhole Lid
Order/Stock #: Order/Stock #: :
A.|21 % inch diameter by 1 1/4 inch thick. 1 | r ty/ o No Bid 0.00 r ér/ e 115.17 11517
Minimum Qty: Minimum Qty: _1
der/Stock #: _00184831 d k #: 84831
B.|25 inch diameter by 1 inch thick. 1 | En P 17538 | 17538 [OrocSock SOIMEBL_ | 40430 | 140.30
Minimum Qty: JMinimum Qty: _1__




No. " Description [Qty.[ Unit] Stock#/Min Qty | Unit Price] Total Price] Stock#/Min Qty | Unit Price| Total Price
6 Catch Basin Curb Inlet Grate Cast or Fabricated Galvanized Steel Grates
A. Diagram A
d k #: 007735 Order/Stock #: g
A-1]21 % inch by 15 3/8 inch by 1 % inch. § |- [Pt AL 28375 | 28375 [T No Bid 0.00
Minimum Qty: Minimum Qty:
Order/Stock #: . Order/Stock #: g
A-2|21 5/8 inch by 15 3/8inch by 1 % inch. 1. | B No Bid R e No Bid 0.00
Minimum Qty: Minimum Qty:
Order/Stock #: - Order/Stock #: i
A-3|21 % inch by 15 % inch by 1 3/8 inch. 1| EA M’inf:un:’;t:_ No Bid 0.00 IM'mf:u:;tv_ No Bid 0.00
der/Stock #: Order/Stock #: -
A-4[2313/16inch by 17 13/16 inch by 1% inch. | 1 | EA [7%7° No Bid 0.00 an‘f":u:‘qw No Bid 0.00
inimu y: ini .
Order/Stock #: Order/Stock #: 00773530
A-5(21 13/16 inch by 15 5/8 inch by 1 % inch. i L e No Bid 0.00 ek ST — 1 G 227.00
Minimum Qty: Minimum Qty: _1
B. Diagram B
Order/Stock #: Je Order/Stock #: x
B-1|16 % inch by 21 5/8 inch by 1 3/8 inch. 1 | EA M'mf:ur:;w_ No Bid 0.00 IM'inf:unf;w_ —— | NoBid 0.00
der/Stock #: Order/Stock #: .
B-2|21 % inch by 15 % inch by 1 3/8 inch. 1 | EA (Jinf:u::;w_ No Bid 0.00 M:n?:u:;w_ No Bid 0.00
Order/Stock #: . Order/Stock #: .
B-3]22 % inch by 16 % inch by 1 7/8 inch. i | Ba P No Bid 0.00 [T No Bid 0.00
Minimum Qty: Minimum Qty:
d k #: Order/Stock #: i
B-4|21 3/8 inch by 15 3/8 inch by 1 3/8 inch. 1 | EA :; '_3:5:;1” No Bid 0.00 N;:: :cmv No Bid 0.00
mni u "'f ni ul 3
o4 Diagram C
k#: 00775041 Order/Stock #: 0077540
237/8 inch by 19 7/8 inch by 1 % inch. 1| BA [oeemens S| 21160 | 21160 el W 1 QU
D. Diagram D
Order/Stock #: _00820230 Order/Stock #: _00820230
15 % inch by 15 % inch by 1 3/8 inch. 1| eal” e e 23124 | 23124 | i ‘°‘Qw sl 18499 | 184.99
inimum y: nimum .
E. Diagram E
Order/Stock #: Order/Stock #: <
E-1[16 % inch by 21 5/8 inch by 1 3/8 inch. 1| Eal” i t“m No Bid 000 | 4 = No Bid 0.00
inimum Y nimu 'S
Order/Stock #: : Order/Stock #: .
E-2|15 % inch by 21 % inch by 1 3/8 inch. 1 | EA JM'_ o “”Qt No Bid 0.00 Mf e ‘°;t No Bid 0.00
inimum A" mnimum Y
der/Stock #: ! Order/Stock #: :
E-3|16 % inch by 22 % inch by 1 7/8 inch. § - | B R No Bid 000 | i No Bid 0.00
IMinimum Qty: Minimum Qty:
Order/Stock #: _ Order/Stock #: .
E-4|15 3/8 inch by 21 3/8inch by 1 3/8 inch. 1| EA Mf o wcm“ : No Bid 0.00 FM' . °;t No Bid 0.00
inimum v: mnmum Y
der/Stock #: 00770036 Order/Stock #:
E-5|17 % inch by 23 % inch by 1 % inch. 1 | EA ":n‘?: ::‘Qw e 210.77 210.77 M’,nf":u:;w 168.61 168.61
ni u : e in . ——




No. Description | Qty.| Unit |

Stock# / Min Qty ]| Unit Price | Total Price |

Stock# / Min Qty | Unit Price | Total Price

Rectangular Access Cover

31 3/8 inch by 17 5/8 inch by 1 3/8 inch. 1 EA

Order/Stock #: _00771920_ 312 11 312 11 |Order/5t0ck #: 249.69 249.69

Minimum Qty:

Minimum Qty:

Sewer Cleanouts - Lids and Rings

1inch by 12 inch diameter by 4 inch ring. 1 EA

173.58

Order/Stock #: _00366123A01 Order/Stock #:
173.58 J

Minimum Qty:

128.61 128.61

Minimum Qty:

Sewer Cleanouts - No Riﬂgs

1inch by 12 inch diameter. 1 EA

Order/Stock #: 00366123
Minimum Qty:

49.49 49.49

Order/Stock #:
Minimum Qty:

37.11 37.11

10

Sewer Cleanouts - No Riﬂis

The City of Yakima has several sizes and types of lids,
grates and covers, it may be necessary to order a number
of items not shown explicitly in the photographs above.

Indicate the discount from that will be honored for
orders.

%

30 %

Subtotal:

5,230.26

4,366.13

8.3% WSST:

43411

362.39

Grand Total Base Bid:

5,664.37

4,728.52

Payment Discount / Terms.

0% / Net 30 Days

0.00

Delivery Time:

70-84 Days
(lead time from Vendor 10-12 Wks)

90 Days

*Pricing item 2-A was written in at $757.05 but was on
auto generated from as $757.70. Bidder confirmed correct

price as $757.70.
**Submitted East Jorden Terms and Conditions.

Comments:

***Exceptions taken to the Technincal Specifications.

Item 5. - ADA 3/8" or less.

Items 6. A-E - ADA 3/8" or less.
Item 6. C - Size 20"x24"

Item 6. D - Size 15-1/4x1-1/2"
Item 6. E-5 - Size 18"x24"x1-1/2"




